AGENDA
LEXINGTON COUNTY COUNCIL
Committee Meetings
Tuesday, February 8, 2011
Second Floor - County Administration Building
212 South Lake Drive, Lexington, SC 29072
Telephone - 803-785-8103 -- FAX 803-785-8101

*Times are tentatively scheduled committee meetings that may run behind or ahead of
schedule; therefore, the times could change by as much as 30 minutes. Also, if time permits,
Council may elect to enter into Executive Session to discuss contractual, legal, personnel
matters, etc.

2:15 p.m. - 2:25 p.m. - Planning & Administration
(1) FY2011-12 CDBG Program and FY2011-12 HOME Program - Community Development

= RON SCOM, DIFBCION ...ttt bbbttt bbbttt ne e e
(2) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 ........cccooeiiriiiriinieiee s
(3) Old Business/New Business
(4) Adjournment

2:25 p.m. - 2:30 p.m. - Justice

(1) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 ...........ccooiiiiiiiieiiee s
(2) Old Business/New Business

(3) Adjournment

2:30 p.m. - 2:50 p.m. - Health & Human Services

(1) VHF Simulcast/Narrowbanding - Public Safety - Bruce Rucker, Director.............cccccvevveivveieiinennnn,
(2) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 .........ccccoeiieie i
(3) Old Business/New Business

(4) Adjournment

2:50 p.m. - 2:55 p.m. - Public Works
(1) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 .........cooeiiririiinieiee s
(2) Old Business/New Business - Traffic Congestion, Alternate Material for Road Swells,
New Road - Corley Mill/Riverchase, Assessment of Ponds Inventory, Flooding Issues,
Stormwater Land Development Manual Chapter 7
(3) Adjournment



2:55 p.m. - 3:00 p.m. - Airport

(1) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 ...........ccooiiiiiiiieiiee s G
(2) Old Business/New Business - Number of landings & take offs at the Lex. County Airport
at Pelion

(3) Adjournment

3:00 p.m. - 3:30 p.m. - Economic Development

(1) Resolution R11-02 - Inducement Resolution Providing for a Fee-in-Lieu of Tax Agreement
Between Lexington County and Project Blue - Economic Development - Chuck Whipple,
D] £ (o] SO S PSRRI H

(2) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 .........cccccveiiieiiiiie e

(3) Old Business/New Business

(4) Adjournment

3:30 p.m. - 4:15 p.m. - Committee of the Whole

(1) BUION CeNIEI REGUEST ... eevieieeiieiteeieete st e e ee s e steesae e e ste e e s re e teeseesseesseesseaseesseesseaneesseeseeneesseesens
(2) Approval of Minutes - Meeting of October 26, 2010 ........cccooeiiririniinieiee s K
(3) Possible Executive Session if Time Permits

(4) Old Business/New Business — EOC/ECC Project Update
(5) Adjournment

4 GOALS M

1. Provide for public services to citizens of Lexington County.
2. Manage growth to meet needs of Lexington County.
3. Provide innovative Financial Management.
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Planning & Administration
J. Jeffcoat, Chairman

S. Davis, V Chairman

B. Matthews

B. Banning, Sr.

J. Kinard

Health & Human Services
J. Jeffcoat, Chairman

D. Summers, V Chairman
F. Townsend, Il

B. Keisler

J. Kinard

Airport

T. Cullum, Chairman

D. Summers, V Chairman
S. Davis

B. Keisler

J. Kinard

Committee of the Whole

J. Kinard, Chairman

B. Banning, Sr., V Chairman
F. Townsend, 11l

S. Davis

D. Summers

B. Keisler

J. Jeffcoat

B. Matthews

T. Cullum

Justice

S. Davis, Chairman

B. Keisler, VV Chairman
F. Townsend, Il

B. Banning

J. Kinard

Public Works

T. Cullum, Chairman
B. Keisler, V. Chairman
B. Matthews

B. Banning, Sr.

J. Kinard

Economic Development

B. Banning, Sr., Chairman
D. Summers, V Chairman
J. Jeffcoat

T. Cullum

J. Kinard



AGENDA
LEXINGTON COUNTY COUNCIL
Tuesday, February 8, 2011
Second Floor - Dorothy K. Black Council Chambers - County Administration Building
212 South Lake Drive, Lexington, South Carolina 29072
Telephone - 803-785-8103 FAX - 803-785-8101

4:30 P.M. - COUNCIL CHAMBERS

Call to Order/Invocation
Pledge of Allegiance

Lexington County Economic Development Ambassador of 2010 - Raul Fernandez-Carreras

Chairman’s Report

Administrator’s Report

Employee Recognition - Katherine Hubbard, County Administrator
(1) Shining Stars

Resolution
(1) ANENONY H. KEISIEI.....eiiiiiiec ettt e te e e s ae et e e reesteeseesreesteeneesreas

WA o] 0 ToT 1 (0 1=T o SRR OSOSRSSN

Bids/Purchases/RFPs

(1) Energy Efficiency and Conservation Block Grant (EECBG) Light Replacements - Building
SBIVICES ...ttt ettt sttt b et s e bt bt h e h e £ e R e Rt e bt R e e R e e Rt AR e R e e Rt e R b e e R e e Re e R e e R e e benne e beeneenres

(2) Bitternut Court Roadway Improvements (Grant Funds ) - Community Development/Public

(3) Polo, Tee, Golf, and Sweat Shirts - COUNYWITE. .........cceiieieiiiiiee e
(4) Hurst Rescue & Extrication TOOIS - EMS/FIIe SEIVICE .......c.coviiiiiiiieiieieeee e
(5) Jim Spence Road Engineering Fees (C-Funds) - Public WOrKS..........ccccovevviiiieeie e



Approval of Minutes - Minutes of December 7 and 14, 2010 and January 18, 2011

Committee Reports

Economic Development, B. Banning, Sr., Chairman

(1) Resolution R11-02 - Inducement Resolution Providing for a Fee-in-Lieu of Tax Agreement
Between Lexington County and Project Blue - Tab H

Committee of the Whole, J. Kinard, Chairman
(1) Burton Center Request - Tab J

Budget Amendment Resolutions

OLD BUSINESS/NEW BUSINESS

EXECUTIVE SESSION/LEGAL BRIEFING

MATTERS REQUIRING AVOTE AS A RESULT OF EXECUTIVE SESSION

ADJOURNMENT

-

.

MISSION:
Provide quality services to our citizens at a reasonable cost.

VISION:
Planned growth for our communities with abundant
opportunities for all in a quality environment.

)
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County of Lexington

Community Development Department
212 South Lake Drive—Suite 401
Lexington, SC 29072

Phone: (803) 785-8121

Fax: (803) 785-8188

MEMORANDUM

TO: Planning and Administration Committee
Lexington County Council

THROUGH: Katherine Hubbard, County Administrator

FROM: Ronald T. Scott, Community Development Director
DATE: January 28, 2011
RE: FY 2011-12 Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) Program

FY 2011-12 HOME Investment Partnership Program

The United States Department of Housing and Urban Development (HUD) has not yet notified the
County of its FY 2011-12 allocation for the CDBG and HOME Programs. The federal government
is operating on a continuing resolution until March 4, 2011, and we hope to know an exact
allocation amount by April 2011. In FY 2010-11 we received $1,630,118 for the CDBG Program
and $634,481 for the HOME Program and our project recommendations are based on the same
level of funding.

For FY 2011-12, the CDBG Program received 25 requests for funding totaling $3,361,856. All
requests were thoroughly reviewed and evaluated by the Grant Programs Division staff and the
Grant Programs Advisory Committee. After preliminary rankings, staff also evaluated the general
project feasibility and the capacity of the applicants to administer programs according to federal
guidelines. Attached is a summary of project funding recommendations for the FY 2011-12 CDBG
and HOME Programs. All HOME projects will be administered internally, with the exception of the
required set-aside for Community Housing Development Organizations (CHDOs).

It is County Council’s authority to approve any proposed projects or combination of projects that
total the amount of available funds. Funding for approved projects will not be available until after
July 1, 2011, and will be provided on a reimbursable basis after staff review of supporting
documentation.

We request County Council’'s consideration and approval of the proposed CDBG and HOME
projects so that we may proceed with developing our annual Action Plan, which is due to HUD by
May 15, 2011. The projects you approve will be listed in our Action Plan and will also be
considered approved for the purposes of the County’s FY 2011-12 budget

Requested Action: Committee recommendation to County Council for approval.



FY 2011-12 CDBG PROJECT PROPOSALS

PROJECTS RECOMMENDED FUNDING
(1) Town of Batesburg-Leesville $307,540
Mitchell Street Sidewalk

(2) City of West Columbia $207,400
Spring Street Water Line Improvement

(3) Lexington County $460,000
Minor Home Repair Program

(4) Lexington County $103,000
Septic Tank Repair and Replacement Program

(5) Town of Lexington $87,591
Keeping Every Youth Safe (KEYS) Afterschool Program

(6) Boys & Girls Clubs of the Midlands $66,000
BE GREAT Academy Scholarship Program

(7) Central South Carolina Habitat for Humanity $70,000
Affordable Housing

(8) Lexington Interfaith Community Services $27,214

Food Pantry Cooler and Freezer Purchase

(9) Samaritan’s Well $25,000
Van Purchase
Total $1,353,745




FY 2011-12 HOME PROJECT PROPOSALS

PROJECTS RECOMMENDED FUNDING
(1) Community Housing Development Organizations (CHDO) $95,172
(2) Homeownership Assistance Program $225,000
(3) Housing Rehabilitation Program $250,861

TOTAL: $571,033



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM PROJECT 1

Mitchell Street Sidewalk

Requesting Agency: Town of Batesburg-Leesville
CDBG Request: $307,540
CDBG Recommendation: $307,540

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0
Project Description:

The Town of Batesburg-Leesville is requesting CBDG funds to construct 3,960 linear
feet of sidewalk on Mitchell Street from Columbia Avenue to Summerland Avenue. The
sidewalk would be located in an area heavily used by students who attend Batesburg-
Leesville High School. The sidewalk will allow residents to have a safe place to walk.

Council District. 2
Council Representative: Frank J. Townsend, llI



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM PROJECT 2

Spring Street
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Requesting Agency: City of West Columbia

CDBG Request: $207,400
CDBG Recommendation: $207,400

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0
Project Description:

The City of West Columbia is requesting CDBG funding to replace and upgrade 2,000
linear feet of deteriorating 2 and 4 inch water lines with 6 inch water lines on Spring
Street and install 3 fire hydrants. The current galvanized lines cause rust to get into the
service lines posing potential health hazards to residents. The hydrants will not only be
used for Spring Street but will also assist with fire protection for surrounding side
streets.

Council District: 8
Council Representative: Bill Banning



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM

PROJECT 3

Minor Home Repair Program

Requesting Agency: Lexington County

CDBG Request: $460,000

CDBG Recommendation: $460,000
Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0

Project Description:

This project will provide funds to continue Lexington County’s Minor Home Repair
Program. Funds will be used to assist low and moderate income homeowners with
minor repairs to their homes. Approximately 55 homes will be assisted during FY 2011-
12. Qualified applicants can receive up to $7,500 in repairs for various improvements
needed for their homes including accessibility, HVAC system replacement, tree

removal, broken windows, etc.

Council District: All




COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM PROJECT 4

Septic Tank Repair and
Replacement Program

ey,

Requesting Agency: Lexington County Public Works Department
Stormwater Management Division

CDBG Request: $103,000
CDBG Recommendation: $103,000

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0
Project Description:

The Lexington County Stormwater Division is requesting CDBG funds to provide
funding to repair or replace the failing septic system of low and moderate income (LMI)
households to reduce the fecal pollutants entering the Hollow Creek Watershed area.
Failed septic systems cause fecal coliform bacteria to be released into the watershed
which in turn pollutes locate waterways making them unsafe for residents. The project
proposes to benefit 50 LMI households.

Council District: 2
Council Representative: Frank J. Townsend, Il



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM

PROJECT 5

Keeping Every Youth Safe
(KEYS) Afterschool Program

Requesting Agency: Town of Lexington
CDBG Request: $87,591
CDBG Recommendation: $87,591

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0
Project Description:

The Town of Lexington is requesting CDBG funds for operational support of the
Keeping Every Youth Safe (KEYS) afterschool program. The KEYS Program provides
afterschool educational, life skills and safety programming for youth in high risk areas
in the Town. The program also provides positive role models and helps youth develop
academic and job skills. The KEYS Program was developed in collaboration with the
Town of Lexington Police Department, Lexington Town Council, the Lexington
Improvement League, the SC Department of Health and Environmental Control,
Lexington School District One, local residents, and a core group of retired educators to
provide a safe haven for latch key children in the community. With CDBG funding the

KEYS Program will be able to serve 50 at-risk youth ages 5-13.

Council District: 3
Council Representative: Smokey Davis




COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM PROJECT 6

BE GREAT Academy
Scholarship Program

ACADEMY

powered by: BOYS & GIALS CLUBS
£ THE WA 0

Requesting Agency: Boys & Girls Clubs of Midlands
CDBG Request: $66,000
CDBG Recommendation: $66,000

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $1,934,000
Project Description:

The Boys & Girls Clubs of the Midlands is requesting CDBG funds for 30 low and
moderate income (LMI) youth to attend their BE Great Academy after school program.
The BE Great Academy offers a variety of youth development programs in core areas
that include education and career development, character and leadership
development, sports, fithess and recreation, health and life skills, and the arts. The
funds would be used for scholarships to cover tuition for 30 LMI youth to attend the BE
Great Academy for the 2011-2012 school year. The program serves Lake Murray
Elementary, New Providence Elementary, Oak Grove Elementary, Saxe Gotha
Elementary, White Knoll Elementary, Harbison West Elementary, Lake Murray
Elementary (Lexington 5), Leaphart Elementary, and Seven Oaks Elementary.

Council District: All



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM PROJECT 7

Affordable Housing

Requesting Agency: Central South Carolina Habitat for Humanity
CDBG Request: $70,000
CDBG Recommendation: $70,000

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $240,000
Project Description:

The Central South Carolina (CSC) Habitat for Humanity is requesting CDBG funding to
purchase four (4) lots on Old Bush River Road to build four (4) affordable housing units
that will benefit 12 low and moderate income persons. The units would be sold to
households in the 30 to 50% median income range. These families will pay an
interest-free mortgage that will be held by CSC Habitat for approximately $200 per
month. The funds to build the units will come from the Habitat Re-Store, recycled
mortgage payments, and sponsors.

Council District. 6
Council Representative: Johnny Jeffcoat



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM

PROJECT 8

Food Pantry Cooler and
Freezer Purchase

Requesting Agency: Lexington Interfaith Community Services

CDBG Request: $27,214
CDBG Recommendation: $27,214

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0
Project Description:

The Lexington Interfaith Community Services (LICS) is requesting CDBG funding to
acquire and install a walk-in cooler for food pantry storage, a stand-alone freezer and
refrigerator for food pantry distribution. The equipment will facilitate receiving, storing,
and distributing fresh and frozen food products in the Emergency Food Programs.

Council District: All




COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT PROGRAM

PROJECT 9

Van Purchase

Requesting Agency: Samaritan’s Well
CDBG Request: $25,000
CDBG Recommendation: $25,000

Additional Funds Pledged Toward Project: $0
Project Description:

Samaritan’s Well is requesting CDBG funds to purchase a van to transport homeless
women and children. Samaritan’s Well is the only shelter in the Lexington community
that provides housing for women and children. The van will be used to transport
women and children to jobs, job interviews, DSS appointments, doctor appointments,
daycare, school, community activities, grocery shopping, and other needs associated

with day to day living requirements.

Council District: 5
Council Representative: Bobby Keisler




HOME INVESTEMENT PARTNERSHIPS PROGRAM PROJECT 1

Community Housing Development
Organizations (CHDO)

Requesting Agency: Lexington County Community Development Department
HOME Recommendation: $95,172

Project Description:

At least 15% of the County’s HOME funds must be set aside for organizations which
are designated by the County of Lexington as Community Housing Development
Organizations (CHDO). Funding allocated for CHDOs may be used for eligible
development activities that promote affordable housing projects that are owned,
developed, or sponsored by CHDOs. To date, staff has designated two organizations
as CHDOs. These two organizations will have an opportunity to submit proposals for
affordable housing projects, to be assisted with these set-aside funds.

Council District: All



HOME INVESTEMENT PARTNERSHIPS PROGRAM PROJECT 2

Homeownership Assistance
Program

Requesting Agency: Lexington County Community Development Department
HOME Recommendation: $225,000

Project Description:

The Homeownership Assistance Program will provide down payment assistance and/or
closing cost assistance to low and moderate income first-time homebuyers. Qualifying
homebuyers must be employed or must provide income documentation in the form of
disability benefits, Social Security benefits, and/or other retirement benefits. Additionally,
all qualifying homebuyers must participate in pre-purchase counseling, as approved by
the Lexington County HOME Program. The amount of assistance provided will typically
not exceed $5,000 per single family dwelling unit. Program guidelines are structured to
allow limited assistance above the $5,000 limit in certain circumstances. Recapture
provisions will be enacted through deferred forgivable loans. Funds will be used to assist
approximately 35 first-time homebuyers with down payment assistance and housing
inspections.

Council District: All



HOME INVESTEMENT PARTNERSHIPS PROGRAM PROJECT 3

Housing Rehabilitation
Program

BEFORE AFTER

Requesting Agency: Lexington County Community Development Department
HOME Recommendation: $250,861

Project Description:

This project will assist low and moderate income, disabled, and/or elderly homeowners
with qualifying repairs to their primary residence. Funds will be used to assist
approximately eight homeowners with significant repair needs. Dependent upon the
types and costs of repairs requested, additional eligible homeowners may be assisted
through the program. Program guidelines are structured to allow maximum repair
amounts for each home typically not to exceed $20,000, with limited assistance above
$20,000 in certain circumstances. Funds will also be used for inspection/estimate
services, lead-based paint testing and clearance, and for relocation and storage costs
during rehabilitation.

Council District: All



The Committee Minutes are left out intentionally until approved by the Committee. Upon the
Committee’s approval, the minutes will be available on the Internet.



The Committee Minutes are left out intentionally until approved by the Committee. Upon the
Committee’s approval, the minutes will be available on the Internet.



VHF Simulcast/
Narrowbanding




FCC Narrowbanding Mandate

A Federal Communications Commission Mandate to
make additional channels available in the
150MHz/450-470 MHz spectrum by splitting
frequencies



FCC Narrowbanding Mandate
contimued

» Refarming- Adding more users

» All users of VHF paging will have a
reduced bandwidth 256MHz to 12.5 MHZ

» Deadline: January 1, 2013



current Operations & Coverage

» Single tower site
located at Ballpark
Road tower

» 25 kHz channel
bandwidth

» Some coverage
complaints around
Batesburg, Swansea,
and Pelion




Narrowbanding Eflects on
Lexington County PllllllC Saiely

» Narrow the scope of
wavelengths

» Reduces the coverage, N
and limits the County’s A%
ability to reach First '
Responders

» Most of our current
radios and pagers can
be narrowbanded




Three
Options
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»  Reduce
wavelengths

>  Lose areas of
paging
>  Limited contact

with First
Responders




Option Two: Renovate & Upgrade
Tower on Ball Park Road
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» Upgrade tower on Ball

Park Road .
¢ Strengthen tower

* Meet FCC
standards

¢ Transmitter
locations

» Cost for upgrade

» Reoccurring costs




Option Three: Cohab With Existing
Ccomporium Tower & 800 Towers

—

» Use existing
Comporium tower
& 800 towers

» Infrastructure
already present,
except Comporium -

» Negotiate with
tower owners




Option Three: confinied

Best coverage we have had on a paging system
6-9 months to install system

Costs

Reoccurring cost of tower
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Document not available at this time.
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Dbl

Burton
center

...for disabilities and special needs Greenwood SC 296499732

864-942-4902

January 17, 2011

Ms. Debra B. Summers, Chairman
Lexington County Council

212 S Lake Dr.

Lexington, SC 29072-3437

Dear Ms. Summers:

Burton Center is applying for a FTA grant to the South Carolina
Department of Mass Transit for assistance in purchasing a 15-passenger
bus. This bus will be used to transport individuals with disabilities and
special needs o our day program, workshops, church, shopping, medical
appointments, recreational activities, and etc. This bus will also be made
available to other agencies when it is not in use by Burton Center.

Please have the enclosed resolution signed at your next scheduled
meeting and return to my attention.

Burton Center appreciates the support the Lexington County Council gives
to our agency as we provide services to people with Disabilities and
Special Needs.

If you have any questions, please call 942-8927.

Sincerely,

Py Yt

am Martin
Director of Procurement

SMitew
enclosure

Wﬁn hLO' 24 .20(1

“proudly serving Abbeville, Edgefield, Greenwood, Lexington, McCormick and Saluda counties”



LOCAL GOVERNMENT RESOLUTION
i FTA SECTION 5310
2001-2012

The Lexington County Council herewith
designates

(Name of Local Elected Body)

Burton Center for Disabilities and Special Needs

{Applicant)

as an entity in Lexington County

{Geographical Area)

to provide transportation to the _E!derly or Persons with Disabilities

(Elderty or Persons with Disabilities)

We further state that the applicant is one of the providers in this
geographic area that is or will be providing transportation to particular
sectors of the elderly and/or persons with disabilities.

Approved and Adopted:

This day of , 2010

Attest:

Chief Elected Official Signature

Typed Name of Chief Elected Official

Typed Title of Official
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RESOLUTION

THE COUNCIL FOR THE COUNTY OF LEXINGTON, SOUTH
CAROLINA, MEETING IN GENERAL SESSION THE 8TH DAY OF
FEBRUARY, TWO THOUSAND AND ELEVEN ADOPTED THE
FOLLOWING:

WHEREAS, Anthony H. Keisler is a lifelong resident of Lexington, South Carolina; and

WHEREAS, following the death of Fire Fighter Jeff Chavis on July 12, 2001, Anthony saw the need to
provide funding support for the Jeffrey Vaden Chavis House that Vaden, Linda, and Alicia Chavis
founded in 2002 to honor their sons’ memory and service to Lexington County; and

WHEREAS, the Jeffrey Vaden Chavis House provides a comfortable home away from home for family
members of burn patients receiving treatment at the Joseph M. Still Burn Center at Doctors Hospital in
Augusta, Georgia; and

WHEREAS, since 2004, Anthony has organized eight Lexington Benefit Runs and five Golf
Tournaments and was instrumental in the selling of the Maltese crosses that, after expenses, raised over
$143,985.17 for the Jeffrey Vaden Chavis House; and

WHEREAS, Anthony has demonstrated his commitment to serving the needs of those who have suffered
misfortunes and personal tragedies in their lives.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that we, the members of Lexington County Council, extend
to ANTHONY H. KEISLER our sincere appreciation for his acts of benevolence and support toward the
operation of the Jeffrey Vaden Chavis House.

James E. Kinard, Jr., Chairman William B. Banning, Sr., Vice Chairman
Frank J. Townsend, IlI George H. “Smokey” Davis

Debra B. Summers Bobby C. Keisler

Johnny W. Jeffcoat Kenneth Brad Matthews

M. Todd Cullum

ATTEST:

Diana W. Burnett, Clerk



APPOINTMENTS
BOARDS & COMMISSIONS

February 8, 2011

JIM KINARD
Lexington County Health Services District Board - Heather W. Jackson; term expires 03/10/11;
eligible for reappointment

SMOKEY DAVIS
Lexington County Health Services District Board - Vasa W. Cate, MD; term expires 03/10/11,
eligible for reappointment

DEBBIE SUMMERS
Lexington County Health Services District Board - Frank R. Basnett; term expires 03/10/11;
eligible for reappointment

BOBBY KEISLER
Lexington County Health Services District Board - James Irby Shealy; term expires 03/10/11;
not eligible for reappointment
Lexington County Health Services District Board - William E. Stillwell, Jr.; term expires
03/10/11; not eligible for reappointment

JOHNNY JEFFCOAT
Lexington County Health Services District Board - Dan E. Jones; term expires 03/10/11; eligible
for reappointment
Lexington County Health Services District Board - George Herbert Holland; term expires
03/10/11; eligible for reappointment

BRAD MATTHEWS
Assessment Appeals Board - Vacant; term expired 9/21/10
Children’s Shelter - Vacant; term expired 6/30/10
Lexington County Health Services District Board - S. Lyman Whitehead; term expires 03/10/11;
eligible for reappointment

TODD CULLUM
Board of Zoning Appeals - Vacant; term expires 12/31/13

AT LARGE:

Midlands Authority for Conventions, Sports & Tourism:
Lodging Industry Representative - Vacant; term expired 6/30/10

Filename: APPOINTMENTS\APPOINTMENT MEMO.word




COUNTY OF LEXINGTON
Procurement Services

MEMORANDUM
(0) 785-8166
(F) 785-2240
DATE: January 28, 2011

TO: Katherine L. Hubbard
County Administrator

THROUGH: Jeffrey A. Hyde
Procurement Manager

FROM: Jo Marie Brown
Procurement Officer

SUBJECT: EECBG Light Replacements
B11042-01/13/11H
Building Services

Competitive bids were solicited and advertised for the Energy Efficiency and Conservation Block Grant
(EECBG) Light Replacements for Public Works Building and several fire stations. We received two (2)
responsive bids on January 13, 2011 (see attached Bid Tabulation).

The bids were evaluated by Mark Kerley, Building Services Manager and Jo Marie Brown, Procurement
Officer. It is our recommendation to award the project to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder —
Southeastern Security Professionals, LLC, in the amount of $67,451.00.

County funds are appropriated in the following account:

5700-121203-5AB470 Public Works (Eng) - Lighting Repl $3,294.00
5700-121203-5AB471 Public Works (Tran) - Lighting Repl $2,662.00
5700-121203-5AB472 Amick’s Ferry FS-Lighting Repl $2,310.00
5700-121203-5AB473 Boiling Springs FS- Lighting Repl $2,969.00
5700-121203-5AB474 Crossroads FS- Lighting Repl $2,704.00
5700-121203-5AB475 Edmunds FS- Lighting Repl $3,979.00
5700-121203-5AB476 Fairview FS- Lighting Repl $2,969.00
5700-121203-5AB477 Gaston FS- Lighting Repl $2,101.00
5700-121203-5AB478 Gilbert FS-Lighting Repl $3,664.00
5700-121203-5AB479 Hollow Creek FS-Lighting Repl $3,141.00
5700-121203-5AB480 Lexington FS- Lighting Repl $1,990.00
5700-121203-5AB481 Mack Edisto FS-Lighting Repl $2,246.00
5700-121203-5AB482 Oak Grove FS-Lighting Repl $5,762.00
5700-121203-5AB483 Pelion FS-Lighting Repl $4,042.00
5700-121203-5AB484 Pine Grove FS-Lighting Repl $2,474.00
5700-121203-5AB485 Red Bank FS-Lighting Repl $3,352.00
5700-121203-5AB486 Round Hill FS-Lighting Repl $5,084.00

5700-121203-5AB488 Sandy Run FS-Lighting Repl $4,170.00



5700-121203-5AB489 South Congaree FS-Lighting Repl $5,614.00
5700-121203-5AB490 Swansea FS-Lighting Repl $2,939.00

I concur with the above recommendation and further recommend that this bid be placed on County
Council’s agenda for their next scheduled meeting on February 8, 2011.

Copy: Larry Porth, Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrator
Mark Kerley, Building Services Manager



County of Lexington

B11042

JMB
01/13/2011
Bid Tabulation
BID # : B11042-01/13/11H
EECBG Light Replacements
SSP MFP Electrical
Item Qty U/M Description Unit Total Unit Total

1 1 Job |Amicks Fire Station $ 2,309.25 $ 2,446.00]
2 1 Job  |Boiling Springs Fire Station $ 2,968.25 $ 2,767.00]
3 1 Job [Crossroads Fire Station $ 2,703.25 $ 2,648.00)
4 1 Job |Edmund Fire Station $ 3,978.25 $ 3,686.00,
5 1 Job [Fairview Fire Station $ 2,968.25] $ 2,739.00
6 1 Job |Gaston Fire Station $ 2,100.25 $ 2,125.00,
7 1 Job |Gilbert Fire Station $ 3,663.25 $ 3,412.00,
8 1 Job [Hollow Creek Fire Station $ 3,140.25 $ 2,995.00
9 1 Job |Lexington Fire Station $ 1,989.25( $ 6,527.00
10 1 Job |Mac Edisto Fire Station $ 2,245.25 $ 2,370.00]
11 1 Job |[Oak Grove Fire Station $ 5,761.25 $ 6,026.00,
12 1 Job |Pelion Fire Station $ 4,041.25 $ 4,100.00
13 1 Job [Pine Grove Fire Station $ 2,473.25 $ 2,641.00
14 1 Job |Red Bank Fire Station $ 3,351.25 $ 3,278.00,
15 1 Job [Round Hill Fire Station $ 5,083.25 $ 4,935.00
16 1 Job |Sandy Run Fire Station $ 4,169.25 $ 4,078.00
17 1 Job |South Congaree Fire Station $ 5,613.25 $ 5,916.00,
18 1 Job [Swansea Fire Station $ 2,938.25 $ 3,004.00
19 1 Job |Lexington Public Works - A $ 3,293.25 $ 3,455.00]
19 1 Job |Lexington Public Works - B $ 2,661.25 $ 2,852.00]

Total| $ 67,451.00] $ 72,000.00

*First Class Construction is non-responsive for not acknowledging Amendment One

Bids Received: January 13, 2011 @ 3:00 PM

Jo Marie Brown
Procurement Officer



COUNTY OF LEXINGTON
Procurement Services

MEMORANDUM
(0) 785-8319
(F) 785-2240

DATE: January 27, 2011

TO: Katherine L. Hubbard
County Administrator

THROUGH: Jeffrey A. Hyde
Procurement Manager

FROM: Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

SUBJECT: Bitternut Court Roadway Improvements (Grant Funds)

B10021-01/26/11S

Community Development/Public Works
Competitive bids were solicited and advertised for improvements to Bitternut Court. This project
consists of pavement construction of approximately four thousand and five (4,005) linear feet of
a Lexington County maintained road. A mandatory pre-bid was held on January 12, 2011, in
which thirteen (13) vendors attended. We received eleven (11) responsive bids on January 26,
2011 (see attached Bid Tabulation).

The bids were evaluated by Ron Scott, Director of Community Development; Rhonda Dean,
Community Development Administrator; John Fechtel, Director of Public Works; J. Jim
Starling, Engineer Assoc. Il1; J. Randy Edwards, County Engineer; and Angela M. Seymour,
Procurement Officer. It is our recommendation to award this project to R & T Grading, Inc. as
the lowest bidder for a total amount of $276,183.10.

County funds are appropriated in the following account:

2403-181201-537154 Community Development BG/Recovery
Bitternut Court Road Paving $273,840.62

The current funding (Account #2403-181201-537154) amount is $273,840.62, with an
administrative budget transfer in process for the balance.

I concur with the above recommendation and further recommend that this bid be placed on
County Council’s agenda for their next scheduled meeting on February 8, 2011.

copy: Larry Porth, Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrator
John Fechtel, Director of Public Works/Assistant County Administrator
Ron Scott, Director of Community Development



TABULATION FORM

Bid: #811021-01/26/11S

Description: Bitternut Court Improvements.

Date: Wednesday, January 26, 2011

o | 79| € |28

Contractor BID GRAND TOTAL %% 528 %%E 3—% g g% %g

i = 123|588

CNA Construction, Inc. $368,483.00 X X X X X | X

REA Contracting $353,181.05 X X X X X | X

J.C. Wilkie Construction, Inc. $392,351.84 X X X X X | X

C.R. Jackson, Inc. $386.638.10 X X X X X | X

LAD Corporation $747,385.10 X X X X X | X
Cherokee, Inc. $350,690.69 signed | X X X | X
Plowden Construction Co, Inc. $279,457.50 X X X X X
C. Ray Miles Construction, Inc. $344,063.50 X X X X X

Sloan Construction, Inc. $364,591.05 X X X X X | X

R&T Grading, Inc. $276,183.10 X X X X X | X

Walter Hunter Construction $298,290.25 X X X X X | X




COUNTY OF LEXINGTON
Procurement Services

MEMORANDUM
(0) 785-8319
(F) 785-2240

DATE: January 28, 2011

TO: Katherine L. Hubbard
County Administrator

FROM: Jeffrey A. Hyde
Procurement Manager

SUBJECT: Polo, Tee, Golf, and Sweat Shirts — Term Contract

C10024-06/30/10S

Various Departments
Competitive bids were solicited and advertised for a term contract for Polo, Tee, Golf, and Sweat Shirts
for various departments.

We received (3) responsive bids on June 30, 2010 (see attached Bid Tabulation).

The bids were evaluated by Sylvia Dillon, Sheriff’s Department; Angela Shealy, Public Safety/Fire
Service; Stuart Platt, Public Safety/EMS, Dave Eger, Solid Waste Management; Chuck Whipple,
Economic Development; Rod Pimental, Central Stores; and Jeffrey A. Hyde, Procurement Manager. It is
our recommendation to make multiple awards for this contract — based on pricing, the quality of the shirt
materials, and appearance of the embroidery stitching. The annual cost of this contract is estimated at
$44,744.00, including the applicable sales tax. (See attached bid tabulation).

It is our recommendation to award this term contract for the initial period of one (1) year with the option
to extend the contract for two (2) additional one (1) year periods, if deemed to be in the best interest of
the County.

I concur with the above recommendation and further recommend that this bid be placed on County
Council’s agenda for their next scheduled meeting on February 08, 2011.

copy: Larry Porth, Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrator
Sylvia Dillon, Sheriff’s Department
Angela Shealy, Fire Service
Chief Brian Hood, EMS Director
Dave Eger, Solid Waste Management
Chuck Whipple, Economic Development
Rodney Pimental, Central Stores



BID # : C10024-06/30/10S

Polo/Golf/Tee/Sweat Shirt - Term Contract

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Promotional Buying Group

Carolina Industrial Material

InnerWorkings

ltem [ Qty | U/M Description Unit Total | Total Cost UnitTotal |  Total Cost | Unit Total | Total Cost
1-43| 250 | EA |Polo/Tee/Sweat Shirts Deemed Non-Responsive Deemed Non-Responsive Deemed Non-Responsive
Henya Direct International Promotional Ideas
ltem | Qty | U/M Description Unit Total | Total Cost Unit Total |  Total Cost
1-43| 250 | EA |Polo/Tee/Sweat Shirts Deemed Non-Responsive Deemed Non-Responsive
Eidson's Custom Safeguard Designlab

Item | Qty | UM Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost

1 | 250 | EA |Polo Shirt (Men's) $ 16.85| $ 4,21250| $ 1543 | $ 3,857.50 | $ 13.28 | $ 3,320.00
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 16.65 | $ - $ 1453 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 1885 | $ - $ 19.10 | $ - $ 16.53 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 19.95 | $ - $ 20.00 | $ - $ 1753 | $ -

2 | 250 | EA [Polo Shirt (Women's) $ 16.85| $ 4,21250| $ 1543 | $ 3,857.50 | $ 13.28 | $ 3,320.00
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 16.65 | $ - $ 1453 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 1885 | $ - $ 19.10 | $ - $ 16.53 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 20.33 | $ - $ 1753 | $ -

3 | 250 | EA [Polo Shirt (Unisex) $ 1685 $ 4,212.50 No Bid | $ 13.23 | $ 3,307.50
EA |2X-Large $ 17.85| $ - No Bid | $ 1523 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 18.85 | $ - No Bid | $ 16.23 | $ -
EA |4X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - No Bid | $ 1723 $ -

4 30 | EA [Polo Shirt (Ladies S/S) $ 16.85| $ 505.50 | $ 1199 | $ 359.70 | $ 11.85| $ 355.50
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 13.24 | $ - $ 13.10 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 1885 | $ - $ 1499 | $ - $ 1410 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 15.68 | $ - $ 15.10 | $ -

5 | 250 | EA |Polo Shirt (Men's S/S) $ 1885| % 4,71250 | $ 1355 | $ 3,387.50 | $ 13.37 | $ 3,342.50
EA [2X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 14.80 | $ - $ 1462 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2085 | $ - $ 16.05 | $ - $ 1562 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 21.85| $ - $ 17.30 | $ - $ 16.62 | $ -

6 75 | EA |Polo Shirt (LS) $ 2085| $ 1563.75| $ 16.68 | $ 1,251.00 | $ 1642 | $ 1,231.50
EA [2X-Large $ 21.85| $ - $ 1793 | $ - $ 17.67 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 22.85 | $ - $ 19.18 | $ - $ 18.67 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 23.85| $ - $ 20.43 | $ - $ 19.67 | $ -




Eidson's Custom Safeguard Designlab
ltem| Qty |U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
7 20 | EA [Polo Shirt (Ladies S/S) $ 16.85| $ 337.00 | $ 1356 | $ 271.20 | $ 1185 $ 237.00
EA |2X-Large $ 17.85| $ - $ 14.80 | $ - $ 13.10 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 18.85 | $ - $ 16.05 | $ - $ 14.10 | $ -
8 20 | EA [Polo Shirt (Men's S/S) $ 1685 | $ 337.00 | $ 1356 | $ 271.20 | $ 1185| $ 237.00
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 14.80 | $ - $ 13.10 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 18.85 | $ - $ 16.05 | $ - $ 1410 | $ -
9 | 500 [ EA |Tee Shirt (S/S - No Pocket) | $ 585|$% 2,925.00]| $ 532 | % 2,660.00 | $ 4.08 | $ 2,040.00
EA |2X-Large $ 735 | $ - $ 6.79 | $ - $ 6.08 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 785 | $ - $ 6.79 | $ - $ 6.08| $ -
Tee Shirt (S/S - No Pocket)
10 | 300 | EA [Long/Tall Cut $ 6.95|$% 2,085.00]| $ 596 | $ 1,788.00 | $ 579 $ 1,737.00
EA |2X-Large $ 9.15| $ - $ 596 | $ - $ 829 (% -
EA [3X-Large $ 940 | $ - $ 596 | $ - $ 879 $ -
11 | 100 | EA [Tee Shirt (LS/No Pocket) $ 795 | % 795.00 | $ 831| % 831.00 | $ 6.07 | $ 607.00
EA [2X-Large $ 9.70 | $ - $ 10.15 | $ - $ 8.07|$ -
EA |3X-Large $ 995 | $ - $ 10.28 | $ - $ 807 % -
12 | 20 | EA [Dress Shirt (S/S) $ 1950 | $ 390.00 | $ 1541 $ 308.20 | $ 1494 | $ 298.80
EA |2X-Large $ 2050 | $ - $ 16.66 | $ - $ 16.19 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 2150 | $ - $ 19.16 | $ - $ 18.19 | $ -
13 20 | EA [Dress Shirt (S/S Ladies) $ 1950 | $ 390.00 | $ 1541 | $ 308.20 | $ 1494 | $ 298.80
EA [2X-Large $ 20.50 | $ - $ 16.66 | $ - $ 16.19 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2150 $ - $ 19.16 | $ - $ 18.19 | $ -
14 | 20 | EA [Dress Shirt (L/S) $ 1950 | $ 390.00 | $ 1541 $ 308.20 | $ 1494 | $ 298.80
EA |2X-Large $ 2050 | $ - $ 16.66 | $ - $ 16.19 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 2150 | $ - $ 19.16 | $ - $ 18.19 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 2250 | $ - $ 2041 | $ - $ 19.19 | $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 23.50 | $ - $ 2291 | $ - $ 21.19 | $ -
15 20 | EA [Dress Shirt (L/S Ladies) $ 1950 | $ 390.00 | $ 1541 | $ 308.20 | $ 1494 | $ 298.80
EA [2X-Large $ 20.50 | $ - $ 16.66 | $ - $ 16.19 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2150 $ - $ 19.16 | $ - $ 18.19 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 2250 | $ - $ 2041 | $ - $ 19.19 | $ -
EA [5X-Large No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 | 400 | EA [Tee Shirt (SS/No Pocket) $ 540 $ 2,160.00| $ 523 | % 2,092.00 | $ 3.94| $ 1,576.00
EA |2X-Large $ 6.90 | $ - $ 6.70 | $ - $ 544 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 740 | $ - $ 6.70 | $ - $ 594 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 790 | $ - $ 6.70 | $ - $ 694 $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 8.40 | $ - $ 6.73 | $ - $ 7441 $ -




Eidson's Custom Safeguard Designlab
ltem| Qty |U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
17 30 | EA [Tee Shirt (SS/No Pocket) $ 6.50 | $ 195.00 | $ 455 | $ 13650 | $ 3.02| % 90.60
EA |2X-Large $ 8.00 | $ - $ 6.03| % - $ 452 $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 850 | $ - $ 6.03|$ - $ 502 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 9.00 | $ - $ 6.03| % - $ 552 $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 950 | $ - $ 6.03|$ - $ 6.02| $ -
18 60 | EA [Tee Shirt (L/S w/Pocket) $ 825 % 495.00 | $ 6.66 | $ 399.60 | $ 579 | $ 347.40
EA |2X-Large $ 9.75| $ - $ 8.46 | $ - $ 779 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 10.25 | $ - $ 8.46 | $ - $ 779 $ -
EA |4X-Large Did Not Meet Specifications No Bid | $ 879 | % -
EA |5X-Large Did Not Meet Specifications No Bid | $ 879 % -
19 60 | EA [Tee Shirt (S/S w/Pocket) $ 6.50 | $ 390.00 | $ 705 $ 423.00 | $ 503 $ 301.80
EA |2X-Large $ 8.00| $ - $ 833 | % - $ 703 $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 850 | $ - $ 833|9% - $ 7.03| $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 950 | $ - No Bid | $ 8.03| $ -
EA |5X-Large $ 1050 | $ - No Bid | $ 8.03| $ -
20 60 | EA [Sweatshirt $ 1195 | $ 717.00 | $ 10.33 | $ 619.80 | $ 1049 | $ 629.40
EA [2X-Large $ 13.45 | $ - $ 12.88 | $ - $ 1299 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 1395 | $ - $ 1496 | $ - $ 1299 | $ -
EA |4X-Large $ 1495 | $ - No Bid | $ 13.99 | $ -
EA [5X-Large No Bid No Bid | $ 13.99 | $ -
21 60 | EA [Sweatshirt Hooded $ 1695 $ 1,017.00( $ 1549 | $ 92940 | $ 16.84 | $ 1,010.40
EA |2X-Large $ 1845 | $ - $ 2021 | $ - $ 1934 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 1895 | $ - $ 2021 | % - $ 1934 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 19.95 | $ - No Bid | $ 2034 | $ -
EA [5X-Large No Bid No Bid | $ 20.34 | $ -
22 20 | EA |Polo, Men's, S/S $ 1685 | $ 337.00 | $ 1892 | $ 37840 | $ 1228 | $ 245.60
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 20.15 | $ - $ 1353 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 18.85 | $ - $ 2285 | % - $ 1553 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 2410 | $ - $ 16.53 | $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 2085 | $ - $ 26.60 | $ - $ 1853 | $ -
23 38 | EA [Polo, Men's, S/S $ 16.85| $ 640.30 [ $ 1641 | $ 623.58 | $ 1228 | $ 466.64
EA |2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 1764 | $ - $ 1353 | % -
EA [3X-Large $ 1885 $ - $ 2034 | $ - $ 1553 | $ -
24 40 | EA |Polo Shirt (No Pocket) $ 545 | $ 218.00 | $ 386 | % 15440 | $ 4141 $ 165.60
EA [2X-Large $ 720 | $ - $ 534 | %$ - $ 6.14 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 720 $ - $ 534 | $ - $ 6.14 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 720 | $ - $ 534 | % - $ 6.64 | $ -




Eidson's Custom Safeguard Designlab
ltem| Qty |U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
25 40 | EA |Polo Shirt (No Pocket) $ 750 | $ 300.00 | $ 386 | $ 15440 | $ 527 | % 210.80
EA |2X-Large $ 925 | % - $ 534 | $ - $ 727 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 9.25| $ - $ 534 | % - $ 727 $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 925 | % - $ 534 | $ - $ 777 | $ -
26 40 | EA |Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 16.85 | $ 674.00 [ $ 1492 | $ 596.80 | $ 1228 | $ 491.20
EA |2X-Large $ 1785 | $ - $ 16.15| $ - $ 1353 | % -
EA |2X-LT $ 18.85 | $ - $ 20.10 | $ - $ 1353 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 1885 | $ - $ 18.60 | $ - $ 1553 | $ -
EA |3X-LT $ 1985 | $ - $ 2260 | $ - $ 1553 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 1985 | $ - $ 2010 | $ - $ 1653 | $ -
EA |4X-LT $ 2085 | $ - $ 2383 | % - $ 1653 | $ -
27 60 | EA [Tee Shirt (S/S w/Pocket) $ 6.75 | $ 405.00 | $ 384 % 23040 | $ 503 % 301.80
EA [2X-Large $ 850 | $ - $ 505| % - $ 753 $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 875 | % - $ 505| % - $ 803 (% -
EA [4X-Large $ 9.75 | $ - $ 505| % - $ 8.03|$ -
28 35 | EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 1685 | $ 589.75 | $ 1790 | $ 626.50 | $ 1228 | $ 429.80
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 19.15 | $ - $ 1353 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 1885 | $ - $ 2165 $ - $ 1553 | $ -
EA [(4X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 2290 | $ - $ 1653 | $ -
29 5 EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Ladies) $ 2085 | $ 10425 | $ 1790 | $ 8950 | $ 1228 | $ 61.40
EA [2X-Large $ 21.85| $ - $ 19.15 | $ - $ 1353 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2285 | % - $ 2165 $ - $ 1553 | % -
EA [4X-Large $ 23.85| $ - $ 2290 | $ - $ 16.53 | $ -
30 10 | EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 2085 | $ 208.50 | $ 2291 $ 229.10 | $ 1717 | $ 171.70
EA [2X-Large $ 21.85| $ - $ 24.16 | $ - $ 18.42 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2285 | % - $ 2541 | $ - $ 2042 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 23.85| $ - $ 26.66 | $ - $ 2142 | $ -
31 5 EA [Polo Shirt (L/S Ladies) $ 2085 | $ 10425 | $ 1841 | $ 9205( $ 1717 | $ 85.85
EA [2X-Large $ 21.85| $ - $ 19.66 | $ - $ 18.42 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2285 | % - $ 2091 | $ - $ 2042 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 23.85| $ - $ 22.16 | $ - $ 2142 | $ -
32 5 EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 18.85| $ 9425 | $ 1529 | $ 76.45 | $ 1412 | $ 70.60
EA [2X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 16.54 | $ - $ 1537 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 2085 | $ - $ 1779 | $ - $ 1737 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 21.85| $ - $ 19.04 | $ - $ 18.37 | $ -




Eidson's Custom Safeguard Designlab
ltem| Qty |U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
33 5 EA |Dress Shirt (L/S Men's) $ 1950 | $ 97.50 | $ 1715 | $ 85.75| % 16.18 | $ 80.90
EA |2X-Large $ 2050 | $ - $ 18.40 | $ - $ 1743 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 2150 | $ - $ 20.90 | $ - $ 19.43 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 2250 | $ - $ 2215 | % - $ 2043 | $ -
34 5 EA |Dress Shirt (L/S Men's) $ 23.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 2090 | $ 10450 | $ 1984 | $ 99.20
EA |2X-Large $ 25.00 | $ - $ 2215 | % - $ 21.09 | % -
EA [3X-Large $ 27.00 | $ - $ 24.65 | $ - $ 23.09 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 29.00 | $ - $ 2590 | $ - $ 2409 | $ -
35 5 EA |Dress Shirt (L/S Women's) $ 1950 | $ 97.50 | $ 1715 | $ 85.75 | $ 1984 | $ 99.20
EA |2X-Large $ 2050 | $ - $ 18.40 | $ - $ 21.09 | % -
EA [3X-Large $ 2150 | $ - $ 20.90 | $ - $ 23.09 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 2250 | $ - $ 2215 | % - $ 2409 | $ -
36 1 EA |Artwork ** $40.00 ** $40.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00
37 1 EA |Tape N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
38 1 LT |Catalog Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 20.00% 20.00%
39 24 | EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 1685 | $ 40440 | $ 18.17 | $ 436.08 | $ 1260 | $ 302.40
EA [2X-Large $ 17.85 | $ - $ 19.42 | $ - $ 13.85 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 18.85 | $ - $ 20.67 | $ - $ 1485 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 19.85 | $ - $ 2192 | $ - $ 15.85 | $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 2085 | $ - $ 23.17 | $ - $ 16.85| $ -
40 | 100 | EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 3795| $ 3,795.00 No Bid | $ 36.50 | $ 3,650.00
EA [2X-Large $ 39.95| % - No Bid | $ 3850 | $ -
EA |3X-Large $ 4095 | $ - No Bid | $ 3950 | $ -
EA [4X-Large $ 4195| $ - No Bid | $ 4050 | $ -
EA |5X-Large $ 4295 | $ - No Bid | $ 4150 $ -
41 | 100 | EA |Polo Shirt (S/S Men's) $ 3595[$ 3,595.00 NoBid | $ 34.00 [ $ 3,400.00
EA |2X-Large $ 3795 | $ - No Bid | $ 36.00 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 3895 | % - No Bid | $ 37.00 | $ -
EA |4X-Large $ 3995 $ - No Bid | $ 38.00 | $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 4095 | $ - No Bid | $ 39.00 | $ -
42 25 | EA [Polo Shirt (S/S Women's) No Bid No Bid | $ 29.00 | $ 725.00
EA [2X-Large No Bid No Bid | $ 31.00 | $ -
EA [3X-Large No Bid No Bid | $ 32.00 | $ -
EA [4X-Large No Bid No Bid | $ 33.00 | $ -
EA [5X-Large No Bid No Bid | $ 3400 | $ -




Eidson's Custom Safeguard Designlab
ltem| Qty |U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
43 25 | EA |Polo Shirt (S/S Women's) $ 3595 | % 898.75 NoBid | $ 3400 | $ 850.00
EA |2X-Large $ 3795 | $ - No Bid | $ 36.00 | $ -
EA [3X-Large $ 3895 | % - No Bid | $ 37.00 | $ -
EA |4X-Large $ 3995 $ - No Bid | $ 38.00 | $ -
EA [5X-Large $ 4095 | $ - No Bid | $ 39.00 | $ -

*Promotional Buying Group deemed non-responsive because they did not submit and acknowledge amendment one (1).
*Carolina Industrial Material deemed non-responsive because they did not submit and acknowledge amendment one (1).
*InnerWorkings deemed non-responsive because they did not submit and acknowledge amendment one (1).
*International Promotional Ideas deemed non-responsive because they did not submit and acknowledge amendment one (1).
*Henya Direct, LLC deemed non-responsive because they did not submit and acknowledge amendment one (1).
**Eidson's will charge $40.00 for only Animal Services artwork - Iltem # 36.

Bids Received: June 30, 2010 @ 3:00 PM

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer




COUNTY OF LEXINGTON
Procurement Services

MEMORANDUM
(0) 785-8166
(F) 785-2240
DATE: January 28,2011
TO: Katherine L. Hubbard
County Administrator

THROUGH: Jeffrey A. Hyde
Procurement Manager

FROM: Jo Marie Brown
Procurement Officer

SUBJECT: Hurst Rescue & Extrication Tools
B11044-01/20/11B
EMS/Fire Service

Competitive bids were solicited and advertised for the Hurst Rescue & Extrication Tools. We received two
{(2) responsive bids on January 20, 2011 (see attached Bid Tabulation).

The bids were evaluated by Eddie Turner, Assistant Chief of Fire Service; Brian Hood, EMS Director;
and Jo Marie Brown, Procurement Officer. It is our recommendation to award the project to the lowest
responsive, responsible bidder — Newton Fire & Safety in the amount of $52,943.60.

EMS & Fire Service are funding an equal portion (50%) of the cost which totals $26,471.80 each.
County funds are appropriated in the following accounts:

4440-131400-5AB512 (EMS) (1) Extrication Power Tool $35,000.00
1000-131500-5AB515 (FS) (1) Extrication Power Tool $35,000.00

I concur with the above recommendation and further recommend that this bid be placed on County
Council’s agenda for their next scheduled meeting on February 8, 2011,

Copy: Larry Porth, Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrator
Eddie Turner, Asst. Chief of Fire Service
Brian Hood, EMS Director



BID # : B11044-01/20/11B
Hurst Rescue & Extrication

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Newton Fire & Safety Municipal Emergency Svcs
Item | Qty [ UM Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
JL-4GH-SI Honda
Simultanecus
Operation Power unti
with Streamline
1 2 ea 3 4,750.00 | § 9,500.00 | § 507941]1% 10,158.82
T-41 Ram with
2 2 ea |Streamline couplings $ 2,690.00| % 5,380.00 | % 287941 1% 5,758.82
T-59 Ram with
3 2 ea |Streamline couplings $ 2815001 % 563000 | $ 3,00882| % 6,017.64
Twin line hose w/
Streamline couplings
(Color to be specified
4 4 ea |when PO is issued) $ 435001 % 1,740.00 | $ 46588 | § 1,863.52
ML-28 Spreader with
5 2 ea |Streamiine couplings $ 4750001 $ 9,500.00 | $ 5078411 % 10,158.82
Total Base Bid $ 31,750.00 $ 36,334.65
MOC Ultra Cutier with -
1 2 ea |Streamline couplings $ 342500 $ 6,85000 (9% 365588 § 7,311.76
MOC |l Cutter with
2 2 ea |Streamline couplings 3 3,355.00| $ 6,710.00 | % 3601171 & 7,182.34
Conversion pigtails '
from Standard to
3 4 ea |Streamline coupiings $ 28000 % 1,120.00|$ 21000 § 840.00
4 2 ea |Quickstrut Kits $ 1,5625.00 | $ 3,050.00 [ § 1,560.58 | $ 3,121.16
Total Bid with Options $ 49,480.00 $ 54,780.91
7% Tax $ 3,463.60 % 3,835.29
Total Bid $ 52943.60 $ 58,625.20

Bjds Opaned:danyary 20, 2011 @ 3:00 PM
ons i
J

arie‘\Brown
Procurement Officer

B11044-01/20/11B
JMB
1/20/11



COUNTY OF LEXINGTON
Procurement Services

MEMORANDUM
(0) 785-8319
(F) 785-2240

DATE: January 20, 2011

TO: Katherine L. Hubbard
County Administrator

THROUGH: Jeffrey A. Hyde
Procurement Manager

FROM: Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

SUBJECT: Jim Spence Road Engineering Fees (C-Funds)
Public Works

We received a purchase request from Public Works for engineering services from RPM
Engineers for the design of Jim Spence Road located between of Highway 302 and Highway 6 in
Lexington, SC. These services will be procured under Lexington County contract PQ10009-
09/15/10S.

John Fechtel, Director of Public Works/Assistant County Administrator has reviewed and
recommended this purchase. The total cost, including applicable sales tax, is $91,770.00.

Funds are appropriated in the following account:
2700-121300-5R0104 Jim Spence Road $174,170.00

I concur with the above recommendation and further recommend that this bid be placed on
County Council’s agenda for their next scheduled meeting on February 8, 2011.

copy: Larry Porth, Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrator
John Fechtel, Director of Public Works/Assistant County Administrator



Minutes are left out intentionally until approved by Lexington County Council. Upon Council’s approval,
the minutes will be available on the Internet.



	Agenda

	A
	B
	C

	D

	E

	F

	G

	H

	I

	J

	K

	L

	M

	N

	O

	P

	Q

	R

	S




