
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES 

THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  C13020-05/15/13S  

 

PROCUREMENT:     Ammunition – Term Contract 

 

ISSUE DATE:      April 15, 2013 

 

CLOSING DATE:     May 15, 2013 

 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Items #1, #3 & #4 Lawmen’s Safety Supply $22,845.60 

 

Items #2, #5 Dana Safety Supply   $6,339.75 

 

Item #6, #8         Craig’s Firearm Supply     $3,327.75 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  May 24, 2013 

 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 
DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



BID: C13020-05/15/13S

Term Contract - Ammunition

Item Qty U/M Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 30 cs 9 MM Duty No Bid No Bid

2 150 cs 9 MM Training and Qualification 181.50$    5,445.00$        184.20$        27,630.00$      No Bid

3 10 cs .40 Caliber Duty No Bid No Bid

4 40 cs .40 Caliber Training and Qualification 231.70$    9,268.00$        232.62$        9,304.80$        No Bid

5 15 cs 12 Gauge Training 59.65$      894.75$           64.74$          971.10$           No Bid

6 15 cs

12 Gauge Duty and Qualification (250 

Rounds) No Bid 106.05$        1,590.75$        No Bid

7 10 cs .223/5.56 Duty (500 Rounds) No Award No Award No Award

8 30 cs .223 Training and Qualification (1000 Rounds) 71.60$      2,148.00$        57.90$          1,737.00$        67.60$        2,028.00$        

Awarded Subtotal 17,755.75$      41,233.65$      2,028.00$        

Tax 1,242.90$        2,886.36$        141.96$           

Awarded Total 18,998.65$      44,120.01$      2,169.96$        

Item Qty U/M Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 30 cs 9 MM Duty 342.14$    10,264.20$      No Bid

2 150 cs 9 MM Training and Qualification 199.00$    29,850.00$      No Bid

3 10 cs .40 Caliber Duty 354.14$    3,541.40$        No Bid

4 40 cs .40 Caliber Training and Qualification 226.00$    9,040.00$        No Bid

5 15 cs 12 Gauge Training 91.00$      1,365.00$        No Bid

6 15 cs

12 Gauge Duty and Qualification (250 

Rounds) 108.84$    1,632.60$        No Bid

7 10 cs .223/5.56 Duty (500 Rounds) No Award No Award

8 30 cs .223 Training and Qualification (1000 Rounds) 152.21$    4,566.30$        No Bid

Awarded Subtotal 60,259.50$      No Award

Tax 4,218.17$        No Award

Awarded Total 64,477.67$      No Award

Bids Opened: May 15, 2013 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour

Procurement Officer

*Did Not Meet Specifications

**Craig's Firearm Supply quoted an alternate products without any supporting documentation which did not meet specificiations.

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Gulf States Distributors, Inc.

Lawmen's Safety Supply G. T. Distributors, Inc.

Dana Safety Supply Craig's Firearm Supply 

*Did Not Meet Specifications


