COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE
OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: 2017-1FB-15

PROCUREMENT: FOUR (4) HEAVY DUTY TRI-AXLE
DUMP TRUCKS

ISSUE DATE: JUNE 27, 2016

CLOSING DATE: AUGUST 2, 2016

AWARDS ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

Groups P1. & P2
Worldwide Kenworth of South Carolina
$567,714.00

Group P3.
No Award

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of

Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: August 12, 2016

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



U Holliday LLC

Columbia Truck Center

Carolina International Trucks,
Inc.

Worldwide Kenworth of
South Carolina

Group P1 and Group P2 Subtotal $0.00 $578,493.00 $612,379.00 $566,514.00
Tax $0.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
Group P1 and Group P2 Grand Total $0.00 $579,693.00 $613,579.00 $567,714.00
Group P1: Base Bid
P1.1 Tri Axle Dump Truck as listed as specified in this
solicitation.
Unit Price $0.00 $148,857.00 $159,591.00 $153,995.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $595,428.00 $638,364.00 $615,980.00
Quantity 4 4 4 4

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

120 Days after award

130 Days after award

120 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Delivery time will be based on
time of PO and current build
of chassis and body. Currently
at 90-120 days

RS GODWIN Has Promised 120
delivery from Purchase Order
Date to" Carolina International
Trucks, Inc.

Group P2: Options $0.00 -$16,935.00 -$25,985.00 -$49,466.00
P2.1 Cost of Diagnostic Software for Engine and Power Train

Unit Price $0.00 $1,565.00 $4,015.00 $1,934.00

Item Total Price $0.00 $1,565.00 $4,015.00 $1,934.00

Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

120 Days after award

130 Days after award

1 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

No Bid

Cummins engine is a $500 per
year subscription. Meritor
tool box is a $700 per
subscription, Allison DOC with
USB Cable and 6/9 pin
connector for your laptop is
$365.00

International Offers:
OnCommand EZ Tech
Computer. This will include
the Full Navistar Line of
Software and have third party
software pre-installed( but not
registered). Third party
software will include
Cummins Insite, Allison. Doc,
Wabco, Toolbox,
ServiceRanger 4, Bendix ABS,
Edith, Midtronics, and
Webasto

Nexiq adaptor, Cummins
insite fleet edition and KW
ESA Chassis Diag Software




P2.2 Trade in on existing Dump Truck # 21355

Unit Price $0.00 $8,500.00 $15,000.00 $25,500.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $8,500.00 $15,000.00 $25,500.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

120 Days after award

60 Days after award

1 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

No Bid

If the County elects to move
trades prior to delivery of new
vehicles, we'll take the
trade(s) now

Trade is not contingent on the
sales of new equipment.

Trade to be in current
condition as of appraisal date.

Not contingent on selling of

equipment

P2.3 Trade in on existing Dump Truck # 22636

Unit Price 0.00 10,000.00 15,000.00 27,500.00
Item Total Price 0.00 10,000.00 15,000.00 27,500.00
Commodity Code - - - -
Catalog Number - - - -
Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

120 Days after award

60 Days after award

1 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

No Bid

If the County elects to move
the trades prior to delivery of
new vehicles, we'll take the
trade(s) now

Trade is not contingent on the
sales of new equipment.

Trade to be in current
condition as of appraisal date

Not contingent on selling of

equipment




P2.4 Power Train Warranty

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $400.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,600.00
Quantity 1 4 4 4

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

0 Days after award

130 Days after award

1 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

No Bid

VU =NV COTVTTVITIVD TO7Y, TEOT

THAN 475 HP ENGINE EXTENDED
WARRANTY DT1 3 YEARS/300,000
MILES/480,000 KM, INCLUDES
TRAVEL AND TOWING, EPA 2013
ONLY FEX®§1,450.00

WAI-4XX CUMMINS ISX, LESS
THAN 475 HP ENGINE EXTENDED
WARRANTY DT1 3 YEARS/350,000
MILES/560 000 KM, INCLUDES
TRAVEL AND TOWING, EPA 2013
ONLY FEX®1,650.00

WAI-4XY CUMMINS ISX, LESS
THAN 475 HP ENGINE EXENDED
WARRANTY DT1 3 YEARS/400,000
MILES /640 000 KM, INCLUDES
TRAVEL AND TOWING, EPA 2013
ONLY FEX§1,900.00

WAI-4X5 CUMMINS ISX, LESS
THAN 475 HP ENGINE EXTENDED
WARRANTY DT1 5 YEARS/200,000
MILES/320 000 KM, INCLUDES
TRAVEL AND TOWING, EPA 2013
ONLY FEX$1,800.00

WAI-4X6 CUMMINS ISX, LESS
THAN 475 HP ENGINE EXTENDED
WARRANTY DT1 5 YEARS/300,000
MILES/480 000 KM, INCLUDES

Standard and Optional
Warranties, included in
Previous Section.

5 Years / 500,000 miles

Group P3: Purchase of Dump Trucks #21355 & #22636 36,000.00 17,500.00 30,000.00 56,000.00
P3.1 Purchase of existing Dump Truck # 21355

Unit Price $17,000.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $27,000.00

Item Total Price $17,000.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $27,000.00

Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

1 Days after award

60 Days after award

1 Days after award




Comment (Optional)

Freightliner Used Dump
Truck, 2000

Trade is not contingent on
sale of new equipment.

Trade to be in current
condition as of appraisal date.

Can purchase anytime

P3.2 Purchase of existing Dump Truck # 22636

Unit Price $19,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $29,000.00
Item Total Price $19,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $29,000.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

1 Days after award

60 Days after award

1 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Freightliner Used Dump
Truck 2001

Trade is not contingent on
sale of new equipment.

Trade to be in current
condition as of appraisal date.

Can purchase anytime

Questions
Page 1
Group 1
1.1 Truck Chassis Manufacturer and Model N/A Freightliner 122SD International, Model HX Series|Kenworth T880
ISX Cummins 15 w/455 Horse [ISX-15 Cummins 450 HP@
1.2 Engine Description N/A Cummins ISX to meet spec Power & 1650 lb. ft. of torque {1800 1650@1000

1.3 What is your estimated delivery time after receipt of

Delivery time will be within

90 to 120 days pending order
receipt and factory build slots

order? 7 business days. for both Chassis and Body 130 Days 120 days
1.4 Does your company have any proprietary filters (not
available as described in Maintenance Paragraph)? N/A No No no




