
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON 

Procurement Services 
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

 

 

REVISED STATEMENT OF AWARD 

 

 

SOLICITATION NUMBER:  2016-IFB-23 

 

PROJECT TITLE: Weapons Purchase and Disposal of Used and Confiscated 

Firearms 

 

AWARDED TO: Lawmen’s Safety Supply, Inc./Kings Firearms 

 

AMOUNT OF AWARD:  Lawmen’s Safety Supply, Inc. 

     (Lot #2 - #6 - $14,409.28) 

 

     Kings Firearms 

     (Lot #7 – $14,365.00) 

  

DATE OF AWARD:   October 29, 2015 

 

 

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County. 

 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  (Delete) October 29, 2015 (Add) February 3, 2016 

 

 

 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 



KINGS FIREARMS DANA SAFETY SUPPLY

LAWMEN'S SAFETY 

SUPPLY, INC.

Total Bid 14,365.00$                            16,985.00$                            37,468.56$                            

Group P1: LOT 1 - TOTAL TRADE-IN OF USED SERVICE AND 

CONFISCATED FIREARMS (SEE "DESCRIPTION") $0.00 $0.00 14,409.28$                           

P1.1 12 gauge   

Unit Price 541.93$                                 

Item Total Price 8,128.95$                              

Description

Remington 870P 18" Barrel 

with Rifle Sights, Synthetic 

Stock, (2 shot ext.) Model 

24421

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Remington 870P 18" Barrel 

with Rifle Sights, Synthetic 

Stock, (2 shot ext.) Model 

24421

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Remington 870P 18" Barrel 

with Rifle Sights, Synthetic 

Stock, (2 shot ext.) Model 

24421

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity 15 15 15

Estimated Delivery Date 1/28/2016

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

LEAD TIME 60-90 DAYS 

ARO

P1.2 Uncle Mike’s Tactical Sling w/ Sewn in Swivels

Unit Price 17.79$                                    

Item Total Price 266.85$                                 

Description NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity 15 15 15

Estimated Delivery Date 11/4/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

LEAD TIME ABOUT 2-3 

WEEKS ARO

P1.3 TacStar SideSaddle Shotshell Carrier R

Unit Price 21.28$                                    

Item Total Price 319.20$                                 

Description

Rem. 870 &  1187 (4-Shot 

Exp. Serial #) Item 

#1081166

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Rem. 870 &  1187 (4-Shot 

Exp. Serial #) Item 

#1081166

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Rem. 870 &  1187 (4-Shot 

Exp. Serial #) Item 

#1081166

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity 15 15 15

Estimated Delivery Date 11/18/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

LEAD TIME ABOUT 2-3 

WEEKS ARO



P1.4 GLOCK Model 17 Gen 4 with NS and three (3) 

magazines

Unit Price

Item Total Price

Description NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity 5 5 5

Estimated Delivery Date

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID NO BID

P1.5 Nikon D610 Camera Body

Unit Price 1,663.28$                              

Item Total Price 3,326.56$                              

Description

Effective Pixels – 24.3 

Million Image Sensor 

Format - FX 

Effective Pixels – 24.3 

Million Image Sensor 

Format - FX 

Effective Pixels – 24.3 

Million Image Sensor 

Format - FX 

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

P1.6 Nikon AF-S NIKKOR 24-85 f/3.5-4.5G ED VR Lens

Unit Price 663.28$                                 

Item Total Price 1,326.56$                              

Description NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

P1.7 Nikon SB-700 AF Speedlight

Unit Price 363.28$                                 

Item Total Price 726.56$                                 

Description NO SUSTITUTIONS NO SUSTITUTIONS NO SUSTITUTIONS

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

P1.8 Nikon MJC-DC2 Remote Release Cord

Unit Price 27.82$                                    

Item Total Price 55.64$                                    

Description NO SUBSTITUITONS NO SUBSTITUITONS NO SUBSTITUITONS

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID



P1.9 Nikon EN-EL15 Rechargeable Li-ion Battery

Unit Price 64.74$                                    

Item Total Price 258.96$                                 

Description NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Quantity 4 4 4

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

Group P2: LOT 2 - PURCHASE OF NEW 12 GAUGE 

REMINGTON 870P MODEL #24421 ONLY (NO 

SUBSTITUTION) 8,190.00$                              8,128.95$                              

P2.1 12 Gauge Remington 870 P       

Unit Price 546.00$                                 541.93$                                 

Item Total Price 8,190.00$                              8,128.95$                              

Description

18" Barrel with Rifle Sights, 

Synthetic Stock, (2 Shot 

ext.) Model # 24421. No 

18" Barrel with Rifle Sights, 

Synthetic Stock, (2 Shot 

ext.) Model # 24421. No 

18" Barrel with Rifle Sights, 

Synthetic Stock, (2 Shot 

ext.) Model # 24421. No 

Quantity 15 15 15

Estimated Delivery Date 2/26/2016 1/28/2016

Comment (Optional) no bid

LEAD TIME 60-90 DAYS 

ARO

Group P3: LOT 3 - PURCHASE OF NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY 

(NO SUBSTITUTION) 285.00$                                 266.85$                                 

P3.1 Uncle Mikes Tactical Swing with Sewn in Swivels

Unit Price 19.00$                                    17.79$                                    

Item Total Price 285.00$                                 266.85$                                 

Description No Substitutions No Substitutions No Substitutions

Quantity 15 15 15

Estimated Delivery Date 11/18/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid

LEAD TIME ABOUT 2-3 

WEEKS ARO



Group P4: Lot 4 - PURCHASE OF NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY 

(NO SUBSTITUTION) 375.00$                                 319.20$                                 

P4.1 TacStar SideSaddle Shotshell Carrier     

Unit Price 25.00$                                    21.28$                                    

Item Total Price 375.00$                                 319.20$                                 

Description

Rem 870 & 1187 (4-Shot 

Exp. Serial #) Item # 

1081166. No substitution.

Rem 870 & 1187 (4-Shot 

Exp. Serial #) Item # 

1081166. No substitution.

Rem 870 & 1187 (4-Shot 

Exp. Serial #) Item # 

1081166. No substitution.

Quantity 15 15 15

Estimated Delivery Date 11/30/2015 11/18/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid

LEAD TIME ABOUT 2-3 

WEEKS ARO

Group P5: LOT 5 - PURCHASE OF NEW GLOCK 17 GEN 4 

ONLY (NO SUBSTITUTION)

P5.1 GLOCK Model 17 Gen 4 with NS  and three (3) 

magazines

Unit Price

Item Total Price

Description No substitution. No substitution. No substitution.

Quantity 5 5 5

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID NO BID

Group P6: LOT 6 - PURCHASE OF NEW CAMERA 

EQUIPMENT ONLY (NO SUBSTITUTION) 5,694.28

P6.1 Nikon D610 Camera Body

Unit Price 1,663.28

Item Total Price 3,326.56

Description

Effective Pixels - 24.3 

Million

Image Sensor Format - FX

Effective Pixels - 24.3 

Million

Image Sensor Format - FX

Effective Pixels - 24.3 

Million

Image Sensor Format - FX

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

P6.2 Nikon AF-S NIKKOR 24-85 f/3.5-4.5G ED VR Lens

Unit Price 663.28$                                 

Item Total Price 1,326.56$                              

Description

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID



P6.3 Nikon SB-700 AF Speedlight

Unit Price 363.28$                                 

Item Total Price 726.56$                                 

Description

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

P6.4 Nikon MJC-DC2 Remote Release Cord

Unit Price 27.82$                                    

Item Total Price 55.64$                                    

Description

Quantity 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

P6.5 Nikon EN-EL15 Rechargeable Li-ion Battery

Unit Price 64.74$                                    

Item Total Price 258.96$                                 

Description

Quantity 4 4 4

Estimated Delivery Date 11/6/2015

Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID

Group P7: LOT #7 – OFFER TO PURCHASE USED SERVICE 

AND CONFISCATED FIREARMS (FOR IN STATE DEALERS 

ONLY) 14,365.00$                           8,135.00$                              8,650.00$                              

P7.1 Offer to purchase the items listed in the 

inventory list in the "Buyers Attachments"       

Unit Price 14,365.00$                            8,135.00$                              8,650.00$                              

Item Total Price 14,365.00$                            8,135.00$                              8,650.00$                              

Description

Quantity 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery Date 10/29/2015 10/28/2015 10/30/2015

Comment (Optional)

We are offering 14,365.00 

to purchase the entire lot. 

Thank you

PLEASE CALL FOR PICK UP 

803-217-2579 ASK FOR 

ASHLEY POMERVILLE

Questions

Page 1

Group 1

1.1 Are you a licensed dealer to sell handguns in 

the state of South Carolina? Yes Yes Yes

1.2 If applicable, please provide a copy of you Kings FFL COLU-FFL FFL

https://solutions.sciquest.com/apps/Router/SourcingEventBidAwardResponseFileDownload?UploadFileType=2&ResponseId=46284&FileId=221904449&OrgName=LexingtonCounty&tmstmp=1446059707585
https://solutions.sciquest.com/apps/Router/SourcingEventBidAwardResponseFileDownload?UploadFileType=2&ResponseId=48084&FileId=226408863&OrgName=LexingtonCounty&tmstmp=1446059707585
https://solutions.sciquest.com/apps/Router/SourcingEventBidAwardResponseFileDownload?UploadFileType=2&ResponseId=46461&FileId=228948481&OrgName=LexingtonCounty&tmstmp=1446059707585

