
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8166 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  2016-IFB-39 

 

PROCUREMENT: Contract for Solid Waste Collection (Front 

Load Container Service) 

 

ISSUE DATE:      November 20, 2015  

 

CLOSING DATE:     December 17, 2015 

 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Advanced Disposal National Accounts 

P1, P2, P3, P4, P5 and Option P6 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  December 30, 2015 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



 Advanced Disposal 

National Accounts  Pascon, LLC 

 Allied Waste 

Sercices of Columbia 

Ard's Container 

Service, LLC.

Group P1: Sheriff's Department

P1.1 Two (2) Days a Week Service (8 YD)       

Unit Price 125.00$                              249.38$                      145.00$                      125.93$                         

Item Total Price 3,000.00$                           5,985.12$                  3,480.00$                   3,022.32$                      

Description

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

P1.2 8 Yard Front Load Containers three (3) times a 

week

Unit Price 187.00$                              374.06$                      215.00$                      188.00$                         

Item Total Price 4,488.00$                           8,977.44$                  5,160.00$                   4,512.00$                      

Description

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

Price is per 

dumpster.



P1.3 One (1) day every two (2) weeks service 8 CY

Unit Price 40.00$                                -$                            58.00$                        76.44$                            

Item Total Price 960.00$                              -$                            1,392.00$                   1,834.56$                      

Description

Location: South Region, 

200 South Bound Road, 

Gaston, 29053

Location: South 

Region, 200 South 

Bound Road, Gaston, 

29053

Location: South 

Region, 200 South 

Bound Road, Gaston, 

29053

Location: South Region, 

200 South Bound Road, 

Gaston, 29053

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID

P1.4 Two (2) Roll Carts - Weekly

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Lexington 

County Sheriff's 

Department - Chapin, 103 

Columbia Ave, Chapin, SC, 

29036

Location: Lexington 

County Sheriff's 

Department - Chapin, 

103 Columbia Ave, 

Chapin, SC, 29036

Location: Lexington 

County Sheriff's 

Department - Chapin, 

103 Columbia Ave, 

Chapin, SC, 29036

Location: Lexington 

County Sheriff's 

Department - Chapin, 

103 Columbia Ave, 

Chapin, SC, 29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID no bid on cart service

NO BID  Another option 

would be a 2yd 1x wk 

at $64



P1.5 Forty (40) Yard Roll Off Compactor Container

Unit Price 502.00$                              -$                            2,235.00$                   2,200.00$                      

Item Total Price 12,048.00$                        -$                            53,640.00$                52,800.00$                    

Description

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: 521 Gibson 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 1/31/2016

Comment (Optional)

Customer Owned Already 

on site, $150.00 per haul 

rate plus $44.00 per ton 

disposal, averages 8 tons 

for total per pull price. NO BID

above rate includes 

rent and 4 hauls a 

month,  Additional 

hauls over 4 a month 

will be billed at $427 

for haul and disposal.

Another option that 

would be more 

economical would be 

three 8yds 4x a wk at 

$1350.00  a month.

Group P2: Building Services

P2.1 Two (2) Days a Week Service (8 YD)

Unit Price 125.00$                              249.38$                      145.00$                      129.85$                         

Item Total Price 3,000.00$                           5,985.12$                  3,480.00$                   3,116.40$                      

Description

Location: Lexington 

County Building Services, 

415 Ball Park Road

Location: Lexington 

County Building 

Services, 415 Ball 

Park Road

Location: Lexington 

County Building 

Services, 415 Ball 

Park Road

Location: Lexington 

County Building 

Services, 415 Ball Park 

Road

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site



P2.2 Two (2) Days a Week Service (8 YD)

Unit Price 125.00$                              -$                            145.00$                      161.70$                         

Item Total Price 3,000.00$                           -$                            3,480.00$                   3,880.80$                      

Description

Location: Lexington 

County Service Center 

South, 500 Charlie Rast 

Road, Swansea, 29160

Location: Lexington 

County Service 

Center South, 500 

Charlie Rast Road, 

Swansea, 29160

Location: Lexington 

County Service 

Center South, 500 

Charlie Rast Road, 

Swansea, 29160

Location: Lexington 

County Service Center 

South, 500 Charlie Rast 

Road, Swansea, 29160

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID

P2.3 Rental only - 8 YD

Unit Price 18.00$                                100.00$                      30.00$                        30.00$                            

Item Total Price 432.00$                              2,400.00$                  720.00$                      720.00$                         

Description

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta Building, 

650 Knox Abbott Drive, 

West Columbia, 29169

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta 

Building, 650 Knox 

Abbott Drive, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta 

Building, 650 Knox 

Abbott Drive, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta 

Building, 650 Knox 

Abbott Drive, West 

Columbia, 29169

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site Rent only Rental only



P2.4 Option for service one (1) day a week

Unit Price 44.00$                                -$                            72.00$                        83.30$                            

Item Total Price 1,056.00$                           -$                            1,728.00$                   1,999.20$                      

Description

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta Building, 

650 Knox Abbott Drive, 

West Columbia, 29169

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta 

Building, 650 Knox 

Abbott Drive, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta 

Building, 650 Knox 

Abbott Drive, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Lexington 

County Magistrate, 

Martin Marietta 

Building, 650 Knox 

Abbott Drive, West 

Columbia, 29169

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) NA NO BID

P2.5 Two (2) Days a Week Service (8 YD)

Unit Price 125.00$                              249.38$                      145.00$                      129.85$                         

Item Total Price 3,000.00$                           5,985.12$                  3,480.00$                   3,116.40$                      

Description

Location: Lexington 

County North Lake 

Complex, 111 Lin Creek 

Drive, Columbia, 29210

Location: Lexington 

County North Lake 

Complex, 111 Lin 

Creek Drive, 

Columbia, 29210

Location: Lexington 

County North Lake 

Complex, 111 Lin 

Creek Drive, 

Columbia, 29210

Location: Lexington 

County North Lake 

Complex, 111 Lin Creek 

Drive, Columbia, 29210

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site



P2.6 Two (2) Days a Week Service (8 YD)

Unit Price 125.00$                              249.38$                      145.00$                      137.20$                         

Item Total Price 3,000.00$                           5,985.12$                  3,480.00$                   3,292.80$                      

Description

Location: Lexington 

County Auxiliary 

Administration Building, 

605 West Main Street, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lexington 

County Auxiliary 

Administration 

Building, 605 West 

Main Street, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lexington 

County Auxiliary 

Administration 

Building, 605 West 

Main Street, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lexington 

County Auxiliary 

Administration 

Building, 605 West 

Main Street, Lexington, 

29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

P2.7 Three (3) Days a week service (8 YD)

Unit Price 187.00$                              374.06$                      215.00$                      188.00$                         

Item Total Price 4,488.00$                           8,977.44$                  5,160.00$                   4,512.00$                      

Description

Location: Red Bank 

Crossing, 1070 South Lake 

Drive, Lexington, 29072

Location: Red Bank 

Crossing, 1070 South 

Lake Drive, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Red Bank 

Crossing, 1070 South 

Lake Drive, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Red Bank 

Crossing, 1070 South 

Lake Drive, Lexington, 

29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site



Group P3: Library Services

P3.1 One (1) day a week service (8 YD)

Unit Price 62.00$                                145.00$                      72.00$                        78.40$                            

Item Total Price 1,488.00$                           3,480.00$                  1,728.00$                   1,881.60$                      

Description

Location: Library Cayce 

West Columbia, 1500 

Augusta Road, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Library 

Cayce West 

Columbia, 1500 

Augusta Road, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Library 

Cayce West 

Columbia, 1500 

Augusta Road, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: Library Cayce 

West Columbia, 1500 

Augusta Road, West 

Columbia, 29169

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

P3.2 One (1) day a week service (8 YD)

Unit Price 62.00$                                145.00$                      72.00$                        80.85$                            

Item Total Price 1,488.00$                           3,480.00$                  1,728.00$                   1,940.40$                      

Description

Location: Lexington Main 

Library, 5440 Augusta 

Road, Lexington,  29072

Location: Lexington 

Main Library, 5440 

Augusta Road, 

Lexington,  29072

Location: Lexington 

Main Library, 5440 

Augusta Road, 

Lexington,  29072

Location: Lexington 

Main Library, 5440 

Augusta Road, 

Lexington,  29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

P3.3 One (1) day a week service (6 YD)

Unit Price 47.00$                                -$                            68.00$                        68.60$                            

Item Total Price 1,128.00$                           -$                            1,632.00$                   1,646.40$                      

Description

Location: Library (Irmo), 

6251 St. Andrews Road, 

Columbia, 29212

Location: Library 

(Irmo), 6251 St. 

Andrews Road, 

Columbia, 29212

Location: Library 

(Irmo), 6251 St. 

Andrews Road, 

Columbia, 29212

Location: Library 

(Irmo), 6251 St. 

Andrews Road, 

Columbia, 29212

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID



P3.4 One (1) day a week service (4 YD)

Unit Price 40.00$                                -$                            54.00$                        77.91$                            

Item Total Price 960.00$                              -$                            1,296.00$                   1,869.84$                      

Description

Location: 214 Main 

Street, Gaston, 29053

Location: 214 Main 

Street, Gaston, 

29053

Location: 214 Main 

Street, Gaston, 29053

Location: 214 Main 

Street, Gaston, 29053

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID

P3.5 One (1) day a week service (4 YD)

Unit Price 40.00$                                95.00$                        54.00$                        77.91$                            

Item Total Price 960.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,296.00$                   1,869.84$                      

Description

Location: Library 

(Batesburg-Leesville), 203 

Armory Street, Leesville, 

29006

Location: Library 

(Batesburg-Leesville), 

203 Armory Street, 

Leesville, 29006

Location: Library 

(Batesburg-Leesville), 

203 Armory Street, 

Leesville, 29006

Location: Library 

(Batesburg-Leesville), 

203 Armory Street, 

Leesville, 29006

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

P3.6 One (1) day a week service (4 YD)

Unit Price 40.00$                                95.00$                        54.00$                        48.00$                            

Item Total Price 960.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,296.00$                   1,152.00$                      

Description

Location: Library (South 

Congaree/Pine Ridge), 

200 Sunset Drive, West 

Columbia, 29172

Location: Library 

(South 

Congaree/Pine 

Ridge), 200 Sunset 

Drive, West 

Columbia, 29172

Location: Library 

(South 

Congaree/Pine 

Ridge), 200 Sunset 

Drive, West 

Columbia, 29172

Location: Library (South 

Congaree/Pine Ridge), 

200 Sunset Drive, West 

Columbia, 29172

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site



P3.7 One (1) day a week service (2 YD)

Unit Price 38.00$                                -$                            48.00$                        44.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              -$                            1,152.00$                   1,056.00$                      

Description

Locoation: Library 

(Chapin), 129 N. W. 

Columbia Ave, Chapin, 

29036

Locoation: Library 

(Chapin), 129 N. W. 

Columbia Ave, 

Chapin, 29036

Locoation: Library 

(Chapin), 129 N. W. 

Columbia Ave, 

Chapin, 29036

Locoation: Library 

(Chapin), 129 N. W. 

Columbia Ave, Chapin, 

29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID

P3.8 One (1) day a week service (4 YD)

Unit Price 40.00$                                125.00$                      54.00$                        90.65$                            

Item Total Price 960.00$                              3,000.00$                  1,296.00$                   2,175.60$                      

Description

Location: Library (Pelion), 

206 Pine Street, Pelion, 

29123

Location: Library 

(Pelion), 206 Pine 

Street, Pelion, 29123

Location: Library 

(Pelion), 206 Pine 

Street, Pelion, 29123

Location: Library 

(Pelion), 206 Pine 

Street, Pelion, 29123

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site

Group P4: Animal Services

P4.1 Six (6) days a week service (8 YD)

Unit Price 374.00$                              -$                            525.00$                      560.00$                         

Item Total Price 8,976.00$                           -$                            12,600.00$                13,440.00$                    

Description

Location: Animal Services, 

321 Ball Park Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Animal 

Services, 321 Ball 

Park Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Animal 

Services, 321 Ball 

Park Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Animal 

Services, 321 Ball Park 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional) Equipment already on site NO BID



Group P5: Fire Services (4 YD Container)

P5.1 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: Boiling Springs, 

2639 Calks Ferry Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Boiling 

Springs, 2639 Calks 

Ferry Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Boiling 

Springs, 2639 Calks 

Ferry Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Boiling 

Springs, 2639 Calks 

Ferry Road, Lexington, 

29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

Every other week 

service

P5.2 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                -$                            42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              -$                            1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: Chapin, 440 East 

Boundary Street, Chapin, 

29036

Location: Chapin, 440 

East Boundary Street, 

Chapin, 29036

Location: Chapin, 440 

East Boundary Street, 

Chapin, 29036

Location: Chapin, 440 

East Boundary Street, 

Chapin, 29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW NO BID

Every other week 

service

P5.3 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00 67.50 42.00 39.50

Item Total Price 840.00 1,620.00 1,008.00 948.00

Description

Location: Edmund, 5715 

Edmund Highway, 

Lexington, 29073

Location: Edmund, 

5715 Edmund 

Highway, Lexington, 

29073

Location: Edmund, 

5715 Edmund 

Highway, Lexington, 

29073

Location: Edmund, 

5715 Edmund Highway, 

Lexington, 29073

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

Every other week 

service



P5.4 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00 0.00 42.00 39.50

Item Total Price 840.00 0.00 1,008.00 948.00

Description

Location: Gaston, 1701 

Busbee Drive, Gaston, 

29053

Location: Gaston, 

1701 Busbee Drive, 

Gaston, 29053

Location: Gaston, 

1701 Busbee Drive, 

Gaston, 29053

Location: Gaston, 1701 

Busbee Drive, Gaston, 

29053

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW NO BID

every other week 

service

P5.5 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: Lexington, 112 

Park Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Lexington, 

112 Park Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lexington, 

112 Park Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lexington, 

112 Park Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

every other week 

servuce

P5.6 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: Oak Grove, 447 

Oak Drive, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Oak Grove, 

447 Oak Drive, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Oak Grove, 

447 Oak Drive, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Oak Grove, 

447 Oak Drive, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

every other week 

service



P5.7 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location Pine Grove, 665 

Old Barnwell Road, West 

Columbia, 29170

Location Pine Grove, 

665 Old Barnwell 

Road, West 

Columbia, 29170

Location Pine Grove, 

665 Old Barnwell 

Road, West 

Columbia, 29170

Location Pine Grove, 

665 Old Barnwell Road, 

West Columbia, 29170

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

every other week 

service

P5.8 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: Red Bank, 1385 

South Lake Drive, 

Lexington, 29073

Location: Red Bank, 

1385 South Lake 

Drive, Lexington, 

29073

Location: Red Bank, 

1385 South Lake 

Drive, Lexington, 

29073

Location: Red Bank, 

1385 South Lake Drive, 

Lexington, 29073

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

every other week 

service

P5.9 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: Round Hill, 2703 

Two Notch Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Round Hill, 

2703 Two Notch 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Round Hill, 

2703 Two Notch 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Round Hill, 

2703 Two Notch Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

every other week 

service



P5.10 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                67.50$                        42.00$                        39.50$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              1,620.00$                  1,008.00$                   948.00$                         

Description

Location: South Congaree, 

300 Oak Street, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: South 

Congaree, 300 Oak 

Street, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: South 

Congaree, 300 Oak 

Street, West 

Columbia, 29169

Location: South 

Congaree, 300 Oak 

Street, West Columbia, 

29169

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW

every other week 

service

P5.11 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                -$                            42.00$                        68.00$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              -$                            1,008.00$                   1,632.00$                      

Description

Location: Swansea, 350 

West Third Street, 

Swansea, 29160

Location: Swansea, 

350 West Third 

Street, Swansea, 

29160

Location: Swansea, 

350 West Third 

Street, Swansea, 

29160

Location: Swansea, 350 

West Third Street, 

Swansea, 29160

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW NO BID

every other week 

service

P5.12 Four (4) Yard Container for Each Station

Unit Price 35.00$                                -$                            42.00$                        35.00$                            

Item Total Price 840.00$                              -$                            1,008.00$                   840.00$                         

Description

Location: Training Facility, 

436 Ball Park Road, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Training 

Facility, 436 Ball Park 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Training 

Facility, 436 Ball Park 

Road, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Training 

Facility, 436 Ball Park 

Road, Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. service level EOW NO BID

every other week 

service



Group P6: Fire Services (Roll Carts) (OPTIONAL)

P6.1 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Amick's Ferry, 

960 Amicks Ferry Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Location: Amick's 

Ferry, 960 Amicks 

Ferry Road, Chapin, 

29036

Location: Amick's 

Ferry, 960 Amicks 

Ferry Road, Chapin, 

29036

Location: Amick's Ferry, 

960 Amicks Ferry Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no Bid on cart service NO BID

P6.2 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Cedar Grove, 

134 Cedar Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Location: Cedar 

Grove, 134 Cedar 

Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Location: Cedar 

Grove, 134 Cedar 

Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Location: Cedar Grove, 

134 Cedar Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID No bid on cart service NO BID

P6.3 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Corley Mill, 121 

Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Corley Mill, 

121 Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Corley Mill, 

121 Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Corley Mill, 

121 Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID



P6.4 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger 

Road, Chapin, 29036

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger 

Road, Chapin, 29036

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart servcie NO BID

P6.5 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Fairview, 2907 

Fairview Road, Leesville, 

29070

Location: Fairview, 

2907 Fairview Road, 

Leesville, 29070

Location: Fairview, 

2907 Fairview Road, 

Leesville, 29070

Location: Fairview, 

2907 Fairview Road, 

Leesville, 29070

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID

P6.6 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Gilbert-Summit, 

103 Main Street, Gilbert, 

29054

Location: Gilbert-

Summit, 103 Main 

Street, Gilbert, 29054

Location: Gilbert-

Summit, 103 Main 

Street, Gilbert, 29054

Location: Gilbert-

Summit, 103 Main 

Street, Gilbert, 29054

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID



P6.7 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Hollow Creek, 

117 Beulah Church Road, 

Gilbert, 29054

Location: Hollow 

Creek, 117 Beulah 

Church Road, Gilbert, 

29054

Location: Hollow 

Creek, 117 Beulah 

Church Road, Gilbert, 

29054

Location: Hollow Creek, 

117 Beulah Church 

Road, Gilbert, 29054

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID

P6.8 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Lake Murray, 

902 Highway 378, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lake 

Murray, 902 Highway 

378, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Lake 

Murray, 902 Highway 

378, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Lake Murray, 

902 Highway 378, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID

P6.9 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Mack Edisto, 

2142 Highway 178, 

Swansea, 29160

Location: Mack 

Edisto, 2142 Highway 

178, Swansea, 29160

Location: Mack 

Edisto, 2142 Highway 

178, Swansea, 29160

Location: Mack Edisto, 

2142 Highway 178, 

Swansea, 29160

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID



P6.10 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Pelion Fire, 940 

Pine Street, Pelion, 29123

Location: Pelion Fire, 

940 Pine Street, 

Pelion, 29123

Location: Pelion Fire, 

940 Pine Street, 

Pelion, 29123

Location: Pelion Fire, 

940 Pine Street, Pelion, 

29123

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID

P6.11 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Item Total Price 696.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Description

Location: Samaria Fire, 

5321 Fairview Road, 

Batesburg, 29006

Location: Samaria 

Fire, 5321 Fairview 

Road, Batesburg, 

29006

Location: Samaria 

Fire, 5321 Fairview 

Road, Batesburg, 

29006

Location: Samaria Fire, 

5321 Fairview Road, 

Batesburg, 29006

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID no bid on cart service NO BID

P6.12 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

 

Location: Sandy Run, 752 

Calvary Church Road, 

Swansea, 29160

Location: Sandy Run, 

752 Calvary Church 

Road, Swansea, 

29160

Location: Sandy Run, 

752 Calvary Church 

Road, Swansea, 

29160

Location: Sandy Run, 

752 Calvary Church 

Road, Swansea, 29160

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID No bid on cart service NO BID



P6.13 Four (4) Roll Carts for Each Station

Unit Price 29.00$                                -$                            -$                            -$                                

Item Total Price 696.00$                              -$                            -$                            -$                                

Description

Location: Sharpe's Hill, 

3124 Highway #6, 

Lexington, 29073

Location: Sharpe's 

Hill, 3124 Highway 

#6, Lexington, 29073

Location: Sharpe's 

Hill, 3124 Highway 

#6, Lexington, 29073

Location: Sharpe's Hill, 

3124 Highway #6, 

Lexington, 29073

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID No bid on cart service NO BID

Group P7: Fire Services (2 YD Container) (OPTIONAL)

P7.1 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                -$                            48.00$                        64.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              -$                            1,152.00$                   1,536.00$                      

Description

Location: Amick's Ferry, 

960 Amicks Ferry Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Location: Amick's 

Ferry, 960 Amicks 

Ferry Road, Chapin, 

29036

Location: Amick's 

Ferry, 960 Amicks 

Ferry Road, Chapin, 

29036

Location: Amick's Ferry, 

960 Amicks Ferry Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID

P7.2 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        64.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,536.00$                      

Description

Location: Cedar Grove, 

134 Cedar Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Location: Cedar 

Grove, 134 Cedar 

Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Location: Cedar 

Grove, 134 Cedar 

Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Location: Cedar Grove, 

134 Cedar Grove Road, 

Leesville, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.



P7.3 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        55.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,320.00$                      

Description

Location: Corley Mill, 121 

Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Corley Mill, 

121 Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Corley Mill, 

121 Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Corley Mill, 

121 Riverchase Way, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.

P7.4 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                -$                            48.00$                        64.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              -$                            1,152.00$                   1,536.00$                      

Description

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger 

Road, Chapin, 29036

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger 

Road, Chapin, 29036

Location: Crossroads, 

2720 Wessinger Road, 

Chapin, 29036

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site. NO BID

P7.5 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        64.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,536.00$                      

Description

Location: Fairview, 2907 

Fairview Road, Leesville, 

29070

Location: Fairview, 

2907 Fairview Road, 

Leesville, 29070

Location: Fairview, 

2907 Fairview Road, 

Leesville, 29070

Location: Fairview, 

2907 Fairview Road, 

Leesville, 29070

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.



P7.6 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        62.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,488.00$                      

Description

Location: Gilbert-Summit, 

103 Main Street, Gilbert, 

29054

Location: Gilbert-

Summit, 103 Main 

Street, Gilbert, 29054

Location: Gilbert-

Summit, 103 Main 

Street, Gilbert, 29054

Location: Gilbert-

Summit, 103 Main 

Street, Gilbert, 29054

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.

P7.7 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        62.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,488.00$                      

Description

Location: Hollow Creek, 

117 Beulah Church Road, 

Gilbert, 2905

Location: Hollow 

Creek, 117 Beulah 

Church Road, Gilbert, 

2905

Location: Hollow 

Creek, 117 Beulah 

Church Road, Gilbert, 

2905

Location: Hollow Creek, 

117 Beulah Church 

Road, Gilbert, 2905

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.

P7.8 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        55.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,320.00$                      

Description

Location: Lake Murray, 

902 Highway 378, 

Lexington, 29072

Location: Lake 

Murray, 902 Highway 

378, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Lake 

Murray, 902 Highway 

378, Lexington, 

29072

Location: Lake Murray, 

902 Highway 378, 

Lexington, 29072

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.



P7.9 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        68.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,632.00$                      

Description

Location: Mack Edisto, 

2142 Highway 178, 

Swansea, 2916

Location: Mack 

Edisto, 2142 Highway 

178, Swansea, 2916

Location: Mack 

Edisto, 2142 Highway 

178, Swansea, 2916

Location: Mack Edisto, 

2142 Highway 178, 

Swansea, 2916

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.

P7.10 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        68.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,632.00$                      

Description

Location: Pelion Fire, 940 

Pine Street, Pelion, 29123

Location: Pelion Fire, 

940 Pine Street, 

Pelion, 29123

Location: Pelion Fire, 

940 Pine Street, 

Pelion, 29123

Location: Pelion Fire, 

940 Pine Street, Pelion, 

29123

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.

P7.11 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        68.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,632.00$                      

Description

Location: Samaria Fire, 

5321 Fairview Road, 

Batesburg, 29006

Location: Samaria 

Fire, 5321 Fairview 

Road, Batesburg, 

29006

Location: Samaria 

Fire, 5321 Fairview 

Road, Batesburg, 

29006

Location: Samaria Fire, 

5321 Fairview Road, 

Batesburg, 29006

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.



P7.12 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        68.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,632.00$                      

Description

Location: Sandy Run, 752 

Calvary Church Road, 

Swansea, 29160

Location: Sandy Run, 

752 Calvary Church 

Road, Swansea, 

29160

Location: Sandy Run, 

752 Calvary Church 

Road, Swansea, 

29160

Location: Sandy Run, 

752 Calvary Church 

Road, Swansea, 29160

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.

P7.13 Two (2) Yard Container (Service Once a Week)

Unit Price 38.00$                                95.00$                        48.00$                        60.00$                            

Item Total Price 912.00$                              2,280.00$                  1,152.00$                   1,440.00$                      

Description

Location: Sharpe's Hill, 

3124 Highway #6, 

Lexington, 29073

Location: Sharpe's 

Hill, 3124 Highway 

#6, Lexington, 29073

Location: Sharpe's 

Hill, 3124 Highway 

#6, Lexington, 29073

Location: Sharpe's Hill, 

3124 Highway #6, 

Lexington, 29073

Quantity 24 24 24 24

Estimated Delivery Date 2/1/2016 2/1/2016

Comment (Optional)

Equipment already on 

site.


