COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE
OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: 2017-1FB-02
PROCUREMENT: FIRE TRUCKS
ISSUE DATE: JUNE 6, 2016
CLOSING DATE: JULY 21, 2016

AWARD IS MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

SUTPHEN CORPORATION
Groups P1, P3, P5, P6, P7, P8, and P9
$1,848,737.02

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of

Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: August 5, 2016

THIS ISNOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



Fire Trucks
2017-IFB-02

Phoenix Fire Apparatus

SPARTAN FIRE & EMERGENCY APPARATUS

Sutphen Corporation

**Rosenbauer South Dakota, LLC

**Rosenbauer South Dakota, LLC was deemed non-responsive due to their inability to provide direct service per Amendment One "No subcontractors can be u

manufacturer staff."

sed for service. They must be certified and part of the dealer or

MID MOUNT TOWER

Group P1: Mid Mount Tower NO BID NO BID $845,056.95 $766,479.17

Group P3: Tower Option 2: NO BID NO BID $3,989.85 $2,364.00

Tax NO BID NO BID $300.00 $300.00

GRAND TOTAL (AWARDED ITEMS) NO BID NO BID $849,346.80 $769,143.17
Group P1: Mid Mount Tower
P1.1 Mid Mount Tower

Unit Price No Bid No Bid $845,056.95 $766,479.17

Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $845,056.95 $766,479.17

Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

0 Days after award

Days after award

270 Days after award

365 Days after award

Sutphen Mid-Mount SP70
Aluminum Platform.

Prepayment discount schedule

Rosenbauer Commander 4000 Mid

Comment (Optional) Not Bidding this Item NO BID available if requested Mount 75' Cobra Platform
Group P2: Tower Option 1: Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section

P2.1 Hose
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $625.00 $630.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $6,250.00 $6,300.00
Quantity 10 10 10 10
Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) No Bid This Item NO BID Key Flre Hose RC50X100Y50S FireQuip Hydroflow H550

P2.2 5” Storz Elbow to 2 % “ Female NST
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $350.00 $160.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $700.00 $320.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID KoChek 201-051 Harrington H30E 50 2.5

P2.3 5” Storz Elbow to 2 % “ Female NST
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $350.00 $1,660.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $350.00 $1,660.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID KoChek 201-051 Harrington H 50 OB 50 60

P2.4 CFE Part #11595 Storz Spanner Set
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $150.00 $71.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $150.00 $71.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID KoChek KS34 Kochek H534

Group P3: Tower Option 2: Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section

P3.1 Pike Poles & More #PP-FHY-6 6lb. Flat head axe with

fiberglass handle
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $50.00 $54.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $50.00 $54.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

0 Days after award

Days after award

270 Days after award

365 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

NO BID

FHU FA-6

Akron FHY-6




P3.2 Pike Poles & More #PP-FHY-6 6lb Pick head axe with
fiberglass handle

Unit Price No Bid No Bid $55.00 $58.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $55.00 $58.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID FHU FAP-6 Akron PHY-6

P3.3 South Park #SPZAH-51 chrome placed axe blade holder
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $50.00 $24.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $100.00 $48.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID FHU CAH South park spzah

P3.4 South Park #SPZSMA-52 chrome plated axe handle bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $50.00 $16.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $100.00 $32.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID FHU CAH South Park spzsma

P3.5 Halpin Supply #HSTPG1R pick head axe guard
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $18.00 $72.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $18.00 $72.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID Akron PHY-6 w / cover

P3.6 PAC Tool Chainsaw/K12 Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $135.00 $129.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $270.00 $258.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem NO BID PAC K5030 PAC K 5030

P3.7 Zico Part #CM-1.5 1-1/2 1-3/4 post mount
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $50.00 $24.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $150.00 $72.00
Quantity 3 3 3 3
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID Zico CM 1.5

P3.8 Zico Part #CM-2.5 2-1/2 post mount
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $60.00 $33.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $120.00 $66.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID Zico CM 2.5

P3.9 PAC Tool Bolt Cutter Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $20.00 $47.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $20.00 $47.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID PAC 1029 PAC K 5029-1

P3.10 PAC Tool Z Hook Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $20.00 $0.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $20.00 $0.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

Days after award

270 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

NO BID

PAC 1029

NEED SIZE




P3.11 PAC Tool Rescue Axe Bracket

Unit Price No Bid No Bid $85.00 $167.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $85.00 $167.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID PAC 1011 PAC K 5011

P3.12 PAC Tool Marriage Set Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $265.00 $23.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $265.00 $23.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID PAC K5003 PAC K5003

P3.13 PAC Tool Sledge Hammer Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $41.95 $75.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $41.95 $75.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID PAC 1010 PAC K 5010

P3.14 PAC Tool Storz Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $49.95 $40.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $99.90 $80.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem NO BID PAC 1040-5 PAC 1016

P3.15 CFE Part #10252 Tri-Lock Bracket
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $60.00 $37.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $420.00 $259.00
Quantity 7 7 7 7
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem NO BID CFE Part #10252 Tri-Lock Bracket  |South Park QL 48 2256

P3.16 PAC Tool Crow Bar Holder
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $30.00 $22.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $30.00 $22.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem NO BID PAC 1003 PAC 1003

P3.17 CFE Part #11595 Storz Spanner Set
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $45.00 $71.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $45.00 $71.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award 365 Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem NO BID CFE Part #11595 Storz Spanner Set |Kochek KS34

P3.18 CFE Part #10317 w/s Spanner Wrench Set
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $50.00 $0.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $100.00 $0.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

Days after award

270 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

NO BID

CFE Part #11595 Storz Spanner Set

No Bid




P3.19 Installation of all items listed in Tower Option 2

Unit Price No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $960.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $960.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Price also includes any custom
fabrication of alumunim brackets.
Also includes any additional straps
or tool brackets needed to secure
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID items.
Group P4: Tower Option 3: Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section
P4.1 Flir Thermal Camera K-55 with Truck Charger Part #72201-
0206
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $6,000.00 $6,400.00
Item Total Price No Bid No Bid $6,000.00 $6,400.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Flir Thermal Camera K-55 with
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item NO BID Truck Charger Part #72201-0206 Flir K55 with Truck Charger
TWO (2) PUMPERS
Group P5: Pumper (Awarded) NO BID $1,023,310.00 $917,179.44 $898,894.00
Group P6: Pumper Option 1 (Awarded) NO BID $22,420.88 $21,830.00 $23,210.00
Group P7: Pumper Option 2 (Awarded) NO BID $46,646.00 $31,153.86 $34,860.00
Group P8: Pumper Option 3 (Awarded): NO BID $12,722.00 $16,626.92 $8,000.00
Group P9: Pumper Option 4 (Awarded): NO BID $11,244.44 $12,000.00 $12,800.00
Tax NO BID $600.00 $600.00 $600.00
Cost Per Vehicle NO BID $558,471.66 $499,695.11 $489,182.00
GRAND TOTAL NO BID $1,116,943.32 $999,390.22 $978,364.00
Group P5: Pumper
P5.1 Pumper
Unit Price No Bid $511,655.00 $458,589.72 $449,447.00
Item Total Price No Bid $1,023,310.00 $917,179.44 $898,894.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery

0 Days after award

285 Days after award

270 Days after award

300 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

THIS PRICE INCLUDES $300.00 SALES TAX.

Two (2) Sutphen Custom Pumpers

Prepayment discount schedule
available if requested

Rosenbauer Commander 4000 Custom
Pumper per spec

Group P6: Pumper Option 1: Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section

P6.1 Hose
Unit Price No Bid $571.16 $625.00 $630.00
Item Total Price No Bid $5,711.60 $6,250.00 $6,300.00
Quantity 10 10 10 10
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item Key Fire Hose, same as Tower Firequip Hydroflow H 550

P6.2 5” Storz Elbow to 2 %2” Female NST
Unit Price No Bid $143.88 $350.00 $160.00
Item Total Price No Bid $287.76 $700.00 $320.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

285 Days after award

270 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

Harrington H 30 E 50 25




P6.3 5” Storz Elbow to 6” Female NST Swivel

Unit Price No Bid $1,406.10 $300.00 $1,660.00
Item Total Price No Bid $1,406.10 $300.00 $1,660.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item KoChek Harrington H 5008

P6.4 CFE Part #11595 Storz Spanner Set
Unit Price No Bid $98.10 $150.00 $71.00
Item Total Price No Bid $98.10 $150.00 $71.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 20 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower Kochek H 534

P6.5 One (1) Pike Poles & More #PP-FHY-6 6lb
Unit Price No Bid $53.56 $50.00 $54.00
Item Total Price No Bid $53.56 $50.00 $54.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower Akron FHY-6

P6.6 One (1) Pike Poles & More #PP-FHY-6 6lb
Unit Price No Bid $48.85 $55.00 $58.00
Item Total Price No Bid $48.85 $55.00 $58.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem same as tower Akron PHY-6

P6.7 South Park #SPZAH-51 chrome plated axe blade holder
Unit Price No Bid $26.50 $50.00 $24.00
Item Total Price No Bid $53.00 $100.00 $48.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem same as tower South Park

P6.8 South Park #SPZSMA-52 chrome plated axe handle bracket
Unit Price No Bid $73.86 $50.00 $16.00
Item Total Price No Bid $147.72 $100.00 $32.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem same as tower South Park

P6.9 Halpin Supply #HSTPG1R pick head axe guard
Unit Price No Bid $40.33 $18.00 $72.00
Item Total Price No Bid $40.33 $18.00 $72.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower Akron PHY- With Cover

P6.10 Ziamatic #ZC-SQCH-44-H horizontal mounting bracket for

folding wheel chock
Unit Price No Bid $222.38 $110.00 $70.00
Item Total Price No Bid $889.52 $440.00 $280.00
Quantity 4 4 4 4
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item Ziamatic #2C-SQCH-44-H Zico 44 - H SQCH

P6.11 Ziamatic #ZC-SAC-44 folding aluminum wheel chock
Unit Price No Bid $69.17 $0.00 $225.00
Item Total Price No Bid $276.68 $0.00 $900.00
Quantity 4 4 4 4

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

285 Days after award

0 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

included in truck bid

Zico SAC44 E




P6.12 PAC Tool mounts chainsaw/K12 Bracket

Unit Price No Bid $137.89 $135.00 $129.00
Item Total Price No Bid $275.78 $270.00 $258.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower PAC K 5030

P6.13 Zico Part #CM-1.5 1-1/2 1-3/4 Post mount
Unit Price No Bid $35.48 $50.00 $24.00
Item Total Price No Bid $106.44 $150.00 $72.00
Quantity 3 3 3 3
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower Zico 1.5

P6.14 Zico Part #CM-2.5 2-1/2 post mount
Unit Price No Bid $32.05 $60.00 $33.00
Item Total Price No Bid $64.10 $120.00 $66.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower Zico 2.5

P6.15 PAC Tool mounts Bolt Cutter Bracket
Unit Price No Bid $24.53 $20.00 $47.00
Item Total Price No Bid $24.53 $20.00 $47.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem same as tower PAC K 5029-1

P6.16 PAC Tool mounts Z Hook Bracket
Unit Price No Bid $24.53 $20.00 $0.00
Item Total Price No Bid $24.53 $20.00 $0.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem same as tower Need Size

P6.17 PAC Tool mounts Rescue Axe Bracket
Unit Price No Bid $83.39 $85.00 $167.00
Item Total Price No Bid $83.39 $85.00 $167.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower PACK 5011

P6.18 PAC Tool mounts Marriage Set Bracket
Unit Price No Bid $188.03 $265.00 $23.00
Item Total Price No Bid $188.03 $265.00 $23.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower PAC K 5003

P6.19 PAC Tool mounts Sledge Hammer Bracket
Unit Price No Bid $34.34 $42.00 $75.00
Item Total Price No Bid $34.34 $42.00 $75.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower PAC K 5010

P6.20 PAC Tool mounts Storz Bracket
Unit Price No Bid $40.88 $50.00 $40.00
Item Total Price No Bid $81.76 $100.00 $80.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

285 Days after award

270 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

same as tower

PAC 1016




P6.21 PAC Tool mounts Crow Bar Holder

Unit Price No Bid $31.07 $30.00 $22.00
Item Total Price No Bid $31.07 $30.00 $22.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower PAC 1003

P6.22 PAC Tool Mounts Storz Spanner Set
Unit Price No Bid $33.25 $50.00 $40.00
Item Total Price No Bid $33.25 $50.00 $40.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item PAC 1016

P6.23 CFE Part #10317 w/s Spanner Wrench Set
Unit Price No Bid $130.00 $50.00 $0.00
Item Total Price No Bid $260.00 $100.00 $0.00
Quantity 2 2 2 2
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item same as tower no bid, more info

P6.24 Installation of all items listed in Pumper Option 1
Unit Price No Bid $990.00 $1,500.00 $960.00
Item Total Price No Bid $990.00 $1,500.00 $960.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem

Group P7: Pumper Option 2: Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section

P7.1 Generator
Unit Price $0.00 $20,663.00 $11,743.67 $14,250.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $20,663.00 $11,743.67 $14,250.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item per bid specification Smart Power HR-10

P7.2 Breaker Box
Unit Price No Bid 0.00 0.00 760.00
Item Total Price No Bid 0.00 0.00 760.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 0 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This ltem THIS ITEM IS INCLUDED IN PRICE OF P7.1 Included in generator price No Spec. Review at Pre-Con

P7.3 Breaker Panel
Unit Price No Bid 0.00 0.00 120.00
Item Total Price No Bid 0.00 0.00 120.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 0 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item THIS ITEM IS INCLUDED IN PRICE OF P7.1 included in generator price No Spec, will review at Pre-con

P7.4 120-Volt Outlet
Unit Price No Bid 280.00 516.72 300.00
Item Total Price No Bid 280.00 516.72 300.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item Sutphen No Spec

P7.5 Cord Reel
Unit Price No Bid $1,897.00 $2,550.86 $1,500.00
Item Total Price No Bid $1,897.00 $2,550.86 $1,500.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

285 Days after award

270 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Not Bidding This Item

Hannay Cord Reel per bid spec

Akron ECR - 1600

P7.6 Four Way Receptacle




Unit Price No Bid $483.00 $765.68 $500.00
Item Total Price No Bid $483.00 $765.68 $500.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item Akron Junction Box Akron 4 way
Group P8: Pumper Option 3 (Ladder Rack): Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section
P8.1 Ziamatic Hydraulic Ladder Rack to be single arm hydraulic
ladder rack.
Unit Price No Bid $6,361.00 $8,313.46 $4,000.00
Item Total Price No Bid $6,361.00 $8,313.46 $4,000.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 285 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
COST FOR HYDRAULIC LADDER RACK
INCLUDES THE COST FOR FULL HEIGHT-FULL
DEPTH COMPARTMENTS ON PASSENGER SIDE
IN PLACE OF LADDER STORAGE THROUGH Reference drawing submitted in
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item THE BODY. proposal Zico
Group P9: Pumper Option 4 (Thermal Camera): Specify manufacturer, model, and stock # in comment section
P9.1 Flir Thermal Camera K-55 with Truck Charger
Unit Price No Bid $5,622.22 $6,000.00 $6,400.00
Item Total Price No Bid $5,622.22 $6,000.00 $6,400.00
Description Part #722201-0206 Part #722201-0206 Part #722201-0206 Part #722201-0206
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award 295 Days after award 270 Days after award Days after award
Flir Thermal Camera K-55 with
Comment (Optional) Not Bidding This Item Truck Charger Flir K-55 with truck charger
TWO (2) TANKERS (NO AWARD DUE TO BEING OVER BUDGET)
Group P10: Tankers (No Award) $498,070.00 NO BID NO BID $482,972.34
Group P11: Tanker Option 1 (No Award) $2,797.00 NO BID NO BID $4,650.00
Tax $600.00 NO BID NO BID $600.00
GRAND TOTAL $501,467.00 NO BID NO BID $488,222.34
Group P10: Tankers
P10.1 Tanker
Unit Price $249,035.00 No Bid No Bid $241,486.17
Item Total Price $498,070.00 No Bid No Bid $482,972.34
Quantity 2 2 2 2

Estimated Delivery

330 Days after award

Days after award

0 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Pricing Includes SC Sales Tax

Sutphen Corporation will not be
bidding the Tankers.

Rosenbauer Commercial Tanker on
Freightliner 2 door chassis per spec

<.

Group P11: Tanker Option 1: Specify

turer, model, and stock # in comment section

P11.1 Fire Comm Heads set 5100D

Unit Price $2,797.00 No Bid No Bid $4,000.00
Item Total Price $2,797.00 No Bid No Bid $4,000.00
Description Fire Comm Heads set 5100D Fire Comm Heads set 5100D Fire Comm Heads set 5100D Fire Comm Heads set 5100D

Quantity 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

30 Days after award

Days after award

0 Days after award

Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Pricing Includes (1) 5100D Firecom
unit, (2) Intercom/Radio Transmit
headsets, and (1) Radio Interface
Cable - Installed on tanker apparatus

Sutphen Corporation will not be
bidding the Tankers.

Fire Com 5100 D with UN-51




P11.2 Installation of all items listed in Tanker Option 1
Unit Price $0.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00
Item Total Price $0.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery 330 Days after award Days after award 0 Days after award Days after award

Price of Installation at Factory
Comment (Optional) Included in cost of item NO BID no bid on tanker
Questions
Page 1

Group 1
meeting? Yes Yes Yes Yes
order? 330 Days 285 8-10months 295-365




