
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  2017-IFB-08 

 

PROCUREMENT: FIREARMS PARTS PURCHASE AND 

DISPOSAL OF USED FIREARMS 

PARTS FIREARMS 

 

ISSUE DATE:      JUNE 8, 2016 

 

CLOSING DATE:     JULY 7, 2016 

 

 

AWARD IS MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Group P1: Lawmen’s Distribution, LLC  

Groups P2 – P5, P7 

 

No Award 

Groups P1 & P6 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  July 13, 2016 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



DANA SAFETY SUPPLY LAWMEN'S Distribution, LLC

Group P1: LOT #1 – Straight Trade of Used Duty Weapon Uppers for Items 

Sought. No Bid Vendor does not meet specifications

P1.1 Daniel Defense  MK18 Complete

Unit Price No Bid $944.78

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid $12,282.14

Description

Upper 23-004-08013-006URG, 

10.3”, 5.56, 1:7, Gov’t, LPG, RIS II 

MK18, DDFS-Black

Upper 23-004-08013-006URG, 10.3”, 5.56, 

1:7, Gov’t, LPG, RIS II MK18, DDFS-Black

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

P1.2 Daniel Defense 15-024-16146 – Buffer Spring

Unit Price No Bid $11.55

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid $150.15

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

P1.3 Daniel Defense 05-013-17032 – H Buffer

Unit Price No Bid $23.73

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid $308.49

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

P1.4 AimPoint Micro T-2 No Bid

Unit Price No Bid $624.95

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price $0.00 $8,124.35

Description

AIM200170

UPC: 7350004384563

AIM200170

UPC: 7350004384563

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

P1.5 AimPoint 3X Magnifier w/ Twist Mount & Spacer

Unit Price No Bid 674.99

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid 8,774.87

Description

AIM12071 

UPC: 7350004382026

AIM12071 

UPC: 7350004382026

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

Firearms Parts Purchase and Disposal of Used Firearms Parts Firearms

2017-IFB-08



Group P2: LOT #2 – PURCHASE OF NEW DANIEL DEFENSE MK18 COMPLETE 

UPPER ONLY NO SUBSITUTION No Bid $12,282.14

Tax No Bid $859.75

Total No Bid $13,141.89

P2.1 Daniel Defense  MK18 Complete Upper

Unit Price No Bid $944.78

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid $12,282.14

Description

23-004-08013-006 URG, 10.3”, 5.56, 

1:7, Gov’t, LPG, RIS II MK18, DDFS-

Black

23-004-08013-006 URG, 10.3”, 5.56, 1:7, 

Gov’t, LPG, RIS II MK18, DDFS-Black

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

Group P3: LOT #3 – PURCHASE OF NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY NO 

SUBSITUTION No Bid $150.15

Tax No Bid $10.51

Total No Bid $160.66

P3.1 Daniel Defense 15-024-16146 – Buffer Spring

Unit Price No Bid $11.55

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid $150.15

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

Comment (Optional) no bid this item

Group P4: LOT #4 – PURCHASE OF NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY NO 

SUBSITUTION No Bid $308.49

Tax No Bid $21.59

Total No Bid $330.08

P4.1 Daniel Defense 05-013-17032 – H Buffer

Unit Price No Bid $23.73

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price No Bid $308.49

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 90 Days after award

Comment (Optional) no bid this item



Group P5: LOT #5 – PURCHASE OF NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY NO 

SUBSITUTION $8,723.00 $8,124.35

Tax No Bid $568.70

Total No Bid $8,693.05

P5.1 AimPoint Micro T-2

Unit Price $671.00 $624.95

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price $8,723.00 $8,124.35

Description

AIM200170

UPC: 7350004384563

AIM200170

UPC: 7350004384563

Estimated Delivery 45 Days after award 90 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Group P6: LOT #6 – PURCHASE OF NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY NO 

SUBSITUTION $9,399.00 $8,774.87

Tax No Bid $614.24

Total No Bid $9,389.11

P6.1 AimPoint 3X Magnifier w/ Twist Mount & Spacer

Unit Price $723.00 $674.99

Quantity 13 EA 13 EA

Item Total Price $9,399.00 $8,774.87

Description

AIM12071 

UPC: 7350004382026

AIM12071 

UPC: 7350004382026

Estimated Delivery 45 Days after award 90 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Group P7: LOT #7 – OFFER TO PURCHASE USED DUTY WEAPON H&K 416 

UPPERS No Bid $26,013.00

P7.1 Offer to purchase the items listed in the inventory list in the "Buyers 

Attachments"

Unit Price No Bid $26,013.00

Quantity 1 LT 1 LT

Item Total Price No Bid $26,013.00

Estimated Delivery 0 Days after award 15 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

Lot of 13  used duty weapon H&K uppers.  

Once Lexington Co advises Lawmen's of 

being awarded bid and tells us to go 

forward we will begin the paperwork and 

get with contact at the SO.



Questions

Page 1

Group 1

1.1 Did your company attend the mandatory pre-bid meeting? Not Applicable Not Applicable

1.2 What is your estimated delivery time after receipt of order? apporx 30 days aro


