COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

STATEMENT OF AWARD
SOLICITATION NUMBER: 2017-1FB-30
PROJECT TITLE: Firearms Purchase and Disposal of Used Firearms Parts
Firearms
AWARDED TO: DANA Safety Supply

Lot #3: $817.00 Each (Estimated Value: $15,736.00)

Kings Firearms
Lot #4: $ 7.00 Each  (Estimated Value: $525.00)
Lot #5: $16,359.00

DATE OF AWARD: September 23, 2016

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County.

Kay Keisler
Procurement Officer

Posted: September 23, 2016

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



FIREARMS PARTS PURCHASE AND
DISPOSAL OF USED FIREARMS PARTS
FIREARMS - 2017-1FB-30 -
SEPTEMBER 21, 2016

Lawmen's Distribution,
LLC

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY

Elite Pawn & Gun LLC

AmChar Wholesale Inc

KINGS FIREARMS

Response Notes

Group P1: LOT #1 — STRAIGHT TRADE
OF SEIZED AND CONFISCATED
WEAPONS FOR ITEMS SOUGHT

0.00

0.00

0.00

9,204.12

18,259.00

P1.1 Total Trade In Value Only for
P1.2,P1.3,&P1.4

Unit Price

0.00

0.00

0.00

8,375.00

16,359.00

Item Total Price

0.00

0.00

0.00

8,375.00

16,359.00

Description

Quantity

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

Days after award

Days after award

90 Days after award

14 Days after award

This amount is the total

For 133 guns listed on Gun

Comment (Optional) No Bid NO BID No Bid value of the trade in list. Trade #3 (pink)

P1.2 LE FN15 36302 with Sling

and one 30 rd Magazine
Unit Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 821.13 900.00
Item Total Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 821.13 900.00

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at

Description the time of the award. the time of the award. the time of the award. the time of the award. the time of the award.
Quantity 1 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award Days after award 90 Days after award 120 Days after award
We are offering 10 FN15 One LE FN 15 36302 with
(36302) with one magazine |Blackhawk 2 pt sling and
Comment (Optional) No Bid NO BID No Bid and single point sling one 30rd magazine
P1.3 Sig Sauer M400-16-BS with
Sling and one 30 rd Magazine
Unit Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 993.00
Item Total Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 993.00
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FIREARMS PARTS PURCHASE AND
DISPOSAL OF USED FIREARMS PARTS
FIREARMS - 2017-1FB-30 -
SEPTEMBER 21, 2016

Lawmen's Distribution,
LLC

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY

Elite Pawn & Gun LLC

AmChar Wholesale Inc

KINGS FIREARMS

Description

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Quantity

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

Days after award

Days after award

Days after award

120 Days after award

We are not offering any Sig

One Sig Sauer M400-16-BS
with Blackhawk 2 pt sling

Comment (Optional) No Bid NO BID No Bid Rifles and one 30rd magazine
P1.4 30 Rd AR-15 Aluminum
Magazine - Low Friction Follower
Unit Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.99 7.00
Item Total Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.99 7.00

Description

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. If applicable,
adjustments to the
tabulation will be made at
the time of the award.

Quantity

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

Days after award

Days after award

90 Days after award

90 Days after award

We are offering 20
aluminum, mil-spec 30rd

One Government contract

Comment (Optional) No Bid NO BID No Bid AR-15 mags 30 round Gl magazine
Group P2: LOT #2 - PURCHASE OF
NEW M-4 (AR-15) ONLY NO
SUBSITUTION 0.00 0.00 0.00 821.13 900.00
P2.1 LE FN 15 36302 with Sling and
one 30 rd Magazine
Unit Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 821.13 900.00
Item Total Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 821.13 900.00
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FIREARMS PARTS PURCHASE AND
DISPOSAL OF USED FIREARMS PARTS
FIREARMS - 2017-1FB-30 -
SEPTEMBER 21, 2016

Lawmen's Distribution,
LLC

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY

Elite Pawn & Gun LLC

AmChar Wholesale Inc

KINGS FIREARMS

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available

Description funding. funding. funding. funding. funding.
Quantity 1 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery Days after award Days after award Days after award 90 Days after award 120 Days after award
One LE FN 15 36302 with
This price is for the rifle, Blackhawk 2 pt sling and
Comment (Optional) no bid NO BID No Bid one mag and sling. one 30rd magazine
Group P3: LOT #3 - PURCHASE OF
NEW M-4 (AR-15) ONLY NO
SUBSITUTION 0.00 817.00 0.00 0.00 993.00
P3.1 Sig Sauer M400-16-BS with
Sling and one 30 rd Magazine
Unit Price 0.00 817.00 0.00 0.00 993.00
Item Total Price 0.00 817.00 0.00 0.00 993.00

Description

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section.Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section.Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section.Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section.Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section.Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Quantity

Estimated Delivery

60 Days after award

180 Days after award

Days after award

Days after award

120 Days after award
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FIREARMS PARTS PURCHASE AND
DISPOSAL OF USED FIREARMS PARTS
FIREARMS - 2017-1FB-30 -
SEPTEMBER 21, 2016

Lawmen's Distribution,
LLC

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY

Elite Pawn & Gun LLC

AmChar Wholesale Inc

KINGS FIREARMS

Comment (Optional)

We offer 6 of the Sig Sauer
M400-16BC rifle with 1 30
rd magazine each and 1
Viking Tactics Sling model
VTAC-MK2BK (black sling)
per each rifle package for
the trade in value of
$5005.00 as entered in Lot
5. SCSales Tax will be
added to Lawmen's Invoice
generated for these
products.

RIFLE COMES WITH ONE
MAGAZINE AND SLING

No Bid

We are not offering any
Sig's.

One Sig Sauer M400-16-BS
with Blackhawk 2 pt sling
and one 30rd magazine

Group P4: LOT #4 — PURCHASE OF
NEW ACCESSORIES ONLY NO

SUBSITUTION 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.99 7.00
P4.1 AR-15 Aluminum Magazine -
Low Friction Follower
Unit Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.99 7.00
Item Total Price 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.99 7.00

Description

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Please specify how many
items your company is
offering in the comments
section. Please specify how
many items your company
is offering in the comments
section. Quantities will be
determined based on
funding available if Group
P5 is awarded and available
funding.

Quantity

Estimated Delivery

60 Days after award

Days after award

Days after award

90 Days after award

90 Days after award
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FIREARMS PARTS PURCHASE AND
DISPOSAL OF USED FIREARMS PARTS

FIREARMS - 2017-IFB-30 - Lawmen's Distribution,

SEPTEMBER 21, 2016 LLC DANA SAFETY SUPPLY Elite Pawn & Gun LLC | AmChar Wholesale Inc KINGS FIREARMS
We offer 4 of the Sig Sauer
MAGARALUM30 magazine
as part of the $5005.00
trade in value of
confiscated weapons. SC
Sales Tax will be added to
Lawmen's invoice This price is the agency
generated for the purchase price for one aluminum, mil{One Government contract
Comment (Optional) of these products. NO BID No Bid spec magazine. 30 round Gl magazine
Group P5: LOT #5 — OFFER TO
PURCHASE USED SERVICE AND
CONFISCATED FIREARMS 5,005.00 7,785.00 11,160.00 8,375.00 16,359.00
P5.1 Offer to purchase the items
listed in the inventory list in the
"Buyers Attachments"
Unit Price 5,005.00 7,785.00 11,160.00 8,375.00 16,359.00
Item Total Price 5,005.00 7,785.00 11,160.00 8,375.00 16,359.00
Description
Quantity 1 1 1 1 1

Estimated Delivery

Days after award

10 Days after award

Days after award

30 Days after award

14 Days after award

Comment (Optional)

This is the total dollar value
we are offering for the
attached inventory list of
weapons.

Bid On Firearm Lot

The value entered is our
price for the lot of trade in
guns.

For 133 guns listed on Gun
Trade #3 (pink)

Questions

Group 1

1.1 What is your estimated
delivery time after receipt of
order?

45-60 days ARO

RIFLES ARE 120-180 DAYS

Approximately 90 days

120 days
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