COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

STATEMENT OF AWARD
SOLICITATION NUMBER: 2017-1FB-66
PROJECT TITLE: Library Cleaning Services
AWARDED TO: Classy Cleaning Services
AMOUNT OF AWARD: $18,300.00
DATE OF AWARD: May 30, 2017

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: May 30, 2017

THIS ISNOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



Classy Cleaning

Synergy Franchising Corp

Clean World USA,

C & W Janitorial Services dba/ Jani-King of Columbia LLc
Total Bid $9,228.00 $18,300.00 $25,272.00 $25,296.00
Group P1

P1.1 Cleaning Services - Batesburg/Leesville

Branch
Unit Price $0.00 $275.00 $350.00 $360.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $3,300.00 $4,200.00 $4,320.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017
Comment (Optional) no bid

P1.2 Cleaning Services - Chapin Branch
Unit Price $0.00 $300.00 $420.00 $399.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $3,600.00 $5,040.00 $4,788.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017
Comment (Optional) no bid

P1.3 Cleaning Services - Pelion
Unit Price $0.00 $250.00 $368.00 $345.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $3,000.00 $4,416.00 $4,140.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017
Comment (Optional) no bid




Classy Cleaning

Synergy Franchising Corp

Clean World USA,

C & W Janitorial Services dba/ Jani-King of Columbia LLc
P1.4 Cleaning Services - Gaston Branch

Unit Price $349.00 $175.00 $236.00 $251.00
Item Total Price $4,188.00 $2,100.00 $2,832.00 $3,012.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 7/1/2017 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017

We will clean

Gaston and Swansea

if awarded for these

locations, for

example, if we are

not awarded for

Gaston but awarded

for Swansea only we

will not be

interested in

providning services

for Lexington

County Library
Comment (Optional) System

P1.5 Cleaning Services - Gilbert-Summit Branch

Unit Price $0.00 $175.00 $260.00 $251.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $2,100.00 $3,120.00 $3,012.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017
Comment (Optional) no bid




Classy Cleaning Synergy Franchising Corp | Clean World USA,
C & W Janitorial Services dba/ Jani-King of Columbia LLc
P1.6 Cleaning Services - Swansea Branch
Unit Price $420.00 $175.00 $236.00 $251.00
Item Total Price S$5,040.00 $2,100.00 $2,832.00 $3,012.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017
Swansea and Gaston
if awarded for these
locations we are
only interested in
provding janitorial
services for Gaston
and Swansea, we
are interested in
only Gaston and
Swansea if we are
awared for BOTH
Comment (Optional) Gaston and
P1.7 Cleaning Services - South Congaree-Pine
Ridge Branch
Unit Price $0.00 $175.00 $236.00 $251.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $2,100.00 $2,832.00 $3,012.00
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/22/2017 6/1/2017 5/19/2017

Comment (Optional)




Executive Janitorial Goodwill of North, South, East & West
Service Upstate/Midlands SC Carpet Cleaning Services
Total Bid $36,528.00 $47,100.00 $77,760.00
Group P1

P1.1 Cleaning Services - Batesburg/Leesville

Branch
Unit Price $615.00 $716.00 $1,350.00
Item Total Price $7,380.00 $8,592.00 $16,200.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017

Delivery to be 30 days

Comment (Optional) from Award Date. .18 cent per square foot

P1.2 Cleaning Services - Chapin Branch
Unit Price $695.00 $716.00 $1,458.00
Item Total Price $8,340.00 $8,592.00 $17,496.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017

Delivery to be 30 days

Comment (Optional) from Award Date. .18 cent per square foot

P1.3 Cleaning Services - Pelion
Unit Price $580.00 $659.00 $1,080.00
Item Total Price $6,960.00 $7,908.00 $12,960.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017

Comment (Optional)

Delivery to be 30 days
from Award Date.

.18 cent per square foot




Executive Janitorial

Goodwill of

North, South, East & West

Service Upstate/Midlands SC Carpet Cleaning Services
P1.4 Cleaning Services - Gaston Branch
Unit Price 359.00 369.00 432.00
Item Total Price 4,308.00 4,428.00 5,184.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017
Delivery to be 30 days
Comment (Optional) from Award Date. .18 cent per square foot
P1.5 Cleaning Services - Gilbert-Summit Branch
Unit Price 350.00 531.00 720.00
Item Total Price 4,200.00 6,372.00 8,640.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017
Delivery to be 30 days
Comment (Optional) from Award Date. .18 cent per square foot
P1.6 Cleaning Services - Swansea Branch
Unit Price 220.00 467.00 720.00
Item Total Price 2,640.00 5,604.00 8,640.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017
Delivery to be 30 days
Comment (Optional) from Award Date. .18 cent per square foot
P1.7 Cleaning Services - South Congaree-Pine
Ridge Branch
Unit Price 225.00 467.00 720.00
Item Total Price 2,700.00 5,604.00 8,640.00
Quantity 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery Date 5/26/2017 6/18/2017 6/30/2017

Comment (Optional)

Delivery to be 30 days
from Award Date.

.18 per cent square foot
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