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COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   
Procurement Services  
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8166 

Fax (803) 785-2240 
 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 
OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 
 
REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  2017-IFB-69 
 
PROCUREMENT: Janitorial Supplies 
 
ISSUE DATE:      May 3, 2017 
 
CLOSING DATE:     May 31, 2017 
 

 
AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

All American Poly: 
Items:  P1.1 & P1.2 Estimated Annual Award:  $2,322.60 
 
Kamo Manufacturing Company, Inc.: 
Items:  P1.4, P1.5, P1.12, P1.16, P1.18, P1.27, P1.33,   
P1.34, P1.35, P1.36, P1.37, P1.38, P1.39, P1.46 &  
P1.50 Estimated Annual Award:  $20,182.59 
 
Smith & Jones Janitorial Supplies: 
Items:  P1.3, P1.7, P1.8, P1.10, P1.11, P1.14, P1.15,  
P1.19, P1.20, P1.24, P1.25, P1.26, P1.29, P1.31,  
P1.47 & P1.48 Estimated Annual Award:  $24,922.00 
 
Forms & Supply, Inc.: 
Items:  P1.6, P1.13, P1.17, P1.22, P1.28, P1.42, P1.45, 
 P1.49, P1.51 Estimated Annual Award:  $2,534.15 
 
Waper, Inc.: 
Items:  P1.9 & P1.41 Estimated Annual Award:  $528.10 
 
No Award: 
Items  P1.21, P1.23, P1.30, P1.32, P1.40, P1.43, P1.44  Estimated Annual Award:  $0.00 
 
Estimated Total Annual Award: $50,489.44 
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An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 
Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 
where the County failed in determining the potential award. 
 
 
Angela M. Seymour 
Procurement Officer 
 
Posted:  June 16, 2017 

 
 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 
 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 



All American Poly Interboro Packaging Corporation Dispose N' Save Unipak Corp.
Group P1

P1.1 24 & 33 Clear Liners
Unit Price $11.05 $18.48 $22.32 $41.95
Item Total Price $1,657.50 $2,772.00 $3,348.00 $6,292.50
Quantity 150 150 150 150
Estimated Delivery 10 9 7 10

Comment (Optional)

INT-2433-Reg, As Per Sample #P1, 
21.12#/1,000 Nom., Mfr: Aluf IBS, 
Color: Clear, A sample is following 
to 212 South Lake Drive. lexington, 
SC 29072 - Please look out for the 
revised sample.

DPS2433-4, Sample #P1, 
1,000/Case, 21.16#/Case, Mfr: 
Interplast/API, Clear Bag, Sample 
Following via FedEx Ground to 
South Lake Drive. - be on lookout 
for new sample due to addendum.

P1.2 30 X 36 Black Liners
Unit Price $7.39 $16.32 $13.82 $16.00
Item Total Price $665.10 $1,468.80 $1,243.80 $1,440.00
Quantity 90 90 90 90
Estimated Delivery 10 9 7 10

Comment (Optional)

INT-3037-Med, As Per Sample #P2, 
12.73#/Case Nom., Mfr: Aluf IBS, 
Color: Black, A sample is following 
to 212 South Lake Drive. lexington, 
SC 29072 - Please look out for the 
revised sample.

DPS3037-7, Sample #P2, 500/Case, 
12.60#/Case, Mfr: Interplast/API, 
Black Bag, Sample Following via 
FedEx Ground to South Lake Dr. - be 
on lookout for new sample due to 
addendum.

P1.3 24 OZ Wallblock 6/CS
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 10 10 10 10
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.4 Bleach (6 Gallons)
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 630 630 630 630
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.5 Brawny 8 x 12.5 Wiper 2 Ply White 
20/148/CS (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 27 27 27 27
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.6 Brite ALL SS Cleaner (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 48 48 48 48
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.7 Bug Blaster Ant Killer (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Catalog Number 104 104 104 104
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.8 Cleaner, Heavy Duty, Green
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 144 144 144 144
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.9 DEET Insect Repellent (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 4 4 4 4
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.10 Deoderant block with hanger
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 80 80 80 80
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.11 Dust Mops
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 336 336 336 336
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.12 Dust N More (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 32 32 32 32
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.13 Earth Scents Enzyme Producing 
Bacteria Eliminates Odors (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 24 24 24 24
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.14 Exquisit Floor Finish (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 20 20 20 20
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.15 Four Roll Tissue Carousel
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 6 6 6 6
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.16 Funiture Polish
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 144 144 144 144
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.17 Green Scrub Pads
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 136 136 136 136
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.18 Hand Soap 800 ML Pink & Clean
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 74 74 74 74
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.19 Impact 32 OZ Spray Bottle with 
Trigger

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 432 432 432 432
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.20 Impact Trigger Sprayers
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 420 420 420 420
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.21 Isopropanol
Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 60 60 60 60
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.22 Lobby Dust Pan
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 66 66 66 66
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.23 Mop Handle (Snap On)
Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 40 40 40 40
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.24 Non-Ammoniated Floor Stripper
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 72 72 72 72
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.25 Pine Scope Eco 1/GAL Gen Purpose 
Cleaner (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 1256 1256 1256 1256
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.26 Pinky Magic AP Cleaner (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 1912 1912 1912 1912
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.27 Purell Hand Sanitizer
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 16 16 16 16
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.28 Rubbermaid Bucket Wringer
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 30 30 30 30
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.29 S & J Pink Hand Soap (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 80 80 80 80
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.30 Scenturian Odor Counteractant 3 X 
1 Smart SAC

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.31 Special Green A/P Cleaner (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 872 872 872 872
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.32 Spot Shot Fabric Cleaner (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 5 5 5 5
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.33 Spraypak Air Freshener (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 1512 1512 1512 1512
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.34 Spraypak Disinfectant Aerosol (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 2220 2220 2220 2220
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.35 Spraypak Flying & Crawling Insect 
Killer 15 OZ

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 108 108 108 108
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.36 Spraypak Foam Cleaner Aerosol 
(Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 10 10 10 10
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.37 Spraypak Furniture Polish (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 108 108 108 108
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.38 Spraypak Insect Killer Spray (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 384 384 384 384
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.39 Spraypak Wasp & Hornet Killer 
Spray (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 192 192 192 192
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.40 Star Spray Glass Cleaner (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 5 5 5 5
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.41 Straight Up pH Neutral Cleaner (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 6 6 6 6
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.42 Symmetry Foaming Hand Sanitizer 
(Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 3 3 3 3
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.43 Symmetry Green Seal Foam Soap 
(Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 84 84 84 84
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.44 T-Cell Odor Control System Mango 
Blossom (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 48 48 48 48
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.45 Toilet Bowl Brush with Caddy
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 44 44 44 44
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.46 Trifold White Towel Dispenser
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 44 44 44 44
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID



P1.47 Urinal Screen
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 96 96 96 96
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.48 Wash N Wax (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 180 180 180 180
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.49 Whisk Corn Broom
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 48 48 48 48
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.50 White Roll Towels
Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 80 80 80 80
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

P1.51 X It Out Vandalism Remover (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Quantity 16 16 16 16
Estimated Delivery 0 9 7 0
Comment (Optional) NO BID NO BID

Questions
Group 1

1.1 What is your estimated delivery 
time after receipt of order? 5-10 Business days 7-10 Days 7 Days 1-10 Days



Kamo Manufacturing Co. INC Smith & Jones Janitorial Supplies Forms & Supply, Inc. Waper Inc
Group P1

P1.1 24 & 33 Clear Liners
Unit Price $18.83 $22.00 $27.36 35.00
Item Total Price $2,824.50 $3,300.00 $4,104.00 5,250.00
Quantity 150 150 150 150
Estimated Delivery 5 10 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GJO01756 FSI Item is 8 mic 
thick. Items must be ordered in the 
FSI selling unit

P1.2 30 X 36 Black Liners
Unit Price $12.49 $18.00 $23.91 40.00
Item Total Price $1,124.10 $1,620.00 $2,151.90 $3,600.00
Quantity 90 90 90 90
Estimated Delivery 5 10 1 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: RLBV01630 FSI Item is 
.6mil thick.  Items must be ordered 
in the FSI selling unit

P1.3 24 OZ Wallblock 6/CS
Unit Price $33.62 $3.60 $25.99 $20.22
Item Total Price $336.20 $36.00 $259.90 $202.20
Quantity 10 10 10 10
Estimated Delivery 5 10 7 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: BWKW24 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit

P1.4 Bleach (6 Gallons)
Unit Price $7.78 $9.24 $8.99 $14.70
Item Total Price $4,901.40 $5,821.20 $5,663.70 $9,261.00
Quantity 630 630 630 630
Estimated Delivery 5 10 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: KIKBLEACH6 Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit

P1.5 Brawny 8 x 12.5 Wiper 2 Ply White 
20/148/CS (Or Equal - See Description)



Unit Price $50.85 $78.99 $88.24 $60.00
Item Total Price $1,372.95 $2,132.73 $2,382.48 $1,620.00
Quantity 27 27 27 27
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GPC29221 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit

P1.6 Brite ALL SS Cleaner (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $4.35 $2.37 $9.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $208.80 $113.76 $432.00
Quantity 48 48 48 48
Estimated Delivery 5 10 7 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
GJO02114CT by the CT (28.48/CT). 
FSI Item is 12EA/CT vs EA. Items 
must be ordered in the FSI selling 
unit

P1.7 Bug Blaster Ant Killer (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $26.00 $0.00 $100.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $26.00 $0.00 $100.00
Catalog Number 104 104 104 104
Quantity 1 1 1 1
Estimated Delivery 5 5 1 3
Comment (Optional) 23 LBS PER BAG No Bid

P1.8 Cleaner, Heavy Duty, Green
Unit Price $0.00 $6.00 $15.27 $15.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $864.00 $2,198.88 $2,160.00
Quantity 144 144 144 144
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) CAN DO

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
SMP13421 by the CT (61.09). FSI 
Item is 4Gal/CT vs GAL. Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit



P1.9 DEET Insect Repellent (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $64.00 $69.90 $40.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $256.00 $279.60 $160.00
Quantity 4 4 4 4
Estimated Delivery 5 10 3 3

Comment (Optional)
DEET NON SCENTED 12/6OZ PER 
CASE

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: SJNCB018357 FSI Item is 
12/CT. Items must be ordered in 
the FSI selling unit

P1.10 Deoderant block with hanger
Unit Price $16.81 $9.00 $151.80 $20.22
Item Total Price $1,344.80 $720.00 $12,144.00 $1,617.60
Quantity 80 80 80 80
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: HOS08411 FSI Item is 
12/BX 4oz EA. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.11 Dust Mops
Unit Price $7.50 $2.95 $7.85 $12.00
Item Total Price $2,520.00 $991.20 $2,637.60 $4,032.00
Quantity 336 336 336 336
Estimated Delivery 5 10 3 3

Comment (Optional) THESE ARE 3X24

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
ODLE243 by the CT (94.17). FSI Item 
is 12/CT vs EA. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.12 Dust N More (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $2.21 $3.08 $3.41 $4.50
Item Total Price $70.72 $98.56 $109.12 $144.00
Quantity 32 32 32 32
Estimated Delivery 5 10 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
RLBV00481 by the CT (40.87). FSI 
Item is 12/CT vs EA. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.13 Earth Scents Enzyme Producing 
Bacteria Eliminates Odors (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $4.25 $2.73 $6.99
Item Total Price $0.00 $102.00 $65.52 $167.76
Quantity 24 24 24 24
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
RLBV01474 by the CT (32.81). FSI 
Item is 12/CT vs EA. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.14 Exquisit Floor Finish (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $54.00 $66.87 $68.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $1,080.00 $1,337.40 $1,360.00
Quantity 20 20 20 20
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: BZL75004481 FSI Item is 
5GAL/EA. Items must be ordered in 
the FSI selling unit.

P1.15 Four Roll Tissue Carousel
Unit Price $0.00 $30.00 $45.00 $50.44
Item Total Price $0.00 $180.00 $270.00 $302.64
Quantity 6 6 6 6
Estimated Delivery 5 10 7 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: SJMR3800TBK Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.16 Funiture Polish
Unit Price $2.14 $2.30 $2.48 $2.17
Item Total Price $308.16 $331.20 $357.12 $312.48
Quantity 144 144 144 144
Estimated Delivery 5 5 6 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GJO10351 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.17 Green Scrub Pads
Unit Price $0.00 $5.70 $1.97 $12.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $775.20 $267.92 $1,632.00
Quantity 136 136 136 136
Estimated Delivery 5 10 7 3

Comment (Optional) THESE ARE PACKED 20 EACH

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
ACSSO96 by the CT (11.84). FSI Item 
is 10/PK 6PK/CT vs PK. Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.18 Hand Soap 800 ML Pink & Clean
Unit Price $21.29 $26.00 $37.80 $25.23
Item Total Price $1,575.46 $1,924.00 $2,797.20 $1,867.02
Quantity 74 74 74 74
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
GOJ911212 by the EA (3.15). FSI 
Item is EA vs 12/CT. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.19 Impact 32 OZ Spray Bottle with 
Trigger

Unit Price $0.00 $0.85 $0.93 $1.75
Item Total Price $0.00 $367.20 $401.76 $756.00
Quantity 432 432 432 432
Estimated Delivery 5 5 14 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI Sells 
Bottle and Trigger Seperately.  
Bottle (IMP5032WG) Price is .45 
and Trigger (IMP5906) Price is .48. 
Items must be ordered in the FSI 
selling unit.

P1.20 Impact Trigger Sprayers
Unit Price $0.00 $0.50 $0.48 $1.55
Item Total Price $0.00 $210.00 $201.60 $651.00
Quantity 420 420 420 420
Estimated Delivery 5 5 14 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: IMP5906 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

Procurement Note Does Not Meet Specifications



P1.21 Isopropanol
Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 60 60 60 60
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
XPD6345537 by the CT (16.46). FSI 
ITEM IS 4GAL/CT vs QT. Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.22 Lobby Dust Pan
Unit Price $7.00 $8.95 $5.13 $15.00
Item Total Price $462.00 $590.70 $338.58 $990.00
Quantity 66 66 66 66
Estimated Delivery 5 5 14 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: IMP2600 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.23 Mop Handle (Snap On)
Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 40 40 40 40
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: XPD4602661 Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.24 Non-Ammoniated Floor Stripper
Unit Price $0.00 $6.75 $7.22 $8.95
Item Total Price $0.00 $486.00 $519.84 $644.40
Quantity 72 72 72 72
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) CLASSIC PRODUCTS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
RLBV01457 by the CT (28.89). FSI 
Item is 4Gal/CT vs GAL.  Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.25 Pine Scope Eco 1/GAL Gen Purpose 
Cleaner (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $2.90 $4.23 $8.95
Item Total Price $0.00 $3,642.40 $5,312.88 $11,241.20
Quantity 1256 1256 1256 1256
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) CLASSIC PRODUCTS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
KRC01763C4002 by the CT (16.90). 
FSI Item is 4Gal/CT vs GAL. Items 
must be ordered in the FSI selling 
unit.

P1.26 Pinky Magic AP Cleaner (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $2.99 $4.96 $6.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $5,716.88 $9,483.52 $11,472.00
Quantity 1912 1912 1912 1912
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) CLASSIC PRODUCTS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GJO10361 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.27 Purell Hand Sanitizer
Unit Price $24.00 $42.00 $39.12 $125.00
Item Total Price $384.00 $672.00 $625.92 $2,000.00
Quantity 16 16 16 16
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) 9652-12

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
GOJ965212EA by the EA (3.26). FSI 
Item is EA vs 12/CT. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.28 Rubbermaid Bucket Wringer
Unit Price $0.00 $73.25 $41.99 $59.95
Item Total Price $0.00 $2,197.50 $1,259.70 $1,798.50
Quantity 30 30 30 30
Estimated Delivery 5 5 14 3

Comment (Optional) RUBBERMAID 7580-88

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
IMPWH6000Y by the EA (41.99). 
Items must be ordered in the FSI 
selling unit.

P1.29 S & J Pink Hand Soap (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $5.20 $5.20 $15.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $416.00 $416.00 $1,200.00
Quantity 80 80 80 80
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional) CLASSIC PRODUCTS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
BZL73000047 by the CT (20.78). FSI 
Item is 4Gal/CT vs GAL. Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.30 Scenturian Odor Counteractant 3 X 
1 Smart SAC

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 12 12 12 12
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)
EARTH SCENTS ENZYME AND ODOR 
COUNTERACTANT 12/CS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: RLBV01482 FSI Item is 
4GAL/CTItems must be ordered in 
the FSI selling unit.

P1.31 Special Green A/P Cleaner (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $5.28 $9.45 $8.99
Item Total Price $0.00 $4,604.16 $8,240.40 $7,839.28
Quantity 872 872 872 872
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) CLASSIC PRODUCTS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: SMP13005 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.32 Spot Shot Fabric Cleaner (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 5 5 5 5
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) SPOT SHOT 12/18OZ PER CASE

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: RLBV00487 FSI Item is 
12EA/CTItems must be ordered in 
the FSI selling unit.

P1.33 Spraypak Air Freshener (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price $1.99 $2.75 $3.22 $2.07
Item Total Price $3,008.88 $4,158.00 $4,868.64 $3,129.84
Quantity 1512 1512 1512 1512
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) SPRAYPAK

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GJO10356 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.34 Spraypak Disinfectant Aerosol (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $1.86 $1.95 $3.23 $1.94
Item Total Price $4,129.20 $4,329.00 $7,170.60 $4,306.80

Description

* All equals must be approved via a 
written amendment prior to the bid 
opening date as outlined in the 
specifications.

* All equals must be approved via a 
written amendment prior to the bid 
opening date as outlined in the 
specifications.

* All equals must be approved via a 
written amendment prior to the bid 
opening date as outlined in the 
specifications.

* All equals must be approved via a 
written amendment prior to the bid 
opening date as outlined in the 
specifications.

Quantity 2220 2220 2220 2220
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional) SPRAYPAK

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
BZL75000014 by the CT (38.79). FSI 
Item is 12EA/CT vs EA. Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.35 Spraypak Flying & Crawling Insect 
Killer 15 OZ

Unit Price $2.78 $4.07 $4.58 $6.00
Item Total Price $300.24 $439.56 $494.64 $648.00
Quantity 108 108 108 108
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional) SPRAYPAK

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
SJN660574 by the CT (54.95). FSI 
Item is 12EA/CT vs CNItems must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.36 Spraypak Foam Cleaner Aerosol 
(Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $1.71 $22.80 $31.46 $1.78
Item Total Price $17.10 $228.00 $314.60 $17.80
Quantity 10 10 10 10
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) SPRAYPAK  12/CS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: RLBV00557 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.37 Spraypak Furniture Polish (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $2.14 $2.25 $2.48 $2.22
Item Total Price $231.12 $243.00 $267.84 $239.76
Quantity 108 108 108 108
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) SPRAYPAK

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GJO10351 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.38 Spraypak Insect Killer Spray (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $2.78 $4.05 $5.76 $7.00
Item Total Price $1,067.52 $1,555.20 $2,211.84 $2,688.00
Quantity 384 384 384 384
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional) SPRAYPAK

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
AMR1047651 by the CT (69.11). FSI 
Item is 12EA/CT vs EAItems must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.39 Spraypak Wasp & Hornet Killer 
Spray (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $2.92 $3.25 $3.82 $4.90
Item Total Price $560.64 $624.00 $733.44 $940.80
Quantity 192 192 192 192
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
AMR1045839 by the CT (45.80). FSI 
Item is 12EA/CT vs EAItems must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.40 Star Spray Glass Cleaner (Or Equal - 
See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 5 5 5 5
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) ULTIMATE GLASS CLEANER 12/CS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
GJO02103 by the EA (1.95). FSI Item 
is EA vs 12/CTItems must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.41 Straight Up pH Neutral Cleaner (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $61.35
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $368.10
Quantity 6 6 6 6
Estimated Delivery 5 0 1 3
Comment (Optional) NO BID No Bid

P1.42 Symmetry Foaming Hand Sanitizer 
(Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $0.00 $40.89 $87.35
Item Total Price $0.00 $0.00 $122.67 $262.05
Quantity 3 3 3 3
Estimated Delivery 5 0 3 3

Comment (Optional) NO BID

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
GOJ545604 by the EA (13.63). FSI 
Item is EA 1200ml EA vs 3/CT (FSI 
assumption of Symmetry Unit).  
Customer will need to switch to 
FREE GOJO Dispensers.Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.43 Symmetry Green Seal Foam Soap 
(Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 84 84 84 84
Estimated Delivery 5 0 7 3

Comment (Optional) NO BID

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GOJ516503CT FSI Item is 
3EA/CT 1250ML EAItems must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.44 T-Cell Odor Control System Mango 
Blossom (Or Equal - See Description)

Unit Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Item Total Price No Award No Award No Award No Award
Quantity 48 48 48 48
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional) RCP402369 6/CS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
TEC1957523CT by the CT (43.39). 
FSI item is 6/CT vs EAItems must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.45 Toilet Bowl Brush with Caddy
Unit Price $0.00 $4.25 $3.90 $6.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $187.00 $171.60 $264.00
Quantity 44 44 44 44
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI Sells 
Brush and Holder Separately.  Brush 
(RCP631000WE) Price is 2.07 and 
Trigger (RCP631100) Price is 1.83. 
Items must be ordered in the FSI 
selling unit.



P1.46 Trifold White Towel Dispenser
Unit Price $15.00 $33.00 $21.98 $28.00
Item Total Price $660.00 $1,452.00 $967.12 $1,232.00
Quantity 44 44 44 44
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) WHITE METAL

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GPC56650 Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.47 Urinal Screen
Unit Price $0.00 $0.96 $0.98 $3.85
Item Total Price $0.00 $92.16 $94.08 $369.60
Quantity 96 96 96 96
Estimated Delivery 5 5 7 3

Comment (Optional) CHERRY URINAL SCREEN

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
BWK1002 by the DZ (11.71).FSI Sells 
by DZ vs EA. Items must be ordered 
in the FSI selling unit.

P1.48 Wash N Wax (Or Equal - See 
Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $30.50 $0.00 $2,500.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $5,490.00 $0.00 $450,000.00
Quantity 180 180 180 180
Estimated Delivery 5 5 1 28
Comment (Optional) THIS IS PER 5 GALLON PAIL No Bid

P1.49 Whisk Corn Broom
Unit Price $0.00 $3.00 $2.94 $6.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $144.00 $141.12 $288.00
Quantity 48 48 48 48
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GSWBWR10C Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.



P1.50 White Roll Towels
Unit Price $19.94 $23.80 $20.96 $69.50
Item Total Price $1,595.20 $1,904.00 $1,676.80 $5,560.00
Quantity 80 80 80 80
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional) KITCHEN TOWELS 30/CS 85 SHEETS

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI item 
number: GJO24080 FSI Item is 
80SH/RL, 30RL/CT. Items must be 
ordered in the FSI selling unit.

P1.51 X It Out Vandalism Remover (Or 
Equal - See Description)

Unit Price $0.00 $4.50 $3.33 $8.00
Item Total Price $0.00 $72.00 $53.28 $128.00
Quantity 16 16 16 16
Estimated Delivery 5 5 3 3

Comment (Optional)

Pricing is given in the customer's 
provided unit of measure.  FSI sells 
RLBV00495 by the CT (40.00). FSI 
Item is 12EA/CT vs EA. Items must 
be ordered in the FSI selling unit.

Questions
Group 1

1.1 What is your estimated delivery 
time after receipt of order? 5 Days 10 DAYS differs with item number 3 days
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