COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES
THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: B13011-09/20/12S

PROCUREMENT: Front-End Loader, With 6.0 C.Y. General
Purpose Bucket or Equivalent

ISSUE DATE: August 16, 2012

CLOSING DATE: September 20, 2012

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

Flint Equipment Company
$193,800.79

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of

Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: October 25, 2012

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



BID # : B13011-09/20/12S
Front-End Loader, With 6.0 C.Y. General Purpose Bucket or Equivalent

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

ASC Construction Equipment

Flint Equipment Company Blanchard Machinery USA, Inc.
Item | Qty | UM Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
Cost of Front-End Loader,
With 6.0 C.Y. General
1 1 EA |Purpose Bucket or Equivalent| $ 212,197.00 | $ 212,197.00 [ $ 249,720.00 | $ 249,720.00 No Bid
Trade In or Purchase on a
2 1 EA (2008 Caterpillar 938-H $ (70,000.00)| $ (70,000.00)[ $ (77,000.00)| $ (77,000.00) No Bid
Guaranteed Buy Back: 7,500
Hours 60 months old,
3A 1 LT |whichever is greater $ 118,500.00 | $ 118,500.00 | $  85,000.00 | $ 85,000.00 No Bid
Guaranteed Buy Back: 8,500
Hours 72 months old,
3B 1 LT |whichever is greater $ 107,000.00 | $ 107,000.00 | $  65,000.00 | $ 65,000.00 No Bid
Guaranteed Buy Back: 9,500
Hours 84 months old,
3C 1 LT |whichever is greater $ 96,000.00 [ $ 96,000.00 [$ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 No Bid
TM & R 7500 Hours/5 Years:
4A 1 LT [Yearl $ 8,330.00 | $ 8,330.00 | $ 10,428.00 | $ 10,428.00 No Bid
TM & R 7500 Hours/5 Years:
4B 1 LT |Year2 $ 8,330.00 | $ 8,330.00 | $ 10,428.00 | $ 10,428.00 No Bid
TM & R 7500 Hours/5 Years:
4C 1 LT [Year3 $ 8,330.00 | $ 8,330.00 | $ 10,428.00 | $ 10,428.00 No Bid
TM & R 7500 Hours/5 Years:
4D 1 LT |Year4 $ 8,330.00 | $ 8,330.00 | $ 10,428.00 | $ 10,428.00 No Bid
TM & R 7500 Hours/5 Years:
4E 1 LT |[Year5 $ 8,330.00 | $ 8,330.00 | $ 10,428.00 | $ 10,428.00 No Bid
Subtotal $ 183,847.00 $ 224,860.00 No Bid
Taxes $ 12,869.29 $ 15,740.20 No Bid
Total $ 196,716.29 $ 240,600.20 No Bid

*ASC Construction Equipment USA, Inc. submitted a no bid because they were unable to meet the specifications.
Bids Received: September 20, 2012 @ 3:30 PM

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer




