
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 
 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  C12019-03/14/12S 
 

PROCUREMENT:     BUNKER GEAR 
 

ISSUE DATE:      FEBRUARY 17, 2012 
  

CLOSING DATE:     MARCH 14, 2012 
 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Safe Industries 

$122,793.20 per fiscal year 
 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 
 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 
 

Posted:  March 16, 2012 
 

 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 
 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



BID # : C12019-03/14/12S

BUNKER AND STRUCTURAL GEAR – TERM CONTRACT

Item Qty U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost

1 50 sets Structure Gear No Bid 1,572.00$        78,600.00$            

2 30 pair Suspenders No Bid 18.00$             540.00$                

3 50 pair Shelby 5280 Gloves No Bid 55.00$             2,750.00$             

4 50 pair Shelby 5228 Gloves No Bid 51.50$             2,575.00$             

5 50 pair Boots 279.00$           13,950.00$            

6 50 each Helmets No Bid 258.00$           12,900.00$            

7 50 each Flash Hoods No Bid 18.50$             925.00$                

8 36 each

ESS Innerzone 2 

Goggles No Bid 36.50$             1,314.00$             

9 36 each

ESS Innerzone 

23Goggles No Bid 33.50$             1,206.00$             

Subtotal 114,760.00$          

Taxes 8,033.20$             

Total 122,793.20$          

Bids Received: March 14, 2012 @ 3:00 PM

Angela M. Seymour

Procurement Officer

Did Not Meet Specifications

Did Not Meet Specifications

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

 Southeast Fire Rescue Supplies Safe Industries

Did Not Meet Specifications

Did Not Meet Specifications


