COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES
THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: C13007-10/26/12B

PROCUREMENT: EMS Disposable Medical Supplies - Term
Contract

AMOUNT OF AWARD: Approx. $31,535.65 (including tax)

ISSUE DATE: October 10, 2012

CLOSING DATE: October 26, 2012

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

QuadMed, Inc.: Estimate annual award - $2,650.41
Items: #19, 20, 21, 22, 25, 26, and 30

Bound Tree Medical: Estimate annual award - $12,144.25
Items: # 1, 2, 3, 4, 16, and 24

Kentron Medical: Estimate annual award - $14,994.90
Items: #11, 12, 15, and 17

Henry Schein: Estimate annual award - $439.30
Items: # 6, 23, 27, 28 and 31

Midwest Medical: Estimate annual award - $1,216.79
Items: #5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 13, and 18

Vermed, Inc.: Estimate annual award - $90.00
Item # 32

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of
Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Jo Marie Brown, CPPB
Procurement Officer

Posted: November 2, 2012

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



C13007-10/26/12B

EMS Disposable MEDICAL SUPPLIES - TERM CONTRACT

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

C13007
JMB
10/26/2012

Henry Schein Quadmed Kentron Bound Tree
Item #|Quantity [Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 1,500 |Providone iodine prep pads 0.0400 $60.00 0.0337 $50.55 No Bid No Bid 0.0327 $490.05
2 20,000 [Alcohol prep pads, med 0.0200 $400.00 0.0070 $140.00 0.0090 $180.00 0.0065 $129.00
3 11,000 |Tegraderm trans dressing 0.3400( $3,740.00 0.2881 $288.10 0.2950| $3,245.00 0.2497| $2,746.70
4 5,400 |Drip set 10 drop, 108306 1.5100 $8,154.00 1.4300 $7,722.00 No Bid No Bid 1.3100f $7,074.00
5 20 Drip set 60 drop, 608306 1.5700 $31.40 1.5700 $31.40 No Bid No Bid 1.4700 $29.40
6 20 Syringe, latex free, 60ml 0.3600 $7.20 0.4392 $8.78 No Bid No Bid| 11.8700 $11.87
7 150 |Syringe, latex free, 20ml 0.2400 $36.00 0.2018 $30.27 No Bid No Bid 0.4000 $64.00
8 400 |Syringe, latex free, 10ml 0.1000 $40.00 0.0935 $37.40 No Bid No Bid 0.1093 $43.72
9 400 |[Syringe, latex free, 5ml 0.0900 $36.00 0.0877 $35.08 No Bid No Bid 0.1200 $48.00
10 200 [Syringe, latex free, 3ml 0.0700 $14.00 0.0658 $13.16 No Bid No Bid 0.0800 $16.00
11 600 |3M surg. tape, 1/2" x 10 yd 0.5700 $342.00 0.2925 $175.50 0.2460 $147.60 0.5954 $357.25
12 300 |3M surg. tape, 1" x 10 yd 0.9300| $2,790.00 0.5850 $175.50 0.4900 $147.00 1.1341 $340.25
13 10,000 |Disp. L-F 1" tourniquet 0.1000| $1,000.00 0.0994 $994.00 0.0890 $890.00 0.0700 $700.00
14 50 IV catheter, 25g, butterfly 0.9200 $46.00 0.3860 $19.30 No Bid No Bid 0.2100 $10.50
15 30 OB kit poly bagged 6.1700 $185.10 4.8900 $146.70 5.9900 $179.70 8.3600 $250.80
16 50 Oxygen cylinder wrench 1.5300 $76.50 1.9900 $99.50 1.5900 $79.50 1.1300 $56.50
17 20,000 [EMS fitted stretcher sheets 0.8100( $16,200.00 0.8350| $16,700.00 0.7260| $14,520.00 0.7914| $15,828.00
18 2,000 |Disp. Pillowcase, white 0.2700 $540.00 0.4094 $818.80 0.2590 $518.00( 30.0000| $2,400.00
19 12 Rusch pvc NL tube, 12FR 2.5100 $15.06 0.9474 $11.37 No Bid No Bid 2.2700 $27.24
20 6 Rusch pvc NL tube, 14FR 2.5100 $30.12 0.9474 $5.68 No Bid No Bid 2.2700 $13.62
21 12 Rusch pvc NL tube, 16FR 2.5100 $30.12 0.9474 $11.37 No Bid No Bid 2.2700 $27.24
22 25 iTec Mfg Code strap No Bid No Bid 2.6300 $65.75 No Bid No Bid 2.7500 $68.75
23 30 Moore Eco. Limb restraints 2.7600 $82.80 2.8070 $84.21 No Bid No Bid 3.1500 $94.50
Microstream Etco?2 Filterline
24 200 |Set Adult/Pediatric Philips MRX 8.6400| $1,728.00 9.1696 $1,833.92 No Bid No Bid 8.2400| $1,648.00




Microstream Etco?2 Filterline

25 25 Set Infant Philips MRX 16.8300 $420.75( 10.3500 $258.75 No Bid No Bid| 10.3700 $259.25
MedSource Yankauer Suction

26 20 Tip 0.4900 $171.50 0.3743 $130.99 0.3900 $136.50 0.4900 $171.50
LMA MAD Nasal Intranasal

27 100 |Mucosal 2.4100 $241.00 3.1345 $313.45 No Bid No Bid 2.9900 $299.00

28 10 Dukal N-95 surgical Mask 0.3800 $76.00 0.0656 $13.12 0.4900 $98.00 0.7260 $14.52

29 200 |Kendall Sharps Container 2.5100 $502.00 4.3041 $860.82[No Bid No Bid 4.3700 $874.00
King Airway LTS-D Laryngeal
Tube Kit with Lube and Syringe

30 70 Sizes4 and 5 No Bid No Bid| 30.9500| $2,166.50{No Bid No Bid 31.1000| $2,177.00

31 50 SAS Safety Glass, clear plastic 0.7900 $39.50 3.8713 $193.57|No Bid No Bid 0.9900 $49.50
Kendall Meditrace Pediatric

32 200 |Electrodes 0.4600 $92.00 0.4795 $95.90|No Bid No Bid 0.3500 $70.00

Southeastern World Medical
MMS Emergency Equipment|Government Solutions Vermed
Item #| Quantity Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 10 Providone iodine prep pads 0.0352 $52.80 0.0360 $54.00 0.0400 $60.00

2 150 |Alcohol prep pads, med 0.0069 $138.00 0.0070 $140.00 0.0100 $200.00

3 90 Tegraderm trans dressing 0.3412| $3,753.20 0.2200( $2,420.00 0.4400( $4,840.00

4 5,400 |Drip set 10 drop, 108306 1.6500| $8,910.00 1.7100( $9,234.00 2.9000( $11,286.00

5 12 Drip set 60 drop, 608306 1.2500 $25.00 1.3100 $26.20 2.1900 $43.80

6 20 Syringe, latex free, 60ml 0.4000 $8.00 0.4100 $8.20 0.3700 $7.40

7 150 [Syringe, latex free, 20ml 0.1971 $29.57 0.2100 $31.50 0.3000 $45.00

8 400 Syringe, latex free, 10ml 0.0784 $31.36 0.1100 $44.00 0.2500 $100.00

9 400 |Syringe, latex free, 5ml 0.0682 $27.28 0.0900 $36.00 0.1100 $44.00

10 200 |[Syringe, latex free, 3ml 0.0414 $8.28 0.0600 $12.00 0.0700 $14.00

11 25 3M surg. tape, 1/2" x 10 yd 0.4200 $252.00 0.2400 $144.00 1.4900 $864.00

12 25 3M surg. tape, 1" x 10 yd 0.8400 $252.00 0.4900 $147.00 1.4300 $429.00

13 10,000 |Disp. L-F 1" tourniquet 0.0660 $660.00 0.0900 $900.00 0.1400| $1,400.00

14 2 IV catheter, 25g, butterfly 0.2100 $10.50 0.4600 $23.00 No Bid No Bid

15 25 OB kit poly bagged 6.3000 $189.00 4.4100 $132.30 6.9400 $208.20

16 50 Oxygen cylinder wrench 2.5300 $126.50 1.2100 $60.50 1.1500 $57.50

17 20,000 [EMS fitted stretcher sheets 1.0000( $20,000.00 0.9200( $18,400.00 No Bid No Bid

18 2,000 [Disp. Pillowcase, white 0.2124 $424.80 0.2900 $580.00 0.2100 $420.00

19 12 Rusch pvc NL tube, 12FR 1.7700 $21.24 1.0200 $12.24 1.0000 $12.00

20 6 Rusch pvc NL tube, 14FR 1.7700 $10.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 12 Rusch pvc NL tube, 16FR 1.7700 $21.24 1.0200 $12.24 1.0000 $1.00




22 25 iTec Mfg Code strap 2.8100 $70.25 2.7100 $67.75 No Bid No Bid

23 30 Moore Eco. Limb restraints 3.0200 $90.60 4.5900 $137.70 No Bid No Bid
Microstream Etco?2 Filterline

24 200 |Set Adult/Pediatric Philips MRX No Bid No Bid 8.3100( $1,662.00( 14.7800| $2,956.00
Microstream Etco?2 Filterline

25 25 Set Infant Philips MRX No Bid No Bid| 16.4300 $410.75 No Bid No Bid
MedSource Yankauer Suction

26 20 Tip 0.4200 $147.00 0.0390 $136.50 0.6800 $238.00
LMA MAD Nasal Intranasal

27 100 |Mucosal 3.1000 $310.00 3.4100 $341.00 No Bid No Bid

28 10 Dukal N-95 surgical Mask 0.6850 $137.00 0.4400 $88.00 0.8400 $1.68

29 200 |Kendall Sharps Container 3.9600 $792.00 2.7600 $552.00 3.7800 $756.00
King Airway LTS-D Laryngeal
Tube Kit with Lube and Syringe

30 70 Sizes4 and 5 No Bid No Bid| 33.9800| $2,378.60 No Bid No Bid

31 50 SAS Safety Glass, clear plastic 1.3000 $65.00 0.8600 $43.00 No Bid No Bid
Kendall Meditrace Pediatric

32 200 |Electrodes 0.4800 $96.00 0.4635 $92.70 0.5000 $100.00 0.1500 $90.00

Home Aid Healthcare
Item #| Quantity Description Unit Price Total

1 10 Providone iodine prep pads 0.5890 $883.50

2 150 |Alcohol prep pads, med 0.0070 $140.00

3 90 Tegraderm trans dressing 1.0700| $11,770.00

4 5,400 [Drip set 10 drop, 108306 No Bid No Bid

5 12 Drip set 60 drop, 608306 No Bid No Bid

6 20 Syringe, latex free, 60ml 0.5800 $11.60

7 150 [Syringe, latex free, 20ml 0.2200 $33.00

8 400 |Syringe, latex free, 10ml 0.1660 $66.40

9 400 |Syringe, latex free, 5ml 0.0780 $31.20

10 200 |Syringe, latex free, 3ml 0.0930 $18.60

11 25 3M surg. tape, 1/2" x 10 yd 0.6100 $366.00

12 25 3M surg. tape, 1" x 10 yd 0.7200 $216.00

13 10,000 |Disp. L-F 1" tourniquet No Bid No Bid

14 2 IV catheter, 25¢, butterfly No Bid No Bid

15 25 OB kit poly bagged 8.7000 $261.00

16 50 Oxygen cylinder wrench No Bid No Bid

17 20,000 [EMS fitted stretcher sheets No Bid No Bid

18 2,000 [Disp. Pillowcase, white 0.2000 $400.00

19 12 Rusch pvc NL tube, 12FR No Bid No Bid




20 6 Rusch pvc NL tube, 14FR No Bid No Bid

21 12 Rusch pvc NL tube, 16FR No Bid No Bid
22 25 iTec Mfg Code strap No Bid No Bid
23 30 Moore Eco. Limb restraints No Bid No Bid

Microstream Etco2 Filterline

24 200 |Set Adult/Pediatric Philips MRX No Bid No Bid
Microstream Etco2 Filterline

25 25 Set Infant Philips MRX No Bid No Bid
MedSource Yankauer Suction

26 20 Tip No Bid No Bid
LMA MAD Nasal Intranasal

27 100 |Mucosal 4.9800 $498.00

28 10 Dukal N-95 surgical Mask No Bid No Bid

29 200 Kendall Sharps Container 6.0000 $1,200.00

King Airway LTS-D Laryngeal
Tube Kit with Lube and Syringe

30 70 Sizes4 and 5 No Bid No Bid

31 50 SAS Safety Glass, clear plastic No Bid No Bid
Kendall Meditrace Pediatric

32 200 |Electrodes 0.7600 $152.00

*#3- awarded to Boundtree as item Southeastern Emergency Equipment bid is an inferior product and does not perform well.

*#11- awarded to Kentron as item Southeastern Emergency Equipment bid is an inferior product and does not perform well.

*#14- tie bid between Boundtree and MMS. Low bidder (MMS) was chosen by coin toss

*#15-Kentron is awarded item as Quadmed and Southeastern did not bid item as listed. Kit needs to hold umblical scissors and only holds scapel.
*#28- Quadmed bid item incorrectly. Item awarded to Henry Schein

*#29- not awarded

Bids Opened: October 26, 2012 at 3:00 PM

Jo Marie Brown, CPPB
Procurement Officer
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