
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  C13024-06/20/13S 

 

PROCUREMENT: Work Uniforms 

 

ISSUE DATE:      May 17, 2013 

 

CLOSING DATE:     June 20, 2013 

 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

American Hotel Register 

$30,849.57 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  July 26, 2013 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



BID # : C13024-06/20/13S 

Work Uniforms

Item Qty U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost

1 300 EA Pants, Industrial, Mens 13.00$            3,900.00$              13.99$                  4,197.00$           13.18$              3,954.00$           

2 30 EA

Pants, Industrial, Mens Relaxed 

Fit 13.00$            390.00$                 13.99$                  419.70$              11.25$              337.50$              

3 15 EA Shorts, Industrial, Mens 10.93$            163.95$                 12.50$                  187.50$              10.41$              156.15$              

4 64 EA Coveralls, Action Back 48.61$            3,111.04$              25.00$                  1,600.00$           19.35$              1,238.40$           

5 64 EA Coveralls,  Insulated 129.27$          8,273.28$              NO BID 37.58$              2,405.12$           

6 245 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, Mens 

Long Sleeve 9.18$              2,249.10$              14.50$                  3,552.50$           9.24$                2,263.80$           

7 245 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, Mens 

Short Sleeve 7.62$              1,866.90$              13.99$                  3,427.55$           7.76$                1,901.20$           

8 25 EA

Shirt, Stripes, Industrial, 

Mens Long Sleeve 11.21$            280.25$                 14.99$                  374.75$              12.29$              307.25$              

9 25 EA

Shirt, Stripes, Industrial, 

Mens Short Sleeve 9.60$              240.00$                 14.50$                  362.50$              9.25$                231.25$              

10 10 EA

Shirt, Jersey Knit, Mens Short 

Sleeve 17.01$            170.10$                 14.99$                  149.90$              10.77$              107.70$              

11 117 EA Jacket w/liner, Panel-front 25.53$            2,987.01$              29.00$                  3,393.00$           19.90$              2,328.30$           

12 70 EA Jacket, Hooded, Duck 47.31$            3,311.70$              49.50$                  3,465.00$           41.79$              2,925.30$           

13 50 EA Pants, Industrial, Womens 14.04$            702.00$                 14.25$                  712.50$              13.39$              669.50$              

14 30 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, 

Womens Long Sleeve 11.18$            335.40$                 17.00$                  510.00$              10.12$              303.60$              

15 30 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, 

Womens Short Sleeve 9.25$              277.50$                 15.00$                  450.00$              8.35$                250.50$              

16 25 EA

Smock, Loose, 3/4 Length 

Sleeve 13.14$            328.50$                 19.00$                  475.00$              11.76$              294.00$              

17 15 EA

Smock, Loose, 1/2 Length 

Sleeve 10.45$            156.75$                 17.00$                  255.00$              10.59$              158.85$              

18 13 EA Men's Parka 96.28$            1,251.64$              NO BID 67.00$              871.00$              

19 70 EA Hooded Jacket 60.70$            4,249.00$              NO BID 38.99$              2,729.30$           

20 15 EA Pants, Industrial, Mens 14.89$            223.35$                 18.50$                  277.50$              15.51$              232.65$              

21 50 EA Belt 11.65$            582.50$                 12.25$                  612.50$              10.82$              541.00$              

22 500 EA Emblem, Name/Logo 0.75$              375.00$                 3.75$                     1,875.00$           6.25$                3,125.00$           

23 500 EA County Emblem -$                No Charge 2.75$                     1,375.00$           3.00$                1,500.00$           

24 1 LT Catalog Discount 0.00% 20.00% 0.00%

Subtotal 35,424.97$            27,671.90$         28,831.37$         

Tax 2,479.75$              1,937.03$           2,018.20$           

Total 37,904.72$            29,608.93$         30,849.57$         

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Rental Uniform Service Aramark Uniform Services** American Hotel Register



Item Qty U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost

1 300 EA Pants, Industrial, Mens 12.75$            3,825.00$              14.76$                  4,428.00$           

2 30 EA

Pants, Industrial, Mens Relaxed 

Fit NO BID NO BID 18.92$                  567.60$              

3 15 EA Shorts, Industrial, Mens NO BID NO BID 11.36$                  170.40$              

4 64 EA Coveralls, Action Back 64.50$            4,128.00$              48.00$                  3,072.00$           

5 64 EA Coveralls,  Insulated 97.50$            6,240.00$              160.00$                10,240.00$         

6 245 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, Mens 

Long Sleeve 12.25$            3,001.25$              9.75$                     2,388.75$           

7 245 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, Mens 

Short Sleeve 12.00$            2,940.00$              8.10$                     1,984.50$           

8 25 EA

Shirt, Stripes, Industrial, 

Mens Long Sleeve NO BID NO BID 12.40$                  310.00$              

9 25 EA

Shirt, Stripes, Industrial, 

Mens Short Sleeve NO BID NO BID 10.65$                  266.25$              

10 10 EA

Shirt, Jersey Knit, Mens Short 

Sleeve NO BID NO BID 10.00$                  100.00$              

11 117 EA Jacket w/liner, Panel-front NO BID NO BID 26.75$                  3,129.75$           

12 70 EA Jacket, Hooded, Duck NO BID NO BID 47.25$                  3,307.50$           

13 50 EA Pants, Industrial, Womens 13.00$            650.00$                 15.60$                  780.00$              

14 30 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, 

Womens Long Sleeve NO BID 11.19$                  335.70$              

15 30 EA

Shirt, Poplin, Industrial, 

Womens Short Sleeve NO BID 9.25$                     277.50$              

16 25 EA

Smock, Loose, 3/4 Length 

Sleeve NO BID 13.10$                  327.50$              

17 15 EA

Smock, Loose, 1/2 Length 

Sleeve NO BID 11.45$                  171.75$              

18 13 EA Men's Parka NO BID 101.00$                1,313.00$           

19 70 EA Hooded Jacket NO BID 63.00$                  4,410.00$           

20 15 EA Pants, Industrial, Mens NO BID 19.00$                  285.00$              

21 50 EA Belt NO BID 13.50$                  675.00$              

22 500 EA Emblem, Name/Logo 3.75$              1,875.00$              1.50$                     750.00$              

23 500 EA County Patch/Emblems 1.50$              750.00$                 1.75$                     875.00$              

24 1 LT Catalog Discount 0.00% 5.00%

Subtotal 23,409.25$            40,165.20$         

Tax 1,638.65$              2,811.56$           

Total 25,047.90$            42,976.76$         

Bids Received: June 20, 2013 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour

Procurement Officer

Award made only to one vendor. Per bid document - Contract may be awarded to one or more vendors; whichever is most advantageous to the County.

** NOTE : Vendors did not bid on all items.

Just in Trend** Lesesne Industries, Inc.


