COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

STATEMENT OF AWARD
SOLICITATION NUMBER: C14009-10/09/13S
PROJECT TITLE: Police Supplies — Term Contract
AWARDED TO: Lawmen’s Safety
AMOUNT OF AWARD: $15,146.41
DATE OF AWARD: October 28, 2013

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: October 28, 2013

THIS ISNOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



BID # : C14009-10/09/13S
Police Supplies

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Lawmen's Safety Supply, Inc.| Everest Tactical Solutions, Dana Safety Supply DBA
Item | Qty | UM Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost
Keeper, Safariland plain black 62-
1 12 EA |2HS $ 6.11] $ 7332 % 639 | $ 76.68 No Bid
Double Mag pouch 77-83-41 HS
Safariland plain black STX,
2 30 EA [Concealed snap $ 2237 | $ 671.10 | $ 2325 | $ 697.50 No Bid
Double Mag Pouch 79-83-2HS
3 30 EA [Slimline Open Top plain black $ 1651 | $ 495.30 | $ 17.18 | $ 515.40 No Bid
Cuff case 190-41 Safariland plain
4 60 EA |black STX, Concealed snap $ 20.56 | $ 1,233.60 | $ 2136 | $ 1,281.60 No Bid
OC holder STX Plain black with
hidden snap for MK-3 OC STX,
5 40 EA [Concealed snap $ 1667 | $ 666.80 | $ 2021 | $ 808.40 No Bid
Glove pouch 332V, Safariland
6 | 30 | EA |plain black, Velcro closure $ 13713 41130 | $ 1256 | $ 376.80 No Bid
STX Plain black for Stinger DS
LED plain black STX, Concealed
7 30 EA [shap $ 2064 | $ 619.20 | $ 16.60 | $ 498.00 No Bid
SLS duty 6280 holster Safariland
8 20 EA |plain black STX, Concealed snap | $ 62.23 | $ 1,244.60 | $ 70.59 | $ 1,411.80 No Bid
ALS duty 7360 holster Safariland
plain black STX, Concealed snap
9 10 EA |7360-83-411/412 $ 66.90 | $ 669.00 | $ 7027 | $ 702.70 No Bid
ALS duty 6365 holster Safariland
10 10 | EA [plain black STX, Concealed snap | $ 8250 | $ 825.00 | $ 86.69 | $ 866.90 No Bid
ALS duty 6378 holster Safariland
11 10 EA [plain black STX, Concealed snap | $ 26.14 | $ 26140 | $ 3118 $ 311.80 No Bid
Gould & Goodrich Gold Line
B803, three slot pancake holster,
12 20 EA |black $ 3695 | $ 739.00 | $ 3871 | $ 77420 | $ 36.50| $ 730.00
Fobus CU9GBH Cuff mag combo
13 20 EA [belt holder, Glock 9/40 $ 1995 | $ 399.00 | $ 1830 | $ 366.00 | $ 16.50| $ 330.00
Leather Buckleless belt system
(inner belt and 2.25"duty belt)
Safariland or Gould & Gouldrich
14 30 EA |only $ 7193 | $ 2,157.90 | $ 74.05 | $ 2,221.50 | $ 77.25| $ 2,317.50
Web Duty belt, #8100 Bianchi
15 40 EA |Patrol Tek nylon $ 15.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1488 | $ 595.20 No Bid
Nylon Liner Inner Belt, #8105
16 40 EA [Bianchi Patrol Tek nylon $ 1095 | $ 438.00 | $ 1096 | $ 438.40 No Bid
Covered cuff case #8000 Bianchi
17 40 EA |Patrol Tek nylon $ 9.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 9.25| % 370.00 No Bid
OC spray pouch #8007 Bianchi
18 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 9.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 9.25| $ 370.00 No Bid
Radio holder #8014S Bianchi
19 40 EA |Patrol Tek nylon $ 18.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 1839 | $ 735.60 No Bid
Pager/glove pouch #8015 Bianchi
20 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 750 | $ 300.00 | $ 765 $ 306.00 No Bid
Key holder #8016 Bianchi Patrol
21 40 EA |Tek nylon $ 675 $ 270.00 | $ 692 $ 276.80 No Bid
Mini-Light holder #8010 Bianchi
22 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 8.40 | $ 336.00 | $ 852 | $ 340.80 No Bid
23 20 EA |Customize-Kit Spacer Kit $ 1525 [ $ 305.00 | $ 16.46 | $ 329.20 No Bid
Subtotal $ 14,155.52 $ 14,671.28 $ 3,377.50
Tax $ 990.89 $ 1,026.99 $ 236.43
Total $ 15,146.41 $ 15,698.27 $ 3,613.93




CPR Savers and First Aid

Designlab, Inc. Supply
Item | Qty | UM Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost

Keeper, Safariland plain black 62-

1 12 EA |2HS $ 790 | $ 94.80 | $ 651 | $ 78.12
Double Mag pouch 77-83-41 HS
Safariland plain black STX,

2 30 EA |Concealed snap $ 2415 | $ 72450 | $ 23.82 | $ 714.60
Double Mag Pouch 79-83-2HS

3 30 EA [Slimline Open Top plain black $ 1811 | $ 543.30 | $ 1759 | $ 527.70

Cuff case 190-41 Safariland plain
4 60 EA |black STX, Concealed snap $ 2228 | $ 1,336.80 | $ 2189 | $ 1,313.40

OC holder STX Plain black with
hidden snap for MK-3 OC STX,

5 40 EA [Concealed snhap $ 2285 | $ 914.00 | $ 2071 [ $ 828.40
Glove pouch 332V, Safariland
6 30 EA [plain black, Velcro closure $ 1351 $ 405.30 | $ 1287 | $ 386.10

STX Plain black for Stinger DS
LED plain black STX, Concealed
7 30 EA |shap $ 1929 | $ 578.70 | $ 17.02 | $ 510.60

SLS duty 6280 holster Safariland
8 20 EA [plain black STX, Concealed snap | $ 67.41 | $ 1,348.20 | $ 7231 | $ 1,446.20

ALS duty 7360 holster Safariland
plain black STX, Concealed snap
9 10 | EA |7360-83-411/412 $ 7695 | $ 769.50 | $ 7198 | $ 719.80

ALS duty 6365 holster Safariland
10 10 EA [plain black STX, Concealedsnap | $ 133.79 | $ 1,337.90 | $ 88.74 | $ 887.40

ALS duty 6378 holster Safariland
11 10 | EA |plain black STX, Concealed shap | $ 3205 | $ 32050 | $ 3196 | $ 319.60

Gould & Goodrich Gold Line
B803, three slot pancake holster,
12 20 EA |black $ 47.78 | $ 955.60 | $ 4339 [ $ 867.80

Fobus CU9GBH Cuff mag combo
13 20 | EA |belt holder, Glock 9/40 $ 2228 | $ 445.60 | $ 20.17 | $ 403.40

Leather Buckleless belt system
(inner belt and 2.25"duty belt)
Safariland or Gould & Gouldrich

14 30 EA |[only $ 51.74 | $ 1,552.20 | $ 85.34 [ $ 2,560.20
Web Duty belt, #8100 Bianchi
15 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 1581 | $ 632.40 | $ 1524 | $ 609.60
Nylon Liner Inner Belt, #8105
16 40 EA [Bianchi Patrol Tek nylon $ 1193 | $ 477.20 | $ 11.24 | $ 449.60
Covered cuff case #8000 Bianchi
17 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 9911 % 39640 | $ 9471 % 378.80
OC spray pouch #8007 Bianchi
18 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 9911 % 39640 | $ 9471 % 378.80
Radio holder #8014S Bianchi
19 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 1883 | $ 753.20 | $ 1879 | $ 751.60
Pager/glove pouch #8015 Bianchi
20 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 8481 % 339.20 | $ 7841 % 313.60
Key holder #8016 Bianchi Patrol
21 40 EA [Tek nylon $ 7761 % 31040 | $ 7101 $ 284.00
Mini-Light holder #8010 Bianchi
22 40 EA [Patrol Tek nylon $ 934 $ 373.60 | $ 873 $ 349.20
23 20 EA |Customize-Kit Spacer Kit $ 3.18( $ 63.60 | $ 1687 | $ 337.40
Subtotal $ 15,069.30 $ 15,415.92
Tax $ 1,054.85 $ 1,079.11
Total $ 16,124.15 $ 16,495.03

** Craig's Firearm Supply withdrew their bid.
** THE COUNTY HAS DECIDED TO EXERCISE THE OPTION TO AWARD THIS CONTRACT TO A SOLE VENDOR AS PER PAGES 6 & 13.
Bids Received: October 9, 2013 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer



