
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON 

Procurement Services 
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

 

 

STATEMENT OF AWARD 

 

 

SOLICITATION NUMBER:  C14016-02/06/14S 

 

PROJECT TITLE: SAFETY/WORK BOOTS & SHOES – TERM CONTRACT 

 

AWARDED TO: Tyler Brothers 

 

AMOUNT OF AWARD:  $23,414.81 

  

DATE OF AWARD:   February 28, 2014 

 

 

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County. 

 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  March 3, 2014 

 

 

 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 



BID # : C14016-02/06/14S

SAFETY/WORK BOOTS & SHOES – TERM CONTRACT 

Item Qty U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost

1 97 EA BOOTS, Red Wing #4473      139.00$           13,483.00$       

2 2 EA BOOTS, Red Wing #4470      149.00$           298.00$           

3 1 EA BOOTS, Red Wing #2214    159.00$           159.00$           

4 2 EA BOOTS, Red Wing #2240     119.00$           238.00$           

5 4 EA BOOTS, Georgia # G9644      119.00$           476.00$           

6 2 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G6644      119.00$           238.00$           

7 1 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G6683      No Bid

8 1 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G4713      No Bid

9 2 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G111      89.00$             178.00$           

10 1 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G5603      No Bid

11 1 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G6395     99.00$             99.00$             

12 1 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G3334     No Bid

13 1 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G5334      No Bid

14 2 EA BOOTS, Georgia #G4313      No Bid

15 2 EA BOOTS, Rocky #6173     89.00$             178.00$           

16 1 EA BOOTS, Rocky #6545      No Bid

17 3 EA BOOTS, Rocky #6415     99.00$             297.00$           

18 2 EA BOOTS, Rocky #6547      No Bid

19 8 EA BOOTS, Rocky #6114      109.00$           872.00$           

20 2 EA BOOTS, Rocky #6167      89.00$             178.00$           

21 2 EA BOOTS, Timberland #26078  109.00$           218.00$           

22 2 EA BOOTS, Timberland #85594 119.00$           238.00$           

23 5 EA BOOTS, Timberland #50507 99.00$             495.00$           

24 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #26002 99.00$             99.00$             

25 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #47019  119.00$           119.00$           

26 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #65016  89.00$             89.00$             

27 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #26064 89.00$             89.00$             

28 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #47028 89.00$             89.00$             

29 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #87566 129.00$           129.00$           

30 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #87559 99.00$             99.00$             

31 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #89691   99.00$             99.00$             

32 1 EA BOOTS, Timberland #26063 99.00$             99.00$             

33 1 EA BOOTS, Rockport #RK6640    99.00$             99.00$             

34 3 EA BOOTS, Rockport #RK6120    79.00$             237.00$           

35 1 EA SHOES, Rockport #RK6736    79.00$             79.00$             

36 3 EA SHOES, Rockport #RK676    79.00$             237.00$           

37 1 EA SHOES, Rockport #RK6741    89.00$             89.00$             

38 3 EA BOOTS, Carhartt #CMH6370     109.00$           327.00$           

39 2 EA BOOTS, Carhartt #CMF1375 119.00$           238.00$           

40 5 EA BOOTS, Carhartt #CMP1200 119.00$           595.00$           

41 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #6683 99.00$             99.00$             

42 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #10213 99.00$             99.00$             

43 3 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #3295 119.00$           357.00$           

44 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #2053 99.00$             99.00$             

45 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #10100 89.00$             89.00$             

46 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #10082 109.00$           109.00$           

47 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #3294 109.00$           109.00$           

48 1 EA BOOTS, Wolverine #2038 89.00$             89.00$             

49 1 EA BOOTS, CAT #P89981      99.00$             99.00$             

50 2 EA BOOTS, CAT #P89988      99.00$             198.00$           

51 1 EA SHOES, CAT #P89957 79.00$             79.00$             

52 1 EA

Discount off the manufacturer’s 

printed catalog  price list.  

Discount 23%

Subtotal 21,883.00$       

Taxes 1,531.81$        

Total 23,414.81$       

Bids Received: February 6, 2014 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour

Procurement Officer

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Tyler Brothers


