
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  C14017-01/29/14S 

 

PROCUREMENT: POLO/TEE/SWEAT SHIRTS – TERM 

CONTRACT 

 

ISSUE DATE:      December 20, 2014 

 

CLOSING DATE:     January 29, 2014 

 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Item: #  1, 3, 7-11   Diamond Graphic, LLC.    $93,391.72 

 

Item: #  2, 5    Express Press       $3,349.64 

 

Item # 4    J. Paul Company        $935.18 

 

Item: # 6    No Award     No Award 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  July 11, 2014 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



BID # : C14017-01/29/14S
POLO/TEE/SWEAT SHIRTS – TERM CONTRACT

Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 
Lot #1 (Animal Services)

1 40 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500/105)           11.00$              440.00$            15.40$              616.00$            15.53$                621.20$            
Subtotal 440.00$            616.00$            621.20$            
Taxes 30.80$              43.12$              43.48$              
Total 470.80$            659.12$            664.68$            

Lot #2 (Building Services)

1 100 EA SHIRT -  Tee, No pocket, Short 3.75$                375.00$            5.95$                595.00$            5.99$                  599.00$            

2 30 EA SHIRT -  Tee, No pocket, Short 4.12$                123.60$            6.95$                208.50$            5.99$                  179.70$            

3 60 EA
SH+D45IRT - T-Shirt, Short 
Sleeve with Pocket              4.19$                251.40$            5.20$                312.00$            5.25$                  315.00$            

4 10 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500)                   13.00$              130.00$            14.40$              144.00$            15.85$                158.50$            
5 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500)                  13.00$              65.00$              14.40$              72.00$              15.85$                79.25$              
6 20 EA SHIRT -  Sweatshirt                    9.85$                197.00$            13.00$              260.00$            12.10$                242.00$            

Subtotal 1,142.00$         1,591.50$         1,573.45$         
Taxes 79.94$              111.41$            110.14$            
Total 1,221.94$         1,702.91$         1,683.59$         

Lot #3 (Community Development)
1 35 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 13.82$              483.70$            15.95$              558.25$            16.20$                567.00$            
2 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (188) 13.82$              69.10$              17.20$              86.00$              17.55$                87.75$              
3 10 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 19.00$              190.00$            20.35$              203.50$            20.88$                208.80$            
4 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (602) 19.00$              95.00$              20.35$              101.75$            20.88$                104.40$            
5 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (188) 13.82$              69.10$              17.20$              86.00$              17.55$                87.75$              
6 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (S608) 15.00$              75.00$              18.75$              93.75$              19.20$                96.00$              
7 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (TLS608) 15.00$              75.00$              20.00$              100.00$            20.55$                102.75$            
8 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 15.00$              75.00$              18.75$              93.75$              19.20$                96.00$              

Subtotal 1,131.90$         1,323.00$         1,350.45$         
Taxes 79.23$              92.61$              94.53$              
Total 1,211.13$         1,415.61$         1,444.98$         

Lot #4 (Central Stores)

1 200 EA
SHIRT - T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket                  5.54$                1,108.00$         7.15$                1,430.00$         4.85$                  970.00$            
Subtotal 1,108.00$         1,430.00$         970.00$            
Taxes 77.56$              100.10$            67.90$              
Total 1,185.56$         1,530.10$         1,037.90$         

Lot #5 (Public Safety/EMS)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 14.25$              285.00$            17.95$              359.00$            18.20$                364.00$            
2 500 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket 3.97$                1,985.00$         5.90$                2,950.00$         5.60$                  2,800.00$         
3 35 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket 4.25$                148.75$            4.40$                154.00$            5.25$                  183.75$            
4 30 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 4.00$                120.00$            7.85$                235.50$            7.35$                  220.50$            
5 30 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 4.67$                140.10$            6.85$                205.50$            7.35$                  220.50$            

Subtotal 2,678.85$         3,904.00$         3,788.75$         
Taxes 187.52$            273.28$            265.21$            
Total 2,866.37$         4,177.28$         4,053.96$         

LOT #6 (Public Safety/Fire Service) - NO AWARD
1 800 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 3.10$                2,480.00$         5.60$                4,480.00$         5.10$                  4,080.00$         
2 50 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410) 19.40$              970.00$            25.50$              1,275.00$         27.90$                1,395.00$         

Subtotal 3,450.00$         5,755.00$         5,475.00$         
Taxes 241.50$            402.85$            383.25$            
Total 3,691.50$         6,157.85$         5,858.25$         

LOT #7 (Information Services)
1 38 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 11.00$              418.00$            14.90$              566.20$            15.90$                604.20$            

Subtotal 418.00$            566.20$            604.20$            
Taxes 29.26$              39.63$              42.29$              
Total 447.26$            605.83$            646.49$            

LOT #8 (Public Safety/Communications)
1 60 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS410) 19.40$              1,164.00$         23.00$              1,380.00$         23.90$                1,434.00$         
2 60 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS411) 19.40$              1,164.00$         23.00$              1,380.00$         23.90$                1,434.00$         

Subtotal 2,328.00$         2,760.00$         2,868.00$         
Taxes 162.96$            193.20$            200.76$            
Total 2,490.96$         2,953.20$         3,068.76$         

Lesense Industries

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Diamond Graphic, LLC. Designlab, Inc.



LOT #9 (Sheriff’s Department)
1 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 10.00$              600.00$            14.40$              864.00$            No Bid
2 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500LS) 14.00$              840.00$            19.75$              1,185.00$         No Bid
3 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 13.82$              829.20$            16.95$              1,017.00$         No Bid
4 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 19.00$              1,140.00$         21.35$              1,281.00$         No Bid
5 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500) 13.00$              780.00$            15.40$              924.00$            No Bid
6 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500LS) 14.32$              859.20$            19.75$              1,185.00$         No Bid
7 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 14.25$              855.00$            16.95$              1,017.00$         No Bid
8 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (602) 19.00$              1,140.00$         21.35$              1,281.00$         No Bid
9 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 30.00$              11,250.00$       27.65$              10,368.75$       No Bid

10 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 32.00$              12,000.00$       31.40$              11,775.00$       No Bid
11 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 32.00$              12,000.00$       27.65$              10,368.75$       No Bid
12 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 32.00$              12,000.00$       31.40$              11,775.00$       No Bid
13 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S608) 15.00$              300.00$            18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
14 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S508) 15.00$              300.00$            18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
15 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (TLS608) 15.00$              75.00$              20.00$              100.00$            No Bid
16 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L508) 15.00$              300.00$            18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
17 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 15.00$              300.00$            18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
18 375 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS410) 18.40$              6,900.00$         26.00$              9,750.00$         No Bid
19 375 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS410LS) 24.00$              9,000.00$         29.75$              11,156.25$       No Bid
20 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS411) 18.40$              6,900.00$         26.00$              9,750.00$         No Bid

Subtotal 78,368.40$       85,297.75$       No Bid
Taxes 5,485.79$         5,970.84$         No Bid
Total 83,854.19$       91,268.59$       No Bid

LOT#10 (Public Works)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 11.00$              220.00$            14.90$              298.00$            15.90$                318.00$            
2 24 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 13.82$              331.68$            16.45$              394.80$            17.55$                421.20$            

Subtotal 551.68$            692.80$            739.20$            
Taxes 38.62$              48.50$              51.74$              
Total 590.30$            741.30$            790.94$            

LOT #11 (Solid Waste Management)

1 60 EA
SHIRT - Tee with Pocket 
3W700 SG 14.50$              870.00$            15.70$              942.00$            No Bid

2 60 EA
SHIRT - Tee with Pocket 
3W710SG 14.50$              870.00$            16.65$              999.00$            No Bid

3 60 EA Sweatshirt 9.15$                549.00$            12.25$              735.00$            No Bid
4 60 EA Hooded Sweatshirt 14.25$              855.00$            18.60$              1,116.00$         No Bid
5 60 EA Hooded Sweatshirt w/Zipper 15.00$              900.00$            22.95$              1,377.00$         No Bid

Subtotal 4,044.00$         5,169.00$         No Bid
Taxes 283.08$            361.83$            No Bid
Total 4,327.08$         5,530.83$         No Bid

Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 
Lot #1 (Animal Services)

1 40 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500/105)           14.32$              572.80$            14.23$              569.20$            No Bid
Subtotal 572.80$            569.20$            No Bid
Taxes 40.10$              39.84$              No Bid
Total 612.90$            609.04$            No Bid

Lot #2 (Building Services)

1 100 EA SHIRT -  Tee, No pocket, Short 3.64$                364.00$            5.29$                529.00$            

2 30 EA SHIRT -  Tee, No pocket, Short 3.10$                93.00$              7.31$                219.30$            

3 60 EA
SHIRT - T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket              6.50$                390.00$            5.76$                345.60$            

4 10 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500)                   14.32$              143.20$            16.00$              160.00$            
5 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500)                  14.32$              71.60$              18.00$              90.00$              
6 20 EA SHIRT -  Sweatshirt                    13.42$              268.40$            21.50$              430.00$            

Subtotal 1,330.20$         1,773.90$         
Taxes 93.11$              124.17$            
Total 1,423.31$         1,898.07$         

Lot #3 (Community Development)
1 35 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 18.60$              651.00$            No Bid No Bid
2 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (188) 21.00$              105.00$            No Bid No Bid
3 10 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 24.34$              243.40$            No Bid No Bid
4 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (602) 24.34$              121.70$            No Bid No Bid
5 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (188) 21.00$              105.00$            No Bid No Bid
6 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (S608) 19.65$              98.25$              No Bid No Bid
7 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (TLS608) 20.98$              104.90$            No Bid No Bid
8 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 19.65$              98.25$              No Bid No Bid

Subtotal 1,527.50$         No Bid No Bid
Taxes 106.93$            No Bid No Bid
Total 1,634.43$         No Bid No Bid

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

The J. Paul Company Absolute Printing**Dunn Manufacturing



Lot #4 (Central Stores)

1 200 EA
SHIRT - T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket                  6.50$                1,300.00$         4.37$                874.00$            5.39$                  1,078.00$         
Subtotal 1,300.00$         874.00$            1,078.00$         
Taxes 91.00$              61.18$              75.46$              
Total 1,391.00$         935.18$            1,153.46$         

Lot #5 (Public Safety/EMS)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 18.66$              373.20$            No Bid
2 500 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket 3.90$                1,950.00$         No Bid
3 35 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket 2.92$                102.20$            No Bid
4 30 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 4.68$                140.40$            No Bid
5 30 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 4.68$                140.40$            No Bid

Subtotal 2,706.20$         No Bid
Taxes 189.43$            No Bid
Total 2,895.63$         No Bid

LOT #6 (Public Safety/Fire Service) - NO AWARD
1 800 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 3.12$                2,496.00$         4.03$                3,224.00$         
2 50 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410) 26.32$              1,316.00$         25.00$              1,250.00$         

Subtotal 3,812.00$         4,474.00$         
Taxes 266.84$            313.18$            
Total 4,078.84$         4,787.18$         

LOT #7 (Information Services)
1 38 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 14.32$              544.16$            15.75$              598.50$            No Bid

Subtotal 544.16$            598.50$            No Bid
Taxes 38.09$              41.90$              No Bid
Total 582.25$            640.40$            No Bid

LOT #8 (Public Safety/Communications)
1 60 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS410) 26.32$              1,579.20$         24.75$              1,485.00$         No Bid
2 60 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS411) 26.32$              1,579.20$         24.75$              1,485.00$         No Bid

Subtotal 3,158.40$         2,970.00$         No Bid
Taxes 221.09$            207.90$            No Bid
Total 3,379.49$         3,177.90$         No Bid

LOT #9 (Sheriff’s Department)
1 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 14.32$              859.20$            No Bid
2 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500LS) 19.65$              1,179.00$         No Bid
3 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 18.60$              1,116.00$         No Bid
4 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 24.34$              1,460.40$         No Bid
5 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500) 14.32$              859.20$            No Bid
6 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500LS) 19.65$              1,179.00$         No Bid
7 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 18.66$              1,119.60$         No Bid
8 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (602) 24.34$              1,460.40$         No Bid
9 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 43.50$              16,312.50$       No Bid

10 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 64.93$              24,348.75$       No Bid
11 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 48.68$              18,255.00$       No Bid
12 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 54.94$              20,602.50$       No Bid
13 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S608) 18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
14 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S508) 18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
15 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (TLS608) 19.98$              99.90$              No Bid
16 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L508) 18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
17 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 18.75$              375.00$            No Bid
18 375 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS410) 26.32$              9,870.00$         No Bid
19 375 EA SHIRT- Polo (CS410LS) 28.74$              10,777.50$       No Bid
20 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS411) 26.32$              9,870.00$         No Bid

Subtotal 120,868.95$     No Bid
Taxes 8,460.83$         No Bid
Total 129,329.78$     No Bid

LOT#10 (Public Works)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 14.32$              286.40$            17.75$              355.00$            No Bid
2 24 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 18.60$              446.40$            19.95$              478.80$            No Bid

Subtotal 732.80$            833.80$            No Bid
Taxes 51.30$              58.37$              No Bid
Total 784.10$            892.17$            No Bid

LOT #11 (Solid Waste Management)

1 60 EA
SHIRT - Tee with Pocket 
3W700 SG No Bid

2 60 EA
SHIRT - Tee with Pocket 
3W710SG No Bid

3 60 EA Sweatshirt No Bid
4 60 EA Hooded Sweatshirt No Bid
5 60 EA Hooded Sweatshirt w/Zipper No Bid

Subtotal No Bid
Taxes No Bid
Total No Bid Deemed Non ResponsiveDeemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive
Deemed Non-Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive



Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 
Lot #1 (Animal Services)

1 40 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500/105)           No Bid 11.89$              475.60$            12.99$                519.60$            
Subtotal No Bid 475.60$            519.60$            
Taxes No Bid 33.29$              36.37$              
Total No Bid 508.89$            555.97$            

Lot #2 (Building Services)

1 100 EA SHIRT -  Tee, No pocket, Short 2.81$                281.00$            10.75$                1,075.00$         

2 30 EA SHIRT -  Tee, No pocket, Short 2.43$                72.90$              10.23$                306.90$            

3 60 EA
SHIRT - T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket              5.47$                328.20$            5.77$                  346.20$            

4 10 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500)                   13.49$              134.90$            13.64$                136.40$            
5 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500)                  13.49$              67.45$              13.64$                68.20$              
6 20 EA SHIRT -  Sweatshirt                    8.82$                176.40$            20.27$                405.40$            

Subtotal 1,060.85$         2,338.10$         
Taxes 74.26$              163.67$            
Total 1,135.11$         2,501.77$         

Lot #3 (Community Development)
1 35 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 13.38$              468.30$            14.63$                512.05$            
2 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (188) 14.48$              72.40$              15.93$                79.65$              
3 10 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 17.23$              172.30$            19.18$                191.80$            
4 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (602) 17.23$              86.15$              19.18$                95.90$              
5 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (188) 14.48$              72.40$              15.93$                79.65$              
6 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (S608) 15.95$              79.75$              17.54$                87.70$              
7 5 EA SHIRT -  Polo (TLS608) 20.48$              102.40$            18.84$                94.20$              
8 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 15.95$              79.75$              17.54$                87.70$              

Subtotal 1,133.45$         1,228.65$         
Taxes 79.34$              86.01$              
Total 1,212.79$         1,314.66$         

Lot #4 (Central Stores)

1 200 EA
SHIRT - T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket                  7.28$                1,456.00$         8.61$                  1,722.00$         
Subtotal 1,456.00$         1,722.00$         
Taxes 101.92$            120.54$            
Total 1,557.92$         1,842.54$         

Lot #5 (Public Safety/EMS)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 14.98$              299.60$            14.63$                292.60$            
2 500 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket 2.98$                1,490.00$         8.83$                  4,415.00$         
3 35 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket 2.19$                76.65$              5.25$                  183.75$            
4 30 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 3.39$                101.70$            8.84$                  265.20$            
5 30 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 3.39$                101.70$            9.52$                  285.60$            

Subtotal 2,069.65$         5,442.15$         
Taxes 144.88$            380.95$            
Total 2,214.53$         5,823.10$         

LOT #6 (Public Safety/Fire Service)
1 800 EA SHIRT - Tee, No pocket SS 4.41$                3,528.00$         9.09$                  7,272.00$         
2 50 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410) 28.99$              1,449.50$         24.04$                1,202.00$         

Subtotal 4,977.50$         8,474.00$         
Taxes 348.43$            593.18$            
Total 5,325.93$         9,067.18$         

LOT #7 (Information Services)
1 38 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 16.49$              626.62$            13.49$              512.62$            12.99$                493.62$            

Subtotal 626.62$            512.62$            493.62$            
Taxes 43.86$              35.88$              34.55$              
Total 670.48$            548.50$            528.17$            

LOT #8 (Public Safety/Communications)
1 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410) 28.99$              1,739.40$         21.76$              1,305.60$         24.04$                1,442.40$         
2 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS411) 28.99$              1,739.40$         21.76$              1,305.60$         24.04$                1,442.40$         

Subtotal 3,478.80$         2,611.20$         2,884.80$         
Taxes 243.52$            182.78$            201.94$            
Total 3,722.32$         2,793.98$         3,086.74$         

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive
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Deemed Non Responsive
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Deemed Non Responsive
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Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive

Deemed Non Responsive
Deemed Non Responsive

Did Not Meet Specifications
Did Not Meet Specifications
Did Not Meet Specifications
Did Not Meet Specifications

Did Not Meet Specifications

Riddell Express Press Uniforms Manufacturing



LOT #9 (Sheriff’s Department)
1 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 12.99$                779.40$            
2 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500LS) 17.54$                1,052.40$         
3 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 14.63$                877.80$            
4 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 19.18$                1,150.80$         
5 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500) 12.99$                779.40$            
6 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500LS) 17.54$                1,052.40$         
7 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 14.63$                877.80$            
8 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (602) 19.18$                1,150.80$         
9 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 29.12$                10,920.00$       

10 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 33.02$                12,382.50$       
11 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 29.12$                10,920.00$       
12 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 33.02$                12,382.50$       
13 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S608) 17.54$                350.80$            
14 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S508) 17.54$                350.80$            
15 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (TLS608) 18.84$                94.20$              
16 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L508) 17.54$                350.80$            
17 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 17.54$                350.80$            
18 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410) 25.34$                9,502.50$         
19 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410LS) 29.24$                10,965.00$       
20 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS411) 25.34$                9,502.50$         

Subtotal 85,793.20$       
Taxes 6,005.52$         
Total 91,798.72$       

LOT#10 (Public Works)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 13.49$              269.80$            12.99$                259.80$            
2 24 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 14.88$              357.12$            14.63$                351.12$            

Subtotal 626.92$            610.92$            
Taxes 43.88$              42.76$              
Total 670.80$            653.68$            

LOT #11 (Solid Waste Management)

1 60 EA
SHIRT, Tee with Pocket 
3W700 SG 18.53$                1,111.80$         

2 60 EA
SHIRT, Tee with Pocket 
3W710SG 19.50$                1,170.00$         

3 60 EA Sweatshirt 14.89$                893.40$            
4 60 EA Hooded sweatshirt 22.02$                1,321.20$         
5 60 EA Hooded sweatshirt w/Zipper 26.55$                1,593.00$         

Subtotal 6,089.40$         
Taxes 426.26$            
Total 6,515.66$         

Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost 
Lot #1 (Animal Services)

1 40 EA SHIRT, Polo (K500/105)             17.00$              680.00$            
Subtotal 680.00$            
Taxes 47.60$              
Total 727.60$            

Lot #2 (Building Services)

1 100 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket, Short 5.85$                585.00$            

2 30 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket, Short 5.50$                165.00$            

3 60 EA
SHIRT, T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket              7.50$                450.00$            

4 10 EA SHIRT, Polo (L500)                    17.00$              170.00$            
5 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (K500)                    17.00$              85.00$              
6 20 EA SHIRT, Sweatshirt                      17.50$              350.00$            

Subtotal 1,805.00$         
Taxes 126.35$            
Total 1,931.35$         

Lot #3 (Community Development)
1 35 EA SHIRT, Polo (105) 21.00$              735.00$            
2 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (188) 23.00$              115.00$            
3 10 EA SHIRT, Polo (608) 25.00$              250.00$            
4 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (602) 24.50$              122.50$            
5 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (188) 23.00$              115.00$            
6 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (S608) 21.00$              105.00$            
7 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (TLS608) 22.00$              110.00$            
8 5 EA SHIRT, Polo (L608) 21.00$              105.00$            

Subtotal 1,657.50$         
Taxes 116.03$            
Total 1,773.53$         
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Eidson's Custom Embroidery



Lot #4 (Central Stores)

1 200 EA
SHIRT, T-Shirt, Short Sleeve 
with Pocket                  7.40$                1,480.00$         
Subtotal 1,480.00$         
Taxes 103.60$            
Total 1,583.60$         

Lot #5 (Public Safety/EMS)
1 20 EA SHIRT, Polo (102) 21.00$              420.00$            
2 500 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket 5.50$                2,750.00$         
3 35 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket 4.50$                157.50$            
4 30 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket SS 7.00$                210.00$            
5 30 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket SS 7.00$                210.00$            

Subtotal 3,747.50$         
Taxes 262.33$            
Total 4,009.83$         

LOT #6 (Public Safety/Fire Service) - NO AWARD
1 800 EA SHIRT, Tee, No pocket SS 5.55$                4,440.00$         
2 50 EA SHIRT< Polo (CS410) 30.00$              1,500.00$         

Subtotal 5,940.00$         
Taxes 415.80$            
Total 6,355.80$         

LOT #7 (Information Services)
1 38 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 17.00$              646.00$            

Subtotal 646.00$            
Taxes 45.22$              
Total 691.22$            

LOT #8 (Public Safety/Communications)
1 60 EA SHIRT< Polo (CS410) 26.00$              1,560.00$         
2 60 EA SHIRT< Polo (CS411) 26.00$              1,560.00$         

Subtotal 3,120.00$         
Taxes 218.40$            
Total 3,338.40$         

LOT #9 (Sheriff’s Department)
1 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 17.00$              1,020.00$         
2 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500LS) 21.00$              1,260.00$         
3 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 21.00$              1,260.00$         
4 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (608) 24.50$              1,470.00$         
5 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500) 17.00$              1,020.00$         
6 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (L500LS) 21.00$              1,260.00$         
7 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (102) 21.00$              1,260.00$         
8 60 EA SHIRT - Polo (602) 22.50$              1,350.00$         
9 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 31.00$              11,625.00$       

10 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 32.00$              12,000.00$       
11 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 29.00$              10,875.00$       
12 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (Tru-Spec) 32.00$              12,000.00$       
13 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S608) 21.00$              420.00$            
14 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (S508) 21.00$              420.00$            
15 5 EA SHIRT - Polo (TLS608) 23.00$              115.00$            
16 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L508) 21.00$              420.00$            
17 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (L608) 21.00$              420.00$            
18 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410) 27.00$              10,125.00$       
19 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS410LS) 30.00$              11,250.00$       
20 375 EA SHIRT - Polo (CS411) 27.00$              10,125.00$       

Subtotal 89,695.00$       
Taxes 6,278.65$         
Total 95,973.65$       

LOT#10 (Public Works)
1 20 EA SHIRT - Polo (K500) 17.00$              340.00$            
2 24 EA SHIRT - Polo (105) 21.00$              504.00$            

Subtotal 844.00$            
Taxes 59.08$              
Total 903.08$            

LOT #11 (Solid Waste Management)

1 EA
SHIRT, Tee with Pocket 
3W700 SG

2 EA
SHIRT, Tee with Pocket 
3W710SG

3 EA Sweatshirt
4 EA Hooded sweatshirt
5 EA Hooded sweatshirt w/Zipper

Subtotal
Taxes
Total Deemed Non-Responsive
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** SP Design & Mfg, Inc. was deemed non-responsive because they did not provide a complete solicitation response.
** American Solutions for Business was deemed non-responsive because they marked their entire solicitation response "confidential".

Bid Opening: February 6, 2014 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

**Dunn Manufactuing was deemed non-responsive on Lot #11 because they did not bid on all items in that lot.

**Aramark Uniform Services provided a "No Bid" response because they were unable to meet the specifications.

**Express Press was deemed non-responsive on Lot #4 because they did not acknowledge amendment one which changed the specification for that 
lot and deemed non-responsive for Lot#9 and Lot#11 because they did not bid on all items in that lot.

**Riddell was deemed non-responsive on Lot #2, Lot#3, Lot #5, Lot #9, Lot#10 and Lot#11 because they did not bid on all items in that lot.
**Uniform Warehouse was deemed non-responsive because they did not properly fill out the "Bidders Schedule".
**Eidson's Custom Embroidery was deemed non-responsive on Lot #11 because they did not bid on all items in that lot.

**Absolut Printing was deemed non-responsive on Lot #2, Lot #5, Lot #6, and Lot#11  because they did not bid on all items in that lot.
**The J. Paul Company was deemed non-responsive on Lot #9 because they did not bid on all items in that lot.


