COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE
OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:

PROCUREMENT:

ISSUE DATE:

CLOSING DATE:

C14021-03/04/14K

Institutional Clothing — Term Contract

February 3, 2014

March 4, 2014

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

CLOTHING:

Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.:

Lot One (ltems #1a-1j)

Lot Two (Items #2a-2j)

Lot Three (Items #3a-3j)

Lot Four (Items #4a-4j)

Lot Seven (ltems #7a-7j)
Lot Eight (Items #8a-8K)

Lot Nine (Items #9a-9k)

Lot Ten (Items #10a-10h)
Lot Eleven (ltems #11a-11i)
Lot Twelve (Items #12a-12j)

SHOES:
Charm-Tex:

Lot Five (Item 5)
Lot Six (Item 6)

Orange Trousers

Red Trousers

Orange Shirts

Red Shirts

Black/White Shirts
Black/White Trousers
Denim with White Trousers
Light Blue Shirts

Tan Shirts

Tan Trousers

ANNUAL ESTIMATED COST:

Shoes, Sandals, Unifoot
Shoes, Slip On

ANNUAL ESTIMATED COST:

$4,629.89
$4,795.21
$3,963.28
$3,963.28
$1,456.70
$1,929.42
$2,441.21
$1,279.72
$2,495.45
$5,296.93

$32,251.09

$863.49
$1,530.10

$2,393.59



An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of
Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Kay Keisler
Procurement Officer

Posted: April 30, 2014

THIS ISNOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



Bid #: C14021-03/04/14K

INSTITUTIONAL CLOTHING - TERM CONTRACT

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Uniforms Manufacturing
Just In Trend Inc. OD Taragin & Bros. LLC Charm-Tex
Lot (ltem #) | Quantity Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
la 25 Orange Trousers, S $ 545 $ 136.25 | $ 465 $ 11625 [ $ 690 | $ 17250 | $ 590 [ $ 147.50
1b 50 Orange Trousers, M $ 545 % 27250 [ $ 5201 $ 260.00 | $ 690 $ 345.00 | $ 590 | $ 295.00
1c 75 Orange Trousers, L $ 545| $ 408.75 | $ 569 ($ 426.75 | $ 690 | $ 517.50 [ $ 590 [ $ 442.50
1d 150 Orange Trousers, XL $ 570 | $ 855.00 | $ 5.69 | % 853.50 | $ 690 | $ 1,035.00($% 590 | $ 885.00
le 175 Orange Trousers, 2XL $ 570 | $ 99750 [ $ 569 ($ 995.75 | $ 690 $ 1,20750 |$ 590 $ 1,032.50
1f 125 Orange Trousers, 3XL $ 595 % 743.75 [ $ 5.69 | $ 71125 | $ 770 $ 962.50 | $ 636 | $ 795.00
1g 50 Orange Trousers, 4XL $ 595| % 29750 [ $ 590 [ $ 295.00 | $ 810 | $ 405.00 | $ 690 [ $ 345.00
1h 50 Orange Trousers, 5XL $ 635 % 31750 [ $ 649 | $ 32450 | $ 810 $ 405.00 | $ 690 | $ 345.00
1i 25 Orange Trousers, 7XL $ 655| % 163.75 | $ 688 (% 172.00 [ $ 9.00 | $ 225.00 [ $ 790 $ 197.50
1j 25 Orange Trousers, 9XL $ 685| $ 17125 | $ 688 | $ 172.00 [ $ 10.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 790 | $ 197.50
Sub Total $ 4,363.75 $  4,327.00 $ 5,525.00 $ 4,682.50
Sales Tax $ 305.46 $ 302.89 $ 386.75 $ 327.78
Lot (Item One) Grand Total $ 4,669.21 $ 4,629.89 $ 5,911.75 $ 5,010.28
2a 25 Red Trousers, S $ 5451 % 136.25 | $ 465|$ 116.25( $ 6.90 | $ 17250 | $ 590 | $ 147.50
2b 25 Red Trousers, M $ 545 | $ 136.25 | $ 520 ($ 130.00 [ $ 690 | $ 17250 | $ 590 $ 147.50
2c 75 Red Trousers, L $ 5451 % 408.75 | $ 569 | $ 426.75 | $ 6.90 | $ 51750 | $ 590 | $ 442.50
2d 175 Red Trousers, XL $ 570 | $ 99750 [ $ 569 ($ 995.75 | $ 690 $ 1,20750 |$ 590 $ 1,032.50
2e 175 Red Trousers, 2XL $ 570 | $ 99750 [ $ 569 | $ 995.75 | $ 690 $ 1,20750 |$ 590 | $ 1,032.50
2f 150 Red Trousers, 3XL $ 595 | $ 89250 [ $ 569 ($ 853.50 | $ 770 $ 1,155.00 | $ 636 $ 954.00
29 50 Red Trousers, 4XL $ 5951 % 29750 [ $ 590 | $ 295.00 | $ 810 | $ 405.00 | $ 6.90 | $ 345.00
2h 50 Red Trousers, 5XL $ 635 $ 31750 [ $ 649 [ $ 32450 | $ 810 $ 405.00 | $ 690 [ $ 345.00
2i 25 Red Trousers, 7XL $ 6.55| % 163.75 | $ 688 | % 172.00 [ $ 9.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 790 | $ 197.50
2 25 Red Trousers, 9XL $ 6.85|$ 17125 | $ 688 (% 172.00 [ $ 10.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 790 $ 197.50
Sub Total $ 4,518.75 $ 4,481.50 $ 5,717.50 $ 4,841.50
Sales Tax $ 316.31 $ 313.71 $ 400.23 $ 338.91
Lot (Item Two) Total $ 4,835.06 $ 4,795.21 $ 6,117.73 $ 5,180.41
3a 25 Orange Shirts, S $ 4451 $ 11125 | $ 390 ($ 9750 | $ 658 | $ 164.50 | $ 536 [ $ 134.00
3b 25 Orange Shirts, M $ 4451 $ 11125 | $ 410 $ 102.50 [ $ 658 | $ 16450 | $ 536 | $ 134.00
3c 75 Orange Shirts, L $ 4451 $ 333.75 [ $ 438 | $ 328.50 | $ 658 | $ 493.50 | $ 536 [ $ 402.00
3d 175 Orange Shirts, XL $ 470 | $ 82250 [ $ 458 | $ 801.50 | $ 658 $ 1,151.50 | $ 536 | $ 938.00
3e 175 Orange Shirts 2XL $ 470 | $ 82250 $ 458 | $ 801.50 | $ 658 $ 1,151.50 | $ 536 $ 938.00
3f 150 Orange Shirts 3XL $ 4951 $ 74250 | $ 500 | $ 750.00 | $ 6.88 | $ 1,032.00 |$ 572 $ 858.00
39 50 Orange Shirts 4XL $ 4951 $ 24750 [ $ 530 (% 265.00 | $ 7.08| $ 354.00 | $ 618 [ $ 309.00
3h 50 Orange Shirts 5XL $ 535| % 26750 [ $ 550 | $ 275.00 | $ 8.08| $ 404.00 | $ 654 % 327.00
3i 25 Orange Shirts 7XL $ 555 | % 138.75 | $ 550 ($ 13750 [ $ 8.60 | $ 215.00 | $ 690 [ $ 172.50
3] 25 Orange Shirts 9XL $ 585|% 146.25 | $ 580 | % 145.00 [ $ 948 | $ 237.00 [ $ 6.90 | $ 172.50
Sub Total $ 3,743.75 $ 3,704.00 $ 5,367.50 $ 4,385.00
Sales Tax $ 262.06 $ 259.28 $ 375.73 $ 306.95
Lot (Item Three) Total $ 4,005.81 $ 3,963.28 $ 5,743.23 $ 4,691.95




Uniforms Manufacturing

Just In Trend Inc. OD Taragin & Bros. LLC Charm-Tex
Lot (Item #) | Quantity Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
4a 25 Red Shirts, S $ 445 [ $ 11125 | $ 390 | $ 9750 | $ 658 [ $ 16450 | $ 536 | $ 134.00
4b 25 Red Shirts, M $ 4451 $ 11125 | $ 410 $ 10250 [ $ 658 | $ 16450 | $ 536 [ % 134.00
4c 75 Red Shirts, L $ 445 [ $ 333.75 | $ 438 $ 328.50 | $ 658 [ $ 493.50 | $ 536 | $ 402.00
4d 175 Red Shirts, XL $ 470 | $ 82250 [ $ 458 | $ 801.50 | $ 658 $ 1,151.50 | $ 536 [ % 938.00
4e 175 Red Shirts, 2XL $ 470 [ $ 82250 | $ 458 | $ 801.50 | $ 658 | $ 1,151.50($ 536 | $ 938.00
Af 150 Red Shirts, 3XL $ 4951 $ 74250 [ $ 5.00 [ $ 750.00 | $ 6.88 | $ 1,032.00|$ 572 $ 858.00
49 50 Red Shirts, 4XL $ 495 ([ $ 24750 | $ 530 | $ 265.00 | $ 7.08 [ $ 354.00 | $ 6.18| $ 309.00
4h 50 Red Shirts, 5XL $ 535 % 26750 [ $ 550 ($ 275.00 | $ 8.08 | $ 404.00 | $ 654 % 327.00
4i 25 Red Shirts, 7XL $ 5551 $% 138.75 | $ 550 | $ 13750 [ $ 860 $ 215.00 | $ 690 | $ 172.50
4 25 Red Shirts, 9XL $ 585 $ 14625 | $ 580 ($ 145.00 [ $ 948 | $ 237.00 [ $ 690 [ $ 172.50
Sub Total $ 3,743.75 $ 3,704.00 $ 5,367.50 $ 4,385.00
Sales Tax $ 262.06 $ 259.28 $ 375.73 $ 306.95
Lot (Item Four) Total $ 4,005.81 $ 3,963.28 $ 5,743.23 $ 4,691.95
Shoes, Sandals, Unifoot, sz Small -
5 300 3XL NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 269 | % 807.00
Sub Total $ - $ - $ - $ 807.00
Sales Tax $ - $ - $ - $ 56.49
Lot (Item Five) Total $ - $ - $ - $ 863.49
6 1000 [Shoes, SlipOn,sz7-14 NO BID $ 2541% 2540.00 | $ 287 |%$ 287000 (% 143 |$ 1,430.00
Sub Total $ - $  2,540.00 $ 2,870.00 $ 1,430.00
Sales Tax $ - $ 177.80 $ 200.90 $ 100.10
Lot (Item Six)Total $ - $ 2,717.80 $ 3,070.90 $ 1,530.10
7a 10 Black/White Shirts, S $ 4451 $ 4450 [ $ 345($ 3450 1| $ 786 | $ 78.60 | $ 536 [ $ 53.60
7b 10 Black/White Shirts, M $ 4451 $ 4450 [ $ 345 (% 3450 | $ 786 | $ 78.60 | $ 536 [ $ 53.60
7c 20 Black/White Shirts, L $ 4451 $ 89.00 | $ 347 ( $ 69.40 | $ 786 | $ 157.20 | $ 536 [ $ 107.20
7d 75 Black/White Shirts, XL $ 470 | $ 352.50 [ $ 435 $ 326.25 | $ 786 | $ 589.50 | $ 536 [ $ 402.00
7e 75 Black/White Shirts, 2XL $ 4701 $ 35250 [ $ 4351 $ 326.25 | $ 786 | $ 589.50 | $ 536 [ $ 402.00
7f 40 Black/White Shirts, 3XL $ 4951 $ 198.00 | $ 456 | $ 18240 [ $ 826 | $ 33040 [ $ 572 $ 228.80
79 30 Black/White Shirts, 4XL $ 4951 $ 148.50 | $ 456 | $ 136.80 [ $ 856 | $ 256.80 | $ 6.18 | $ 185.40
7h 20 Black/White Shirts, 5XL $ 535 % 107.00 | $ 478 | $ 95.60 | $ 956 | $ 191.20 [ $ 654 (% 130.80
7i 15 Black/White Shirts, 7XL $ 555 %$ 83.25|$ 488 | $ 73201 $ 10.16 | $ 15240 | $ 690 [ $ 103.50
7 15 Black/White Shirts, 9XL $ 585 $ 87.75|$%$ 550 ($ 82.50 | $ 1116 | $ 16740 | $ 690 $ 103.50
Sub Total $ 1,507.50 $ 1,361.40 $ 2,591.60 $ 1,770.40
Sales Tax $ 105.53 $ 95.30 $ 181.41 $ 123.93
Lot (Item Seven) Total $ 1,613.03 $ 1,456.70 $ 2,773.01 $ 1,894.33
8a 10 Black/White Trousers, S $ 545 $ 5450 | $ 4691 $ 46.90 [ $ 825| $ 8250 | $ 590 [ $ 59.00
8b 10 Black/White Trousers, M $ 545( $ 5450 | $ 490 $ 49.00 | $ 825| $ 8250 | $ 590 $ 59.00
8c 20 Black/White Trousers, L $ 545| $ 109.00 | $ 525( % 105.00 [ $ 825| % 165.00 | $ 590 $ 118.00
8d 75 Black/White Trousers, XL $ 570 | $ 42750 | $ 543 ([ $ 407.25 | $ 825 | $ 618.75 [ $ 590 [ $ 442.50
8e 75 Black/White Trousers, 2XL $ 570 | $ 42750 | $ 569 $ 426.75 | $ 825| % 618.75 | $ 590 $ 442.50
8f 40 Black/White Trousers, 3XL $ 595| % 238.00 [ $ 5721 $ 228.80 | $ 925| $ 370.00 [ $ 6.36 | $ 254.40
89 30 Black/White Trousers, 4XL $ 595| $ 17850 | $ 614 $ 184.20 [ $ 975 | $ 29250 | $ 690 $ 207.00
8h 20 Black/White Trousers, 5XL $ 635| $ 127.00 | $ 6.68 | $ 133.60 [ $ 9.75 | $ 195.00 | $ 6.90 | $ 138.00
8j 15 Black/White Trousers, 7XL $ 655| % 98.25 | $ 736 $ 11040 [ $ 1070 | $ 160.50 | $ 790 $ 118.50
8k 15 Black/White Trousers, 9XL $ 685 | $ 102.75 | $ 7421 % 11130 [ $ 11.80 | $ 177.00 | $ 790 $ 118.50
Sub Total $ 1,817.50 $ 1,803.20 $ 2,762.50 $ 1,957.40
Sales Tax $ 127.23 $ 126.22 $ 193.38 $ 137.02
Lot (Item Eight) Total $ 1,944.73 $ 1,929.42 $ 2,955.88 $ 2,094.42




Uniforms Manufacturing

Just In Trend Inc. OD Taragin & Bros. LLC Charm-Tex
Lot (Item #) | Quantity Description Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total
9a 10 Denim W/White Trousers, 28" NO BID $ 1014 | $ 101.40 NO BID $ 990 [ $ 99.00
9b 15 Denim W/White Trousers, 30" NO BID $ 1014 [ $ 152.10 NO BID $ 990 | $ 148.50
9c 40 Denim W/White Trousers, 32" NO BID $ 1014 | $ 405.60 NO BID $ 990 | $ 396.00
9d 45 Denim W/White Trousers, 34" NO BID $ 1014 [ $ 456.30 NO BID $ 990 | $ 445.50
9e 45 Denim W/White Trousers, 36" NO BID $ 1014 | $ 456.30 NO BID $ 990 | $ 445.50
of 20 Denim W/White Trousers, 38" NO BID $ 10.14 [ $ 202.80 NO BID $ 990 | $ 198.00
99 25 Denim W/White Trousers, 40" NO BID $ 1014 | $ 253.50 NO BID $ 990 | $ 247.50
9h 10 Denim W/White Trousers, 42" NO BID $ 10.14 [ $ 101.40 NO BID $ 1090 [ $ 109.00
9i 5 Denim W/White Trousers, 44" NO BID $ 1014 [ $ 50.70 NO BID $ 1090 [ $ 54.50
9 5 Denim W/White Trousers, 46" NO BID $ 10.14 [ $ 50.70 NO BID $ 1090 [ $ 54.50
9k 5 Denim W/White Trousers, 48" NO BID $ 1014 [ $ 50.70 NO BID $ 1090 [ $ 54.50
Sub Total $ - $ 2,281.50 $ - $ 2,252.50
Sales Tax $ - $ 159.71 $ - $ 157.68
Lot (Item Nine) Total $ - $ 2,441.21 $ - $ 2,410.18
10a 10 Lt Blue Shirt, S $ 1350 [ $ 135.00 | $ 598 | $ 590.80 | $ 8.08| % 80.80 | $ 890 | $ 89.00
10b 10 Lt Blue Shirt, M $ 1350 | $ 135.00 | $ 598 | $ 59.80 | $ 8.08| % 80.80 | $ 890 | $ 89.00
10c 30 Lt Blue Shirt, L $ 1350 [ $ 405.00 | $ 598 | $ 179.40 [ $ 8.08| % 24240 | $ 890 | $ 267.00
10d 45 Lt Blue Shirt, XL $ 1425 | $ 641.25 [ $ 598 | $ 269.10 | $ 8.08 | $ 363.60 | $ 890 | $ 400.50
10e 45 Lt Blue Shirt, 2XL $ 1425[ $ 641.25 [ $ 598 | $ 269.10 | $ 963 $ 43335 | $ 1090 | $ 490.50
10f 30 Lt Blue Shirt, 3XL $ 1425 | $ 42750 | $ 598 | $ 179.40 | $ 963 $ 288.90 [ $ 1090 [ $ 327.00
10g 15 Lt Blue Shirt, 4XL $ 1550 [ $ 23250 | $ 598 | $ 89.70 | $ 963 $ 14445 | $ 1290 | $ 193.50
10h 15 Lt Blue Shirt, 5XL $ 1550 | $ 23250 [ $ 598 | $ 89.70 | $ 963 $ 14445 | $ 1290 | $ 193.50
Sub Total $ 2,850.00 $ 1,196.00 $ 1,778.75 $ 2,050.00
Sales Tax $ 199.50 $ 83.72 $ 124.51 $ 143.50
Lot (Item Ten) Total $ 3,049.50 $ 1,279.72 $ 1,903.26 $ 2,193.50
1lla 20 Tan Shirts, S $ 1350 | $ 270.00 [ $ 598 | $ 119.60 [ $ 8.08 | $ 161.60 | $ 890 | $ 178.00
11b 20 Tan Shirts, M $ 1350 [ $ 270.00 | $ 598 | $ 119.60 [ $ 8.08 | % 161.60 | $ 890 | $ 178.00
1llc 60 Tan Shirts, L $ 1350 | $ 810.00 [ $ 598 | $ 358.80 | $ 8.08 | % 484.80 | $ 890 | $ 534.00
11d 80 Tan Shirts, XL $ 1425 $ 1,14000( $ 598 | $ 478.40 | $ 8.08| % 646.40 | $ 890 | $ 712.00
1lle 80 Tan Shirts, 2XL $ 1425 $ 1,140.00 | $ 598 | $ 478.40 | $ 963 $ 77040 | $ 1090 [ $ 872.00
11f 50 Tan Shirts, 3XL $ 1425[ $ 71250 | $ 598 | $ 299.00 | $ 963 $ 48150 | $ 1090 | $ 545.00
11g 30 Tan Shirts, 4XL $ 1550 | $ 465.00 | $ 598 | $ 179.40 | $ 963 $ 288.90 [ $ 1290 | $ 387.00
11h 25 Tan Shirts, 5XL $ 1550 [ $ 387.50 | $ 598 | $ 149.50 | $ 963 $ 24075 [ $ 1290 | $ 322.50
11i 25 Tan Shirts, 6XL $ 16.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 598 | $ 149.50 [ $ 963 $ 24075 | $ 1290 | $ 322.50
Sub Total $ 5,595.00 $ 2,332.20 $ 3,476.70 $ 4,051.00
Sales Tax $ 391.65 $ 163.25 $ 243.37 $ 283.57
Lot (Item Eleven) Total $ 5,986.65 $ 2,495.45 $ 3,720.07 $ 4,334.57
12a 15 Tan Trousers, 28" NO BID $ 952 | $ 14280 [ $ 1498 | $ 224.70 NO BID
12b 30 Tan Trousers, 30" NO BID $ 952 $ 285.60 | $ 1412 | $ 423.60 NO BID
12c 100 Tan Trousers, 32" NO BID $ 952 % 952.00 | $ 1412 | $ 1,412.00 NO BID
12d 80 Tan Trousers, 34" NO BID $ 952 $ 76160 | $ 1412 | $ 1,129.60 NO BID
12e 80 Tan Trousers, 36" NO BID $ 952 % 761.60 | $ 1412 | $ 1,129.60 NO BID
12f 80 Tan Trousers, 38" NO BID $ 952 $ 76160 | $ 1412 | $ 1,129.60 NO BID
12g 60 Tan Trousers, 40" NO BID $ 952 | $ 57120 | $ 1412 | $ 847.20 NO BID
12h 40 Tan Trousers, 42" NO BID $ 952 $ 380.80 | $ 1412 | $ 564.80 NO BID
12i 15 Tan Trousers, 44" NO BID $ 952 | $ 14280 [ $ 1765| $ 264.75 NO BID
12j 20 Tan Trousers, 50" NO BID $ 952 $ 19040 [ $ 1765 $ 353.00 NO BID
Sub Total $ - $ 4,950.40 $ 7,478.85 $ -
Sales Tax $ - $ 346.53 $ 523.52 $ -
Lot (Item Twelve) Total $ - $ 5,296.93 $ 8,002.37 $ -
GRAND TOTAL - Clothing
Lots (Items 1-4 & 7-12) $ 30,109.80 $ 32,251.09 $ 42,870.53 $ 32,501.59
GRAND TOTAL - Shoe Lots
(Items 5-6) $ - $ 2,717.80 $ 3,070.90 $ 2,393.59




Bob Barker Company,

Inc. Robinson Textiles ACME ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
Lot (ltem #) | Quantity Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

la 25 Orange Trousers, S $ 589 $ 14725 | $ 5.00 [ $ 125.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 601 $ 150.25
1b 50 Orange Trousers, M $ 589 % 29450 | $ 5.00 | $ 250.00 [ $ 550 $ 275.00 | $ 639 $ 319.50
1c 75 Orange Trousers, L $ 589 $ 44175 | $ 590 ($ 44250 | $ 550 | $ 41250 | $ 687 % 515.25
1d 150 Orange Trousers, XL $ 589 % 883.50 | $ 590 | $ 885.00 | $ 550 $ 825.00 | $ 719 $ 1,078.50
le 175 Orange Trousers, 2XL $ 589 % 1,030.75|$ 590 [$ 103250 % 550 | $ 962.50 [ $ 728 $ 1,274.00
1f 125 Orange Trousers, 3XL $ 589 % 736.25 | $ 590 | $ 73750 | $ 550 $ 687.50 | $ 7341 % 917.50
1g 50 Orange Trousers, 4XL $ 589 $ 29450 [ $ 590 [ $ 295.00 | $ 550 | $ 275.00 [ $ 794 $ 397.00
1lh 50 Orange Trousers, 5XL $ 589 % 29450 | $ 590 | $ 295.00 | $ 550 $ 275.00 | $ 869 | $ 434.50
1i 25 Orange Trousers, 7XL $ 843 | $ 21075 ( $ 7.00 [ $ 175.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 1062 | $ 265.50
1j 25 Orange Trousers, 9XL $ 843 $ 210.75 | $ 7.00 | $ 175.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 1269 | $ 317.25
Sub Total $ 4,544.50 $ 441250 $ 4,125.00 $ 5,669.25
Sales Tax $ 318.12 $ 308.88 $ 288.75 $ 396.85
Lot (Item One) Total $ 4,862.62 $ 4,721.38 $ 4,413.75 $ 6,066.10
2a 25 Red Trousers, S $ 589 | % 14725 | $ 5.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 601 $ 150.25
2b 25 Red Trousers, M $ 589 | $ 14725 | $ 5.00 [ $ 125.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 639 % 159.75
2c 75 Red Trousers, L $ 589 | % 44175 | $ 590 | $ 44250 | $ 550 $ 41250 | $ 687 % 515.25
2d 175 Red Trousers, XL $ 589 (% 1,030.75|$ 590 ($ 103250 (% 550 | $ 962.50 | $ 719 $ 1,258.25
2e 175 Red Trousers, 2XL $ 589[($ 1030.75|$ 590 [$ 103250 |$% 550 $ 962.50 | $ 728 $ 1,274.00
2f 150 Red Trousers, 3XL $ 589 | $ 883.50 [ $ 590 ($ 885.00 | $ 550 | $ 825.00 [ $ 734 $ 1,101.00
29 50 Red Trousers, 4XL $ 589 | $ 29450 [ $ 590 ($ 295.00 | $ 550 $ 275.00 | $ 7941 % 397.00
2h 50 Red Trousers, 5XL $ 589 | $ 29450 [ $ 590 ($ 295.00 | $ 550 $ 275.00 [ $ 869 % 434.50
2i 25 Red Trousers, 7XL $ 843 | $ 21075 ( $ 7.00 [ $ 175.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 10.62 | $ 265.50
2j 25 Red Trousers, 9XL $ 843 | $ 21075 $ 7.00 [ $ 175.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 1269 | $ 317.25
Sub Total $ 4,691.75 $ 4,582.50 $  4,262.50 $ 587275
Sales Tax $ 328.42 $ 320.78 $ 298.38 $ 411.09
Lot (Item Two) Total $ 5,020.17 $ 4,903.28 $ 4,560.88 $ 6,283.84
3a 25 Orange Shirts, S $ 4791 $ 11975 | $ 400 | $ 100.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 525( % 131.25
3b 25 Orange Shirts, M $ 4791 $ 119.75 | $ 400 [ $ 100.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 552 % 138.00
3c 75 Orange Shirts, L $ 4791 $ 359.25 [ $ 490 | $ 36750 | $ 550 | $ 41250 | $ 570 [ $ 427.50
3d 175 Orange Shirts, XL $ 4791 $ 838.25 [ $ 490 [ $ 857.50 | $ 550 | $ 962.50 | $ 6.04 [ $ 1,057.00
3e 175 Orange Shirts 2XL $ 4791 $ 838.25 [ $ 490 | $ 857.50 | $ 550 | $ 962.50 | $ 654 $ 1,144.50
3f 150 Orange Shirts 3XL $ 4791 $ 71850 [ $ 490 [ $ 735.00 | $ 550 | $ 825.00 | $ 6.82 [ $ 1,023.00
39 50 Orange Shirts 4XL $ 4791 $ 239.50 [ $ 490 | $ 245.00 | $ 550 | $ 275.00 [ $ 733( % 366.50
3h 50 Orange Shirts 5XL $ 4791 $ 23950 [ $ 490 [ $ 245.00 | $ 550 $ 275.00 | $ 748 ([ $ 374.00
3i 25 Orange Shirts 7XL $ 699 | $ 17475 | $ 6.00 [ $ 150.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 939 % 234.75
3] 25 Orange Shirts 9XL $ 699 | $ 17475 | $ 6.00 [ $ 150.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 11.30 | $ 282.50
Sub Total $ 3,822.25 $ 3,807.50 $  4,262.50 $ 5,179.00
Sales Tax $ 267.56 $ 266.53 $ 298.38 $ 362.53
Lot (Item Three) Total $ 4,089.81 $ 4,074.03 $ 4,560.88 $ 5,541.53
4a 25 Red Shirts, S $ 4791 $ 11975 | $ 400 [ $ 100.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 525( % 131.25
4b 25 Red Shirts, M $ 479 1 $ 119.75 | $ 4.00 | $ 100.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 552 $ 138.00
4c 75 Red Shirts, L $ 4791 $ 359.25 [ $ 490 [ $ 36750 | $ 550 $ 41250 | $ 570 [ $ 427.50
4d 175 Red Shirts, XL $ 479 1 $ 838.25 [ $ 490 [ $ 857.50 | $ 550 | $ 962.50 | $ 6.04 [ $ 1,057.00
4e 175 Red Shirts, 2XL $ 4791 $ 838.25 ( $ 490 [ $ 85750 | $ 550 | $ 962.50 | $ 654 | $ 1,144.50
Af 150 Red Shirts, 3XL $ 479 1 $ 71850 [ $ 490 [ $ 735.00 | $ 550 | $ 825.00 | $ 6.82 | $ 1,023.00
49 50 Red Shirts, 4XL $ 4791 $ 23950 [ $ 490 [ $ 245.00 | $ 550 | $ 275.00 | $ 733([ % 366.50
4h 50 Red Shirts, 5XL $ 479 1 $ 239.50 [ $ 490 [ $ 245.00 | $ 550 | $ 275.00 [ $ 748 [ $ 374.00
4i 25 Red Shirts, 7XL $ 699 | $ 17475 | $ 6.00 [ $ 150.00 [ $ 550 | $ 13750 | $ 939 ([ % 234.75
4 25 Red Shirts, 9XL $ 6.99 | $ 17475 | $ 6.00 | $ 150.00 [ $ 550 $ 13750 | $ 1130 | $ 282.50
Sub Total $ 3,822.25 $ 3,807.50 $ 4,262.50 $ 5,179.00
Sales Tax $ 267.56 $ 266.53 $ 298.38 $ 362.53
Lot (Item Four) Total $ 4,089.81 $ 4,074.03 $ 4,560.88 $ 5,541.53




Bob Barker Company,

Inc. Robinson Textiles ACME ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
Lot (Item #) | Quantity Description Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total
Shoes, Sandals, Unifoot, sz Small -
5 300 3XL $ 324 $ 972.00 NO BID NO BID $ 269 ($ 807.00
Sub Total $ 972.00 $ - $ - $ 807.00
Sales Tax $ 68.04 $ - $ - $ 56.49
Lot (Item Five) Total $ 1,040.04 $ - $ - $ 863.49
6 1000 [Shoes, SlipOn,sz7-14 $ 139 (% 1,390.00($ 240 [$ 2,400.00 NO BID $ 144 |$ 1,440.00
Sub Total $ 1,390.00 $  2,400.00 $ - $ 1,440.00
Sales Tax $ 97.30 $ 168.00 $ - $ 100.80
Lot (Item Six) Total $ 1,487.30 $ 2,568.00 $ - $ 1,540.80
7a 10 Black/White Shirts, S $ 394 $ 39040 $ 400 [ $ 40.00 [ $ 550 $ 55.00 | $ 525 % 52.50
7b 10 Black/White Shirts, M $ 394 | % 39.40 | $ 4.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 550 $ 55.00 | $ 552 % 55.20
7c 20 Black/White Shirts, L $ 410 | $ 82.00 | $ 490 [ $ 98.00 | $ 550 $ 110.00 [ $ 570 [ $ 114.00
7d 75 Black/White Shirts, XL $ 439 [ $ 329.25 | $ 490 [ $ 367.50 [ $ 550 $ 41250 | $ 604 $ 453.00
7e 75 Black/White Shirts, 2XL $ 449 | $ 336.75 [ $ 490 [ $ 367.50 | $ 550 $ 41250 | $ 654 % 490.50
7f 40 Black/White Shirts, 3XL $ 469 [ $ 187.60 | $ 490 ([ $ 196.00 [ $ 550 $ 220.00 | $ 682 % 272.80
79 30 Black/White Shirts, 4XL $ 469 | $ 14070 | $ 490 | $ 147.00 [ $ 550 | $ 165.00 | $ 733( % 219.90
7h 20 Black/White Shirts, 5XL $ 469 [ $ 93.80 | $ 490 | $ 98.00 | $ 550 $ 110.00 | $ 748 | $ 149.60
7i 15 Black/White Shirts, 7XL $ 599 | $ 89.85|$ 6.00 [ $ 90.00 | $ 550 | $ 8250 | $ 939 % 140.85
7 15 Black/White Shirts, 9XL $ 629 | $ 94351 $ 6.00 [ $ 90.00 | $ 550 $ 8250 | $ 11.30 | $ 169.50
Sub Total $ 1,433.10 $ 1,534.00 $ 1,705.00 $ 2,117.85
Sales Tax $ 100.32 $ 107.38 $ 119.35 $ 148.25
Lot (Item Seven) Total $ 1,533.42 $ 1,641.38 $ 1,824.35 $ 2,266.10
8a 10 Black/White Trousers, S $ 520 $ 52.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 50.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 601 $ 60.10
8b 10 Black/White Trousers, M $ 520 | $ 52.00 | $ 5.00 [ $ 50.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 639 $ 63.90
8c 20 Black/White Trousers, L $ 520 $ 104.00 | $ 590 | $ 118.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 6871 % 137.40
8d 75 Black/White Trousers, XL $ 559 % 41925 | $ 590 $ 442.50 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 719( $ 539.25
8e 75 Black/White Trousers, 2XL $ 559 $ 41925 | $ 590 | $ 442.50 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 728 $ 546.00
8f 40 Black/White Trousers, 3XL $ 559 % 22360 [ $ 590 $ 236.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 734 $ 293.60
8g 30 Black/White Trousers, 4XL $ 589 $ 176.70 | $ 590 | $ 177.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 7941 % 238.20
8h 20 Black/White Trousers, 5XL $ 620 | $ 124.00 | $ 590 $ 118.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 869 $ 173.80
8j 15 Black/White Trousers, 7XL $ 710 $ 106.50 | $ 7.00 [ $ 105.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 1062 | $ 159.30
8k 15 Black/White Trousers, 9XL $ 749 $ 11235 | $ 7.00( $ 105.00 NON-RESPONSIVE $ 1269 | $ 190.35
Sub Total $ 1,789.65 $ 1,844.00 $ - $ 2,401.90
Sales Tax $ 125.28 $ 129.08 $ - $ 168.13
Lot (Item Eight) Total $ 1,914.93 $ 1,973.08 $ - $ 2,570.03
9a 10 Denim W/White Trousers, 28" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9b 15 Denim W/White Trousers, 30" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9c 40 Denim W/White Trousers, 32" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
od 45 Denim W/White Trousers, 34" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9e 45 Denim W/White Trousers, 36" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
of 20 Denim W/White Trousers, 38" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
99 25 Denim W/White Trousers, 40" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9h 10 Denim W/White Trousers, 42" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9i 5 Denim W/White Trousers, 44" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9 5 Denim W/White Trousers, 46" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
9k 5 Denim W/White Trousers, 48" NO BID NO BID NO BID NON-RESPONSIVE
Sub Total $ - $ - $ - $
Sales Tax $ - $ - $ - $
Lot (Item Nine) Total $ - $ - $ - $ -




Bob Barker Company,

Inc. Robinson Textiles ACME ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
Lot (Item #) | Quantity Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total
10a 10 Lt Blue Shirt, S $ 769 $ 76.90 | $ 930 | $ 93.00 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 103.00
10b 10 Lt Blue Shirt, M $ 7691 $ 76.90 | $ 930 | $ 93.00 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 103.00
10c 30 Lt Blue Shirt, L $ 769 $ 230.70 [ $ 930 | $ 279.00 NO BID $ 10.30 | $ 309.00
10d 45 Lt Blue Shirt, XL $ 7691 $ 346.05 [ $ 930 $ 418.50 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 463.50
10e 45 Lt Blue Shirt, 2XL $ 894 $ 402.30 | $ 10.76 | $ 484.20 NO BID $ 11471 $ 516.15
10f 30 Lt Blue Shirt, 3XL $ 8941 $ 268.20 [ $ 10.76 | $ 322.80 NO BID $ 1147 1 $ 344.10
10g 15 Lt Blue Shirt, 4XL $ 894 | $ 134.10 | $ 10.76 | $ 161.40 NO BID $ 1560 | $ 234.00
10h 15 Lt Blue Shirt, 5XL $ 894 $ 13410 | $ 10.76 | $ 161.40 NO BID $ 1560 | $ 234.00
Sub Total $ 1,669.25 $ 2,013.30 $ - $ 2,306.75
Sales Tax $ 116.85 $ 140.93 $ - $ 161.47
Lot (Item Ten) Total $ 1,786.10 $ 2,154.23 $ - $ 2,468.22
lla 20 Tan Shirts, S $ 769 $ 153.80 | $ 930 $ 186.00 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 206.00
11b 20 Tan Shirts, M $ 769 $ 153.80 | $ 930 | $ 186.00 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 206.00
1llc 60 Tan Shirts, L $ 769 $ 461.40 | $ 930 $ 558.00 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 618.00
11d 80 Tan Shirts, XL $ 769 $ 615.20 [ $ 930 | $ 744.00 NO BID $ 1030 | $ 824.00
lle 80 Tan Shirts, 2XL $ 894 % 71520 [ $ 10.76 | $ 860.80 NO BID $ 1147 1 $ 917.60
11f 50 Tan Shirts, 3XL $ 894 | % 447.00 | $ 10.76 | $ 538.00 NO BID $ 11471 $ 573.50
11g 30 Tan Shirts, 4XL $ 894 $ 268.20 [ $ 10.76 | $ 322.80 NO BID $ 1560 | $ 468.00
11h 25 Tan Shirts, 5XL $ 894 $ 22350 [ $ 1076 | $ 269.00 NO BID $ 1560 | $ 390.00
11i 25 Tan Shirts, 6XL $ 894 $ 22350 [ $ 10.76 | $ 269.00 NO BID $ 18.60 | $ 465.00
Sub Total $ 3,261.60 $ 3,933.60 $ - $ 4,668.10
Sales Tax $ 228.31 $ 275.35 $ - $ 326.77
Lot (Item Eleven) Total $ 3,489.91 $ 4,208.95 $ - $ 4,994.87
12a 15 Tan Trousers, 28" $ 1169 | $ 175.35 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 1875 | $ 281.25
12b 30 Tan Trousers, 30" $ 1169 | $ 350.70 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 18.75 | $ 562.50
12c 100 Tan Trousers, 32" $ 1169 | $ 1,169.00 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 18.75| $ 1,875.00
12d 80 Tan Trousers, 34" $ 1169 | $ 935.20 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 1875 $ 1,500.00
12e 80 Tan Trousers, 36" $ 1169 | $ 935.20 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 18.75| $ 1,500.00
12f 80 Tan Trousers, 38" $ 1169 $ 935.20 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 1875]|$ 1,500.00
129 60 Tan Trousers, 40" $ 1169 | $ 701.40 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 18.75| $ 1,125.00
12h 40 Tan Trousers, 42" $ 1169 | $ 467.60 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 18.75 | $ 750.00
12i 15 Tan Trousers, 44" $ 1389 | $ 208.35 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 1875 | $ 281.25
12 20 Tan Trousers, 50" $ 1389] $ 277.80 NON-RESPONSIVE NO BID $ 2075] $ 415.00
Sub Total $ 6,155.80 $ - $ - $ 9,790.00
Sales Tax $ 430.91 $ - $ - $ 685.30
Lot (Item Twelve) Total $ 6,586.71 $ - $ - $ 10,475.30
GRAND TOTAL - Clothing
Lots (Items 1-4 & 7-12) $ 33,373.48 $27,750.36 $19,920.74 $ 46,207.52
GRAND TOTAL - Shoe Lots
(Items 5-6) $ 2,527.34 $ 2,568.00 $ - $ 2,404.29

Robinson Textiles: Item# 12a-12j has been deemed "Non-Responsive" due to product bid has been discontinued.
ACME: Item# 8a-8k has been deemed "Non-Responsive" due to product evaluation sample was not received by the deadline.
ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.: Iltem# 9a-9k has been deemed "Non-Responsive" due to product evaluation sample was not received by the deadline.

Bids Opened: March 4, 2014 @ 3:00 PM

Kay Keisler

Procurement Officer




