COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE
OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL
APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: C15009-10/17/14S
PROCUREMENT: Police Supplies — Term Contract
ISSUE DATE: September 24, 2014

CLOSING DATE: October 17, 2014

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

Lawmen’s Safety Supply
$33,411.50

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract
shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of

Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing
where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: October 27, 2014

THIS ISNOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



BID # : C15009-10/17/14S
Police Supplies

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Lawmen's Safety *CPR Savers & First
**Dana Safety Supply Supply, Inc. Designlab, Inc. Aid Supply
Unit Unit Unit Unit
Item | Oty | UM Description Total Total Cost Total Total Cost Total Total Cost Total Total Cost
1 12 EA |Keeper, Safariland plain black 62-2HS NoBid| $ 6.15[ $ 7380 $ 7.50] $ 90.00f $ 6.63] $ 79.56
Double Mag pouch 77-83-41 HS
Safariland plain black STX,
2 30 | EA |Concealed Snap No Bid| $ 24.25| $ 727.50| $ 24.15| $ 72450 $ 24.25| $ 727.50
Double Mag Pouch 79-83-2HS
3 30 | EA |Slimline Open Top plain black No Bid| $ 16.72| $ 501.60| $ 18.15| $ 544.50| $ 17.93| $ 537.90
Cuff case 190-41 Safariland plain
4 60 EA |black STX, Concealed snap NoBid| $ 19.94] $ 1,196.40| $ 2230 $ 1,338.00] $ 2229 $ 1,337.40
OC holder STX Plain black with
hidden snap for MK-3 OC STX,
5 40 | EA |Concealed snap NoBid| $ 16.29| $ 651.60] $ 26.000 $ 1,040.00| $ 18.07[ $ 722.80
Glove pouch 332V, Safariland plain
6 30 | EA |black, Velcro closure NoBid| $ 11.99| $ 359.70| $ 13.55| $ 406.50[ $ 13.11| $ 393.30
STX Plain black for Stinger DS LED
7 30 EA |plain black STX, Concealed snhap NoBid| $ 1564 $ 469.20| $ 15.25[ $ 45750 $ 17.93| $ 537.90
SLS duty 6280 holster Safariland plain
8 20 EA |black STX, Concealed snhap NoBid| $ 62.23] $ 1,24460| $ 76.30| $ 1,526.00 No Bid
ALS duty 7360 holster Safariland plain
9 10 EA |black STX, Concealed snap NoBid| $ 67.74] $ 677.40| $ 78.90| $ 789.00 No Bid
ALS duty 6365 holster Safariland plain
10 10 EA |black STX, Concealed snap NoBid| $ 8250 $ 825.00) $ 94.00[ $ 940.00 No Bid
ALS duty 6378 holster Safariland plain
11 10 EA |black STX, Concealed snap NoBid| $ 26.14 $ 261.40| $ 33.20| $ 332.00 No Bid
Gould & Goodrich Gold Line B803,
12 20 EA [three slot pancake holster, black $ 38.00] $ 760.00| $ 3641 $ 728.20| $ 49.15| $ 983.00) $ 4551 $ 910.20
Fobus CU9GBH Cuff mag combo belt
13 20 | EA |holder, Glock 9/40 $ 18.00] $ 360.00) $ 21.45| $ 429.00f $ 24.45| $ 489.00( $ 2164 $ 432.80
Leather Buckleless belt system (inner
14 30 | EA |beltand 2.25"duty belt) $ 78.000 $ 2,340.00] $ 75.54] $ 2,266.20| $ 74.00 $ 2,220.00 No Bid
Web Duty belt, #8100 Bianchi Patrol
15 40 | EA |Teknylon NoBid| $ 15.22| $ 608.80| $ 16.55| $ 662.00) $ 16.27| $ 650.80
Nylon Liner Inner Belt, #8105 Bianchi
16 40 | EA |Patrol Tek nylon NoBid| $ 1135/ $ 454.00 $ 1250 $ 500.00) $ 12.05| $ 482.00
Covered cuff case #8000 Bianchi
17 40 | EA |Patrol Tek nylon NoBid] $ 8.98| $ 359.20| $ 10.50 $ 420.00 $ 994 $ 397.60
OC spray pouch #8007 Bianchi Patrol
18 40 | EA |Teknylon NoBid] $ 8.98] $ 359.20| $ 10.50 $ 420.00 $ 994 $ 397.60
Radio holder #8014S Bianchi Patrol
19 40 | EA |Teknylon NoBid| $ 18.46| $ 738.40| $ 19.85| $ 794.00) $ 19.74| $ 789.60
Pager/glove pouch #8015 Bianchi
20 40 | EA |Patrol Tek nylon NoBid| $ 7.72| $ 308.80 $ 895 $ 358.000 $ 8.29] $ 331.60
Key holder #8016 Bianchi Patrol Tek
21 40 | EA [nylon NoBid| $ 6.87| $ 27480] $ 8.25| $ 330.000 $ 738 $ 295.20
Mini-Light holder #8010 Bianchi Patrol
22 40 | EA |Teknylon NoBid| $ 8.66] $ 34640 $ 9.80| $ 392.000 $ 919 $ 367.60
23 20 | EA |Customize-Kit Spacer Kit NoBid| $ 15.40[ $ 308.00 No Bid No Bid
ASP Baton - #ASP52611 26" Friction
24 50 | EA |Loc, Foam Handle, Black Chrome $ 72.000 $ 3,600.00| $ 6547| $ 3,27350| $ 7825 $ 391250( $ 7359 $ 3,679.50
ASP Baton - #ASP52632 Side Break
25 50 | EA |Scabbard, Black for 26" Baton $ 32000 $ 1,600.00] $ 2847| $ 1,42350| $ 3565 $ 1,78250( $ 3247 $ 1,623.50
VPR - RIPP Restraint Violent Prisoner
26 50 | EA |Restraint $ 3500/ $ 1,750.00f $ 32.21| $ 1,610.50 NoBid| $ 38.85[ $ 1,942.50
Transport Belt - RIPP Restraint
27 50 | EA |Transport Belt $ 30.000 $ 1,500.00f $ 27.18/ $ 1,359.00 NoBid| $ 37.30[ $ 1,865.00
28 50 | EA |Hobble - RIPP Restraint Hobble $ 18.00] $ 900.00| $ 13.25] $ 662.50 NoBid| $ 17.87[ $ 893.50
Stinger Flashlight - #75812 - Stinger
29 50 | EA |DS LED Flashlight $ 86.000 $ 4,300.000 $ 78.29] $ 3,91450| $ 99.10/ $ 4,955.00f $ 92.73| $ 4,636.50
Uniform Holster - Safariland Model
#7360 7TS ALS Level Il Retention
30 50 | EA |Mid-Rise Holster NoBid| $ 67.74[ $ 3,387.00f $ 76.90| $ 3,845.00 No Bid
Investigator Holster - Safariland Model
#7377 7TTS ALS Concealment Belt
31 50 EA |Slide Holster NoBid| $ 2852 $ 1,426.000 $ 67.90| $ 3,395.00 No Bid
Subtotal $ 17,110.00 $ 31,225.70 $ 33,646.00 $ 24,031.86
Tax $ 1,197.70 $ 2,185.80 $ 2,355.22 P 1,682.23
Total $ 18,307.70 $ 33,411.50 $ 36,001.22 $ 25,714.09

**Two (2) vendors did not bid on all items. It was determined it was not cost effective to split the award. Award was made to the lowest responsive vendor that
bid on al the line items
Bids Received: October 17, 2014 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer




