
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON 

Procurement Services 

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503 

Lexington, South Carolina  29072-3493 

 

Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

 

 

STATEMENT OF AWARD 

 

 

SOLICITATION NUMBER:  Q13002-08/24/12S 

 

PROJECT TITLE: Maintenance on Boat Motors 

 

AWARDED TO: Multiple Vendors (See Below) 

 

AMOUNT OF AWARD:  Multiple Vendors (See Below) 

  

DATE OF AWARD:   October 18, 2012 

 

Evinrude Lot:   Hydro Tech Marine, Inc.  $1,656.30 

 

Mercury Lot:   Mountain Top RV and Marine $1,734.11 

 

 

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County. 

 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  November 1, 2012 

 

 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 
DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 



BID # : Q13005-10/04/12S

Item Qty U/M Description Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost Unit Total Total Cost

1 2 EA

2012 Evinrude E-Tec  225 HP engine 300 

Hour Service, Quote cost per engine ( 

Total of 2 engines) 485.39$        970.78$        NO BID NO BID

2 1 EA

2012 Evinrude 200 E-Tec engine 300 

Hour Service – (1 Engine) 485.39$        485.39$        NO BID NO BID

3 3 EA

E-Tec Engine lower gearcase service 

cost per Engine (Total of 3 Engines) 66.71$          200.13$        NO BID NO BID

4 1 EA

Parts discount for OEM List Pricing List 

percentage from OEM List 0.00% 0.00% NO BID NO BID

5 1 HR

Labor Cost per billable hour for  routine 

repairs as needed 95.00$          95.00$          NO BID NO BID

Total 1,656.30$     NO BID NO BID

1 2 EA

2003 Mercury 225 HP Optimax (Not 

under warranty) 100 Hours Service. Cost 

per Engine (Total of 2 engines) NO BID 300.28$        600.56$        766.19$        1,552.38$     

2 2 EA

2011 Mercury 175 HP Verado (Under 

Warranty) 100 Hours Service. Cost per 

Engine  (Total of 2 engines) NO BID 281.98$        563.96$        444.81$        889.62$        

3 1 EA

1998 Mercury 25 HP Outboard Annual 

Service to include Lower gearcase 

service NO BID 130.52$        130.52$        164.54$        164.54$        

4 1 EA

2004 Mercury 90 HP Outboard Annual 

Service to include lower gearcase 

service. NO BID 147.07$        147.07$        401.00$        401.00$        

5 4 EA

Gearcase Lubrication Service – Cost per 

Engine Verado or Optimax Outboards. 

(Total of 4 Engines) NO BID 73.00$          292.00$        127.96$        511.84$        

6 1 EA Parts Discount pricing from OEM List NO BID 10.00% 10% 0.00% 0.00%

7 1 HR

Labor Cost per billable hour for  routine 

repairs as needed NO BID 90.00$          90.00$          95.00$          95.00$          

Total NO BID 1,734.11$     3,519.38$     

**Boat Doctor Concurred with correct price.

Bids Received: October 4, 2012 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer

 The Boat Doctor 

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

Evinrude

Mercury

 Hydro Tech Marine, Inc. 

Maintenance on Boat Motors

 Mountain Top RV & Marine 


